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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

12/8/2009

Applegate, Alexis

5.8

1,131.00

Conferences with team members regarding settlement and review settlement
press conference (2.3); review media coverage per Mr. Levitas' request (2.8);
contact team regarding filing of petition for certiorari and appendix and review of
rules regarding same (.7).

12/8/2009

Burns, Joseph V.

2.2

473.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review memos from Mr. Smith and Mr. Dorris regarding
settlement of matter (.3); review <cobellsettlement.com> website, press releases
and news articles, in preparation for calls to beneficiary line (1.5); conference
with Mr. Smith regarding same (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding status
of case (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

12/8/2009

Dietz, Richard D.

6.2

1,829.00

Draft petition for certiorari (3); research regarding prior Cobell cases (3.2).

12/8/2009

Dorris, William E.

5.9

3,687.50

Revisions to Ms. Cobell's statement (.4); attending press conference at Interior
(1.5); working on press and media coverage and publicity for outreach (2.1);
outlining work to be done through preliminary approval (1.2); emails and work
regarding Congressional support and communications (.7).

12/8/2009

Gingold, Dennis

2.1

1,942.50

Meet with Rempel, Ms. Cobell; prep Ms. Cobell for press conference.

12/8/2009

Gingold, Dennis

6.0

5,550.00

Attend press conference; meet with press re settlement announcement; terms;
outreach to class

12/8/2009

Gingold, Dennis

3.5

3,237.50

Meet with Ms. Cobell, Rempel, et al. re S. Ct. issues; press inquiries; Hill; TB
issues.

12/8/2009

Guilder, Justin M.

8.7

2,566.50

Attend press conferences (1.5); discuss post-settlement priority list and interface
with notice contractors and public relations personnel (7.2).

12/8/2009

Harper, Keith

6.8

3,060.00

Appear at settlement announcement including discussion on getting
implementing legislation and begin implementation of settlement and
discussions with Elouise Cobell (3.4); media interviews for "earned media" notice
purposes (1.3); meet with co-counsel and clients on next steps regarding
obtaining implementing legislation and preparing for preliminary approval (1.2);
press conference at KS for notice purposes (.9).

12/8/2009

Levitas, Elliott H.

2.0

1,450.00

Review press conference materials and press coverage responding to post-
settlement inquiries regarding settlement arrangements.

12/8/2009

Rempel, Geoffrey

15

675.00

Draft to-do list for program implementation, cross reference to settlement
agreement.

12/8/2009

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.8

810.00

Meet w/ Notice Contractor and staff re program.

12/8/2009

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.8

1,260.00

Meet w/ EC, DG re notice program and tasks.

12/8/2009

Rempel, Geoffrey

3.4

A |B|B| &+

1,530.00

Follow up re drafting settlement website docs and cc w/ contractors re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
12/8/2009 [Rempel, Geoffrey 5.8 $ 2,610.00 |Outreach to class and implement notice program.
. Review media coverage per Mr. Levitas' request (1.3); review original complaint

12/9/2009 | Applegate, Alexis 1.6 $ 312.00 and prayers for relief gerer. Guilder's requ(izst. (.1(3). : ) i
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.1);

12/9/2009 |Burns, Joseph V. 04 $ 86.00 review_phone messages from s_everal cgllers (.1); draft mfamo to Mr. Smith
regarding proposed settlement information for callers (.1); update phone log
regarding calls (.1).

12/9/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 4.5 $ 1,327.50|Draft and revise petition for certiorari (4.3); review Supreme Court rules (.2).

12/9/2009 | Dorris, William E. 18 $ 1,125.00 Two inter\./iews.with repqrters (:8); revieyv.press coverage (.5); review Secretarial
order (.2); emails regarding claims administrator and notice contractor (.3).

12/9/2009 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Meet with NPR, et al re settlement.

12/9/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Levitas re above.

12/9/2009 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Telcoms press re above.

12/9/2009 |[Gingold, Dennis 3.6 $ 3,330.00 |Telcoms. TB's re above.

12/9/2009 |[Gingold, Dennis 3.1 $ 2,867.50 |Review issues/options going forward.
Review material and draft documents in aid of implementation of settlement

12/9/2009 |Harper, Keith 37 $ 1,665.00 (1.7).; calls on Iegislatioq and.Osage issue on settlement yvith co-coun.sel (2.1);
email exchanges on various issues related to settlement implementation and
notice (.9).
Review and analyze settlement documents and related materials for settlement
and settlement announcement in order to be able to respond to issues raised

12/9/2009 |Levitas, Elliott H. 2.6 $ 1,885.00|concerning same (1.5); telephone conference with Mr. Page, Mr. Gingold, AND
Mr. Rempel regarding settlement documents and issues and inquiries
concerning same (1.1).

12/9/2009 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ DOJ re electronic info and provision.

12/9/2009 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ GCG re electronic info and provision of such (multiple)

12/9/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 13 $ 585.00 Draft to-do list for program implementation, cross reference to settlement
agreement.

12/9/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.4 $ 630.00 [Meet w/ DG re planning and notice and tasks.

12/9/2009 [Rempel, Geoffrey 1.7 $ 765.00 [Begin prep for fee application.

12/9/2009 [Rempel, Geoffrey 4.6 $ 2,070.00 |Outreach to class and implement notice program.

12/10/2009 |Applegate, Alexis 1.1 $ 214.50|Review media coverage per Mr. Levitas' request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review 20 accumulated phone messages from post-

12/10/2009 |Burmns, Joseph V. 20 $ 43000 settlement beneficiary callers (.7); draft memos to Mr. Smith regarding two
messages and proposed responses (.2); create and update new post-settlement
phone log regarding calls (1.1).

12/10/2009 [Charnes, Adam H. 2.0 $ 990.00|Revise and edit petition for certiorari.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

12/10/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 48 $ 1,416.00 Ezleg/;se petition for certiorari (3); research regarding common law trust principles

12/10/2009 |Dorris, William E. 0.7 $ 437.50|Read press and media coverage (.2); interview with reporter (.5).

12/10/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. TB's re distribution formulas.

12/10/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Harper re Congressional hearing issues.

12/10/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

12/10/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |[Telcoms press re above.

12/10/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 10.9 $ 10,082.50 |Work on issues/options going forward, e.g., Cong/Jud hearings.

12/10/2009 |Guilder, Justin M. 03 $ 88.50 Draft and revise correspondence regarding next week's SIA committee hearing
on settlement.

12/10/2009 |Guilder, Justin M. 4.0 $ 1,180.00|Draft and revise comprehensive list of tribes with allotted lands for notice.
Media interviews for notice purposes (.7); discussions with co-counsel on

12/10/2009 |Harper, Keith a4 $ 1,980.00 obtaining Ieglslatlon approving of settlement (1.5); dlscussmne with _co-coun.sel
and Mr. Loving regarding next steps to implement settlement including obtaining
legislation (1.4); discussions with DOI and DOJ on settlement legislation (.8).

12/10/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |CC w/ experts, EC, KH re outreach to Indian country

12/10/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ notice contractor (multiple) re notice program and acquisition of data.

12/10/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/DOJ and contractors.

12/10/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 |CC w/ experts re invoices for fee app. (multiple).

12/10/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Meet w/ DG re planning and notice and tasks.

12/10/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 [Disc w/ DG, KH re leg hearing.

12/10/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Outreach to class and implement notice program.

12/10/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.5 $ 2,025.00 |Begin prep for fee application.
Conference call with Ms. Kinsella, Ms. Keough and Mr. Quinn regarding DOI
records (.6); research issue of relocation centers and e-mail to Ms. Kinsella (1);
telephone conversation with Mr. Levitas regarding items to complete (.2); e-mail

12/10/2009 |Smith, David C. 29 $ 1,377.50 to Mr. Guilder regarding survey of allotted tribes for Ms. Kinsella (.1); e-mails

with Mr. Burns and Ms. Applegate regarding addresses for beneficiaries who
have contacted us (.2); multiple e-mails with Mr. Quinn, Ms. Kinsella, Ms.
Keough and Mr. Rempel regarding notice issues (.7); e-mail regarding research
needs (.1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Research appropriations bill status per Mr. Levitas' request (.6); conference with
Mr. Levitas regarding same (.2); research regarding beneficiary contact
. information per Mr. Smith's request (.5); review Joint Motion for Order to allow

12/11/2009 |Applegate, Alexis 21 $ 526.50 the parties to exchange information protected by the Privacy Act per Mr. Levitas'
request (.3); begin cite check of petition for certiorari per Mr. Charnes' request
(1.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: conference with Mr. Smith and Ms. Applegate regarding
beneficiary telephone log (.3); forward call logs to Mr. Smith (.1); review phone

12/11/2009 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.7 $ 365.50|message from beneficiary (.1); review 16 additional phone messages from
beneficiary callers (.8); prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding message from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.3).

12/11/2009 |Charnes, Adam H. 3.0 $ 1,485.00 Rewse_ and edit petition for certiorari (2.5); telephone conference with co-counsel
regarding strategy (.5).

12/11/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 10 $ 295.00 Revise petition for clertlo.rarl (5) research regarding Takings Clause exceptions
for purposes of certiorari petition (.5).
Conference call with team regarding legislation notice and publicity and work to

12/11/2009 |Dorris, William E. 1.8 $ 1,125.00|be done (.7); reading press and media coverage (.3); review certiorari petition
(.3); emails regarding bank to serve as qualifying bank (.5).

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, et al re above; all issues.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.1 $ 1,017.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re same.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 15 $ 1,387.50 Telcoms. Harper re joint motion for protective order; cert petition; Congressional
issues; Osage.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. Smith re joint motion.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 4.3 $ 3,977.50 |Review/markup Garden City contract.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Review/markup draft cert petition; joint motion for protective order.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re Hill issues.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Review Senate settlement issues.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. TB re same.

12/11/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. Press re above.

12/11/2009 |Guilder, Justin M. 3.5 $ 1,032.50|Draft and revise comprehensive list of tribes with allotted lands for notice.
Discussions with co-counsel on legislation and related issues and review

12/11/2009 |Harper, Keith 6.2 $ 2.790.00 information (2.8); calls from congressional offices and DOI (1.6); discussions

with co-counsel regarding Osage (0.4); discussion with Mr. Gingold regarding
hearing proposed and motions (1.4).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Various telephone conferences with Mr. Gingold concerning legislation and
procedures for attaching to pending appropriations bill (.5); participate in
conference call with Mr. Dorris, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Charnes, Mr. Harper, Mr. Smith
and Mr. Guilder concerning Cobell settlement arrangements regarding proposed
Congressional hearing on Cobell settlement and structure of hearing and
substance of presentation, legislation and procedures for attaching bill to
defense appropriation (0.6); telephone conference with Mr. Smith concerning
12/11/2009 |Levitas, Elliott H. 3.6 $ 2,610.00(legislation and procedure for attaching to appropriations bill (.1); task
assignment to Ms. Applegate regarding appropriations bill status and availability
of bill for attachment of Cobell legislation (.5); telephone conference with Ms.
Applegate regarding report on status of appropriations bill and availability for
amendment (.5); review and distribute media report on Cobell settlement (.3);
telephone conference with Ms. Wollner, Bloomberg Press (.7); telephone
conference with Mr. Smith regarding beneficiary call/complaint on settlement and
discussion of handling same (.4).

12/11/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |CC w/ team re upcoming hearing.

12/12/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 9.6 $ 8,880.00 |Review and revise cert petition; cases and authorities re same.
12/12/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Harper re class responses; fairness hearing.
12/12/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Telcoms. TB's re settlement; class issues; outreach needs.

Interview with Washington Journal for notice purposes (1.3); discuss strategy
12/12/2009 |Harper, Keith 25 $ 1,125.00 |with Administration on settlement legislation (.6); email exchange regarding
hearing and additional notice through media opportunities (.6).

Review and analyze draft of petition for certiorari (.8); email comments and

12/12/2009 |Levitas, Elliott H. 13 $ 942.50 review responses with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Holt (.5).

Telephone conferences with prior mediator in case regarding his testimony

12/12/2009 |Zacks, David M. 2.0 $ -|before Congress and telephone conferences with Mr. Dorris regarding approval
of him testifying; continued discussions with prior mediator.
12/13/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.7 $ 1,572.50 |Review/revise motion re confidential information.
12/13/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above; proposal from potential depository bank.
12/13/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 2.1 $ 1,942.50 |Review/markup proposal for such bank.
Compile beneficiary communications per Mr. Smith's request; (1) conference
12/14/2009 |Applegate, Alexis 27 $ 526.50 with Mr. Smith and Ms. Murray regarding same (.2); review status of

appropriations per Mr. Levitas' request (.6); review copy of petition for certiorari
per Mr. Smith's request (.9).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review status of post-settlement phone calls and
prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding same (.2); review phone messages from
12/14/2009 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.5 $ 322.50(15 callers (.7); update phone log regarding calls (.4); review email from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding
same (.2).
12/14/2009 |Charnes, Adam H. 2.0 $ 990.00|Revise and edit petition for certiorari.
12/14/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 1.0 $ 295.00|Review case law regarding recovery of attorneys' fees.
12/14/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 38 1,121.00 Revise petition for certiorari (3); review previous briefing regarding government's
breaches (.8).
Review insurance and indemnity provisions in Garden City Contract (.4); review
. - press coverages of settlement (.3); preparing list of work to be done for class
12/14/2009 |Dorris, William E. 13 $ 812.50 communications and conference call with David Smith and Geoffrey Rempel
regarding notice plans (.6).
12/14/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 |Discussion Rempel re cert petition; senate hearing; Osage settlement issues
12/14/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Harper re tax, appropriations and other legislative issues; TB issues.
12/14/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 |Telcoms. Smith re cert petition.
12/14/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 2.1 $ 1,942.50 |Revise draft IV, cert petition.
12/14/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Infield re settlement.
12/14/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 4.4 $ 4,070.00 [Review confidentiality issues.
12/14/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Dorris re above.
Discuss tax aspects of Cobell settlement with Mr. Gropper, legislative counsel
for Joint Committee on Taxation (1.2); draft and revise correspondence to team
members detailing conversation with legislative counsel (.8); draft and revise
12/14/2009 |Guilder, Justin M. 3.5 $ 1,032.50|correspondence responding to follow-up questions from Mr. Gropper (.3);
discuss with Mr. Dorris conversation with Mr. Gropper (.1); draft and revise notes
from conversations with trust beneficiary (.8); discuss with Mr. Harper our
potential response to beneficiary (.3).
. Draft testimony for Ms. Cobell (3.5); discussions on notice (.8); notice through
12/14/2009 Harper, Keith 51 $ 2,295.00 media (.5); discussion with Mr. Harmala (0.3).
Review email reports on legislative issues, tax questions from Joint Committee
12/14/2009 |Levitas, Elliott H. 18 $ 1,305.00 and conference with Mr. Dorris regarding legislation status (.2); email exchange

with Mr. Harper regarding and reviewing Ms. Cobell's testimony (1.4); telephone
conference with Mr. Page regarding further outreach on Cobell settlement (.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

12/14/2009 |Loving, John-Claude F. 3.0 $ 1,125.00 lCommgnication W?t.h Congressional and pol?tic.al staff on Cobell settlement (1.2);
egislative and political research on appropriations funding for settlement (1.8).

12/14/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |Follow up re JPM accounts and set up meeting.

12/14/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Correspond w/ GCG re planning and data transfer.

12/14/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 |Disc w/ DG re upcoming hearing.

12/14/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.0 $ 450.00 |Review and edit plan to do outreach to class (posting plan).

12/14/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 | Draft, edit cert petition.
Work on certiorari petition (5.3); review email from joint committee on taxation
regarding legislation (.1); review and discussions with Mr. Rempel and Mr. Dorris
regarding Ms. Kinsella's notice plan (.4); discussions with Mr. Rempel regarding
Garden City contract (.3); discussions with Mr. Burns and Ms. Applegate

12/14/2009 |Smith, David C. 7.4 $ 3,515.00(regarding compilation of names and addresses of beneficiaries who contacted
us and email to Ms. Kinsella and Ms. Keough regarding same (.4); emails with
Mr. Burns regarding beneficiaries who contacted us (.3); telephone conversation
with Mr. Quinn regarding privacy order and discussions with co-counsel
regarding same (.3); discussions with Mr. Levitas regarding status (.3).

12/15/2009 |Applegate, Alexis 26 $ 507.00 Preparg alppendix for petition for certiorari and review team edits to petition per
Mr. Smith's request.

12/15/2009 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.2 43.00 Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone messages from three callers (.1); update
phone log regarding calls (.1).

12/15/2009 |Charnes, Adam H. 1.0 $ 495.00|Revise and edit petition for certiorari.

12/15/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 2.5 $ 737.50|Revise petition for certiorari (2.3); discuss same with Mr. Charnes (.2).
Review press coverage of Congressional activity on relevant legislation (.6);

12/15/2009 |Dorris, William E. 2.2 $ 1,375.00(review relevant bills in House (.5); review petition for writ of certiorari (.4); review
guestions from beneficiaries and emails regarding them (.7).

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Charnes re cert petition question presented.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 4.1 $ 3,792.50 |Review/revise drafts IV & VI, cert petition.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. Dorris re above.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above; TB issues; hearing; Ft. Berthold issues.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Levitas re Hill, cert petition.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Ft Berthold TB re settlement issues.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. TB re settlement issues.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Applegate re mandate in Cobell XXII.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Harper re Senate hearing.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Review/markup defs' testimony on Hill.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Smith re cert petition.




j éﬁ%\éﬂ%%gls\%gaﬁyl_l .Jevl;/)e(ﬁ,Célg(‘:lr%patr);3 gf?thgé %ntelr:iélr? gt 9\9/1(9';/1%9 Nop?gbecgloqugg’ PFFH)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Review/revise Ms. Cobell's Senate testimony.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 15 $ 1,387.50 |Meet with press re settlement issues.

12/15/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 185.00 |Review motion to distribute protected information to contractors re settlement.
Discuss with Mr. Gingold whether a bank has been selected to hold the funds
(.2); draft and revise correspondence to team members and Goldman Sachs
representatives to discuss same (.3); draft and revise and review
correspondence regarding Fort Berthold allottee association and potential

12/15/2009 |Guilder, Justin M. 38 $ 1,121.00 obpcﬂon (.3); draft aqd revise correspondence to benef|C|a.ry to respond '.[o her
various emails regarding her status as a class member (.7); draft and revise
correspondence to Mr. Gropper of the Joint Committee on Taxation regarding
tax aspects of settlement (.4); review draft testimony of Ms. Cobell for Senate
hearing (.2); draft and revise testimony (.9); draft and revise question presented
in correspondence to Mr. Gingold (.2); discuss legislative issues with team (.7).

12/15/2009 |Harper, Keith 31 $ 1,395.00 Contmqed work on drafting and revising testlmoqy for Senate. hearing (2.5);
meet with co-counsel on settlement implementation and hearing (.6).
Working on Senate draft testimony: review draft testimony for Ms. Cobell, revise
and edit same, telephone conference with Mr. Harper and Mr. Gingold regarding

12/15/2009 (Levitas, Elliott H. 3.0 $ 2,175.00(testimony, review further revisions and revise versions of testimony, and submit
comments and edits (2.5); telephone conference with Mr. Guilder and Mr. Zacks
regarding prior mediator and Senate committee contact regarding testimony (.5).
Communication with Congressional and political staff on Cobell settlement (.5);

12/15/2009 |Loving, John-Claude F. 4.0 $ 1,500.00|legislative and political research on appropriations funding for settlement (1.5);
set up meetings for client visit to Washington, DC (2).

12/15/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [Draft, edit cert petition.

12/15/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Disc w/ DG re upcoming hearing (multiple).

12/15/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 $ 810.00 [Prep fee application.

12/15/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 19 $ 855.00 Follow up on misc. me_etlng items re notice plan (update website, gather docs,
research privacy data inquiry, draft docs for outreach).

12/15/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 [Review and edit hearing testimony.

12/15/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.1 $ 945.00 [Meet w/ GCG and DS (partial) re notice and claims program.

12/15/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 $ 1,080.00 |Meet w/ DOJ, GCG and others re transfer of data and protocol.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

12/15/2009

Smith, David C.

8.3

3,942.50

Review latest draft of certiorari petition (2.1); discussions with Mr. Gingold
regarding certiorari petition (.3); telephone conversation with Mr. Levitas
regarding status of legislative efforts (.2); review draft testimony of defendants
(.3); review/revise testimony of Ms. Cobell (.4); telephone conversation with Mr.
Quinn and with court regarding privacy order (.1); conference with Ms. Keough,
Claims Administrator (1); telephone conversation with court regarding signing of
Privacy Act order (.1); conference with Garden City and Justice regarding
beneficiary information and transfer of data from Ms. Herman (2.4); revise
Garden City Contract (.2); discussions regarding Garden City Contract (.1);
conversations regarding e-mail received from BIA on inputting data where no
land records are on TAAMS (.4); e-mail from Ms. Moss, public relations, on
Native American report (.1); discussions with Ms. Keough and Ms. Kinsella
regarding meeting (.1); review legislative developments from Mr. Loving (.1); e-
mails regarding telephone log for Ms. Kinsella (.1); e-mail from Ms. Herman
regarding database and discussions (.1); discussions regarding call from Fort
Berthold (.2).

12/15/2009

Zacks, David M.

1.0

Conference with Mr. Gingold (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Levitas
regarding prior mediator's interaction with case (.2); conference with Mr. Harper
regarding settlement (.4).

12/16/2009

Applegate, Alexis

4.8

936.00

Edit and cite check petition for certiorari per Mr. Smith's request.

12/16/2009

Dietz, Richard D.

4.8

1,416.00

Review final proof of appendix to petition for certiorari (2); revise petition for
certiorari question presented (.8); review citations and proof final draft of petition
for certiorari (2).

12/16/2009

Dorris, William E.

3.6

*

2,250.00

Review draft House bills (.8); emails and telephone conferences regarding
efforts to enact legislation (2.1); revise draft of Ms. Cobell's proposed statement
to the Senate Indian Affairs Committee (.7).

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.8

740.00

Review proposed settlement amendment to defense appropriations bill.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.7

647.50

Review amendments to same.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.6

555.00

Conference call litigation team re all issues, e.g., extension of settlement
agreement.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.4

370.00

Review proof of cert petition.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Conference call Rempel, potential depository bank re settlement funds.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Revise draft I, authorization letter re Garden City.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.7

647.50

Conference calls Ms. Cobell, Rempel, Harper, re Senate testimony, litigation and
settlement issues.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.9

832.50

Telcoms. TB's re settlement issues.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

2.1

1,942.50

Prepare written responses to TB's re same.

12/16/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.6

AR |R| B BB B B BB

555.00

Conference call Rempel, Harper, Levitas re Hill issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

12/16/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re Cong testimony.

12/16/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Dorris re above.

12/16/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re Hill; settlement issues.

12/16/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom press re settlement.
Draft and revise correspondence to Mr. Gingold regarding legislation (.2);

12/16/2009 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.9 265.50(telephonic conference to discuss legislative opportunities after learning that
defense appropriations will not serve as legislative vehicle (.7).
Prepare for SIA committee hearing (2.7); finalize testimony for Ms. Cobell (1.7);

12/16/2009 [Harper, Keith 6.6 2,970.00 |discussions about failure to get legislation enacted (.8); review government's
testimony (.5); interview with Public Broadcasting (.9).
Review reports regarding status of legislation (.6); Mr. Loving emails (.3); various

12/16/2009 |Levitas, Elliott H. 17 1,232.50 telephone _calls with Mr. G!ngold, Mr. Harper z?md Mr. Dorr!s regarding
consideration of future activity and efforts for implementation of settlement
agreement (0.8).
Communication with Congressional and political staff on Cobell settlement (.3);

12/16/2009 |Loving, John-Claude F. 4.0 1,500.00|legislative and political research on appropriations funding for settlement (1.7);
set up meetings for client visit to Washington, DC (2).
Conference with Mr. Loving regarding legislation pending (1.5); examine

. legislation at Mr. Loving's request to determine if the Cobell settlement was

12/16/2009 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 4.0 1,180.00 ) . . . . .
funded (2); draft letters to Congressional representatives to obtain meetings with
them or their staff (.2); schedule meetings with Hill staff (.3).

12/16/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |Disc w/ DG re upcoming hearing (multiple).

12/16/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |CC w/ experts re legislative aspects and deadlock (2 calls).

12/16/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 [CC w/ potential bank (multiple calls).

12/16/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 [Prep fee application.

12/16/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 |CC (multiple) re due diligence on bank and follow up.

12/16/2009 [Rempel, Geoffrey 24 $ 1,080.00 |Disc w/ DG re legislative aspects of settlement, include CC w/ EL, KH re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Email to Mr. Dorris regarding testimony of Ms. Cobell (.2); email to Mr. Charnes
regarding revised certiorari petition (.1); review/revise certiorari petition (3.6);
review/revise authorization letter for Ms. Kinsella (.4); emails and calls with Ms.
Murray regarding compilation of beneficiary names and addresses from

12/16/2009 |Smith. David C. 792 3.420.00 beneficiary call-in nu.mberl (.3); ema|I§ regardlng Congre;smnal !ssues (.3); .
telephone conversation with Mr. Dorris regarding legislation (.1); conference with
Mr. Loving regarding legislative issues (.2); conference call with co-counsel
regarding legislative issues (.8); review/revise Senate testimony for Ms. Cobell
(.7); review final draft of testimony for Mr. Harper (.3); email to Ms. Kinsella
regarding notice issues arising out of MMS distributions (.2).
Finalize petition for certiorari per Mr. Smith's request (2); watch hearing before

12/17/2009 |Applegate, Alexis 4.2 819.00|Senate Indian Affairs Committee and conference with team members regarding
same (1); research regarding amendments process (1.2).

12/17/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 2.5 $ 737.50|Research regarding recovery of attorneys' fees.

12/17/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 3.0 $ 885.00|Review and revise final proof of petition for certiorari.
Working on Ms. Cobell's statement to the Senate Indian Affairs Committee (.7);
meeting with Ms. Cobell and members of the legal team regarding upcoming

. - meeting with Senator's staff and her appearance before the Senate Indian

12/17/2009 |Dorris, William E. 58 3,625.00 Affairs Committee (1.1); working on draft answers to potential questions by the
SIA Committee (1); team meeting with Ms. Cobell to finalize preparations for
SIAC hearing (1.0); attending SIAC hearing (2).

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 10 $ 925.00 fCl:Jonr(;lfserence call potential depository bank, Rempel re distribution of settlement

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Harper re settlement issues; Senate hearing.

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 11 $ 1,017.50 Meet vylth M_s. Cobell, Dorris, Smith, Levitas, Rempel, Guilder, Pearl re Ms.
Cobell's testimony.

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Discussion/Review GCG contract issue.

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 2.0 $ 1,850.00 |Attend Senate Hearing on Cobell settlement.

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 3.7 $ 3,422.50 |Meet with Ms. Cobell re same; options.

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Prepare written responses to TB's re settlement.

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms press re same.

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Applegate re cert petition.

12/17/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Review/revise talking points.

11
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

12/17/2009

Guilder, Justin M.

6.4

1,888.00

Prepare for Senate Indian Affairs Committee hearing and meeting with Senator's
staff (3.4); attend Senate Indian Affairs hearing (1.8); discuss taxation issues
with legislative counsel for joint committee on taxation (1.2).

12/17/2009

Harper, Keith

5.3

2,385.00

Testify at SCIA (2.4); prepare for same (1.4); meet with Senator (.2); meet with
co-counsel (1.1); call with Judge Robertson (.2).

12/17/2009

Levitas, Elliott H.

7.4

5,365.00

Work on legislative strategy: check on House of Representatives adjournment
resolution, note on amendment to DOD appropriations bill regarding strategy for
Senate amendment, conference with Mr. Gingold regarding possible amendment
to DOD conference report and procedures for attaching Cobell legislation,
conference with Mr. Dorris regarding same, and conference with Ms. Cobell, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Smith, Mr. Harper and Mr. Guilder regarding procedures for
amending Senate conference report to attach Cobell legislation (1.8);
conference with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Smith, Mr. Harper and Mr. Guilder
regarding preparation for Cobell testimony before Senate committee (1);
conference with Senator's staff regarding Cobell legislation and possible
attachment to DOD conference report and consideration of legislative vehicle for
later this year or next year with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper and Senate
staff (.7); conference with Senate committee staffer, Ms. Cobell, Mr. Loving and
Mr. Harper regarding Senate committee hearing preparation and review of
potential questions for discussion (.8); additional conference with Senate
staffers, Ms. Cobell, Mr. Loving, and Mr. Harper regarding preparation for
Senate committee hearing and subjects to be covered (.4); additional
conference with same regarding Cobell legislation and attachment to DOD
appropriations or other vehicle (.4); conference with Mr. Dorris, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Smith and Mr. Guilder regarding preparation for Senate committee
hearing (.5); attend Senate Indian Affairs Committee hearing (1.8).

12/17/2009

Loving, John-Claude F.

6.0

2,250.00

Meetings on Capitol Hill with client and Senate Indian Affairs Committee hearing
with client (6.0).

12/17/2009

Pearl, Michael Alexander

2.6

767.00

Attend meetings with Ms. Cobell on the Hill (.8); meet with Senate Committee on
Indian Affairs (.7); conference with Cobell team attorneys on strategy for getting
the Cobell settlement funded by Congress (1.1).

12/17/2009

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.4

180.00

Draft, edit testimony.

12/17/2009

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

Follow up re bank diligence.

12/17/2009

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.9

405.00

Prep fee application.

12/17/2009

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.3

AR | B |H

585.00

Draft, edit contract. Follow up w/ team re terms.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

12/17/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 19 $ 855.00 _CC w/ contra_ctors re notice plan and distribution, incl revised leg schedule and
impact. (multiple).

12/17/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 [Attend SIA committee hearing.

12/17/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.1 $ 945.00 [Meet w/ EC, BD, DG re hearing and strategy.

12/17/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 23 $ 1,035.00 F_ollow up re hearing (incl pre hearing prep). Incl meeting w/ team and testimony
discussion.
Review/revise certiorari petition (4.7); review/revise final draft of petition (1.3);
email to Mr. Dietz regarding petition (.1); conference with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Dorris,
Mr. Harper, Mr. Gingold and Mr. Rempel regarding Senate hearing (.8); prepare

12/17/2009 |Smith, David C. 11.3 5,367.50{summary of testimony regarding Senate inquiries on fees (1); review/revise
summary of Mr. Harper on Congressional testimony (.2); conference with client
(1); attend Senate hearing (2.0); receipt/review of revised Garden City contract
from Ms. Alianz (.2).

12/18/2009 |Applegate, Alexis 1.3 $ 253.50|Finalize petition for certiorari per Mr. Smith's request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review email correspondence from beneficiary (.1);

12/18/2009 |Burns, Joseph V. 02 $ 43.00 telephone call with Mr. Smith regarding same (.1).

12/18/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 15 $ 442.50|Review final proof of petition for certiorari; discuss filing preparation.

12/18/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Review continuing Garden City issues.

12/18/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. CRA counsel re settlement agreement.

12/18/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Charnes re cert petition.

12/18/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Levitas re leg issues; cert petition; press.

12/18/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Review/revise galley proof re cert petition.

12/18/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Telcoms. TB's re opt out issues; settlement.

12/18/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Respond in writing to TB re settlement issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

12/18/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 40 3.700.00 names, fgcts re pnv.llege/conﬂdenuallty .|ssues. [Not.e: see reductlpn at enq of
time entries of this time/charges.] [Note: see reduction at end of time entries of
this time/charges.]

12/18/2009 |Greene, Dustin T. 0.8 180.00|Proof-read petition for writ of certiorari.

12/18/2009 |Harper, Keith 31 1,395.00 CaI.I with Mr. Hau_c.k (DOJ) (.4); ca}ll from SCIA (.6); call with White House (.3);
review/revise petition for certiorari (1.8).

12/18/2009 |Loving, John-Claude F. 50 1.875.00 Commgnlcatlon w!th Congressional and pol!t|gal staff on Cobell settlement (3.8);
legislative and political research on appropriations funding for settlement (1.2).

12/18/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 180.00 |CC w/ GCG re contract and negotiate terms.

12/18/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 405.00 |CC w/ team re contract terms.

12/18/2009 |Roehrenbeck, Bradley A. 14 385.00({Review and revise petition for certiorari.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Interview with Native American reporter as part of notice efforts (.5); email with
Ms. Moss (.1); discussions with Ms. Alianz at Garden City regarding contract
(.3); emails with co-counsel regarding Garden City contract (.2); additional

12/18/2009 |Smith, David C. 1.8 855.00|discussions with Ms. Alianz at Garden City regarding contract (.2); review email
from Mr. Hauck at Justice regarding certiorari petition (.1); discussions regarding
certiorari petition (.3); review email from Mr. Gingold regarding identification of
beneficiaries for notice purposes and forward to Ms. Murray (.1).

12/19/2009 |Loving, John-Claude F. 20 750.00 Commgnlcatlon W!th Congressional and pol!thal staff on Cobell settlement (1);
legislative and political research on appropriations funding for settlement (1).

12/21/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re settlement/Cong issues.

12/21/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 05 $ 462 50 Telcom._ _Levnas re same; extension of settlement agreement; options re same;
cert petition.

12/21/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Harper re same.

12/21/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. TB re settlement issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

12/21/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 101 9.342.50 names, fgcts re pnv.llege/confldentlallty .|ssues. [Not.e: see reductpn at enq of
time entries of this time/charges.] [Note: see reduction at end of time entries of
this time/charges.]

12/21/2009 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.7 206.50|Discuss settlement with beneficiaries.

12/21/2009 |Harper, Keith 18 810.00 Discussions with qo-counsel (1.2); call with Mr. Hauck (.3); e-mail exchange with
co-counsel regarding same (.3).

12/21/2009 |Loving, John-Claude F. 20 750.00 Co_mml_Jnlcatlon W!th Congressional and pol!tlc_al staff on Cobell settlement (1.3);
legislative and political research on appropriations funding for settlement (.7).

12/21/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |Follow up re misc. contract details.

12/21/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.1 $ 495.00 |Disc cert petition and status w/ DG.

12/21/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 [Review JPM due diligence and research.

12/21/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Prep fee application.
Emails regarding Garden City contract (.1); revise Garden City contract (.8);
email to Mr. Rempel regarding Garden City contract (.1); email to Ms. Alianz

12/21/2009 |Smith, David C. 14 665.00 regarding contract (.1); email from Salt River regarding ways to reach

beneficiaries for outreach (.1); email to Ms. Kinsella and Ms. Keough regarding
conference call with Salt River beneficiaries (.1); email to Mr. Derrick regarding
outreach to beneficiaries at Salt River (.1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding case update
(.1); review phone message from beneficiary (.1); review phone message from
beneficiary (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding case status
(.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding case status (.1); review

12/22/2009 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.4 301.00|phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); review phone message from
beneficiary (.1); review phone message from beneficiary (.1); review phone
message from beneficiary (.1); review phone message from beneficiary (.1);
review email correspondence from beneficiary regarding confirmation of
consultation form and draft response regarding same (.2).

12/22/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 |Telcom. Dorris re settlement/legislative issues.

12/22/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re all issues, e.g., litigation issues; GCG issues.

12/22/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Levitas re Hill.

12/22/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Press re settlement/Hill.

12/22/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Harper re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

12/22/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 8.5 $ 7,862.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

12/22/2009 |Harper, Keith 16 720.00 Re\{iew .e-mail on notice (6) discussions with co-counsel regarding extension
(.7); review e-mail on petition (.3).

12/22/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update.

12/22/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 14 $ 630.00 [Prep fee application.
Emails regarding conference with Salt River personnel to determine location of
beneficiaries (.3); email from Garden City regarding contract (.1); email with Mr.

12/22/2009 |Smith, David C. 0.9 427.50|Dorris regarding contract (.1); forward certiorari petition to Mr. Harper (.1); review
list of tribes by state from Justice (.1); emails with Ms. Kinsella regarding
authorization letter (.1); scan of signed letter to Ms. Kinsella (.1).

12/23/2009 |Burns, Joseph V. 01 21.50 (C::;}Ibse(lllB;eneficiary Line: telephone Mr. Smith regarding status of post-settlement

12/23/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 12 354.00 ZT)a” memorandum regarding attorneys' fees (.1); research regarding same
Review statistics regarding calls and website visits from beneficiaries (.2);

12/23/2009 |Dorris, William E. 0.5 312.50|telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding work to be done to complete
settlement (.3).

12/23/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 462.50 |Telcoms. Dorris re above.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
12/23/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.5 1,387.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re Garden City contract; Echohawk issues; above.
12/23/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 1,110.00 |Review/revise/execute Garden City contract.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
12/23/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 8.5 7,862.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
12/23/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 225.00 |Prep fee application.
12/23/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.1 495.00 |GCG Contract, distribute, follow up re various parties re same.
12/23/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 1,080.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update, incl fee application (multiple).
. . Email regarding computer data from Ms. Kinsella (.2); emails regarding Garden
12/23/2009 | Smith, David C. 11 522.50 City Con%ract (.92); re\?iew research on privileged dé\taz in billing ingformagon (.7).
Email exchanges with litigation team re government's request for extension of
12/24/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 2.3 2,127.50 |time; government opposition of pltfs' motion to hold decisions on cert in
abeyance.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
12/24/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 3.8 3,515.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
12/24/2009 |Murray, Sheron D. 15 -|Work on spreadsheet regarding beneficiaries' contact information.
12/24/2009 |Smith, David C. 03 14250 Email regarding copversation with Mr. Hauck on petition for certiorari with Mr.
Charnes and Mr. Gingold (.3).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
12/27/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 5.3 4,902.50 [names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
12/27/2009 |Smith, David C. 0.5 237.50|Preparing information for beneficiary line (.5).
12/28/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 08 236.00 (Rf)search regarding attorneys' fees (.7); e-mail correspondence regarding same
12/28/2009 |Dorris, William E. 0.2 125.00 I(Erz‘r;ails with Mr. Harper regarding extension of legislative enactment deadline
12/28/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 05 $ 46250 Telcoms. Harper re cert petition; potential cross claims re cert petition; extension
of settlement agreement.
12/28/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. Levitas re above.
12/28/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. Dorris re fee petition; class counsel.
12/28/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Review/revise press release re extension of settlement agreement.
12/28/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. TB's re settlement terms.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
12/28/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 9.4 $ 8,695.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of

time entries of this time/charges.]

16




Elogl:s

fion ESYR&E

I'|_|y Jel;/)vglf Lgpc%][

LS PGl OR/ 1 U3 B AR NSRBI e

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Discussions with government (Brian Hauck) regarding extension of deadline and

12/28/2009 |Harper, Keith 1.4 630.00 |other activity related to implementation of settlement including review of notice
issues (.9). Call with Co-Counsel on same (0.5).
Emails with Mr. Derrick on notice issues at Salt River (.1); discussions regarding

12/28/2009 |Smith, David C. 2.7 1,282.50|revisions to settlement agreement extending time (.3); review research (first
draft) on production of billing information and issues on privilege (2.3).

12/29/2009 |Dietz, Richard D. 29 649.00 Research _regardlng privileged information in _descrlptlon of attorneys' fees (2.1);
draft e-mail memorandum of case law regarding same (.1).

12/29/2009 |Dorris, William E. 05 312,50 Emails tq an.d from. team mgmbers regarding legislative efforts and
communications with Salt River and class members (.5).

12/29/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 03 277 50 Review with Rempel and Harper extension of settlement agreement and related
agreement and execute same.

12/29/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 05 462 50 Telcoms. Levitas re same; key tr.u.stee issues; privileged/confidential information
that must be protected in fee petition and cases re same.

12/29/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 26 2.405.00 Rew_ew new common fund cases; governing law re same; privilege case re fee
application.

12/29/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re legislative issues.

12/29/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. TB's re terms of settlement; scope of class; qualifications.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

12/29/2009 |Gingold, Dennis 7.3 $ 6,752.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

12/29/2009 [Harper, Keith 0.9 $ 405.00 |Finalize agreement on extending the deadline (.9).

12/29/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |Follow-up re 300 high impact individuals.

12/29/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 [CC w/ Salt river and team re outreach.

12/29/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.0 $ 450.00 |Prep fee application.

12/29/2009 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 [Review extension, incl. discussion w/ KH, DG.
E-mail with Mr. Dorris regarding review of settlement agreement (.1); e-mail with

12/29/2009 [Smith, David C. 0.4 190.00(Mr. Kirschman reminding him about amended complaint (.1); e-mail with Mr.

Rempel regarding conference with Mr. Quinn (.1); e-mail to Mr. Dorris (.1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

12/29/2009

Smith, David C.

6.7

3,182.50

Email regarding compilation of beneficiaries names for Ms. Kinsella and Ms.
Keough (.1); discussions regarding information to put on claim forms for
beneficiaries (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Kinsella regarding notice
issues and documentation to list on claim form (.4); prepare proposed list of
information to put on claim form (1.3); review revised agreement with Interior
(.2); email from Mr. Kirschman regarding top 300 class members (.1); review
research from Mr. Dietz on redaction of billing information for privilege (.7);
emails with Mr. Gingold regarding research (.1); conference call with Ms.
Kinsella, Ms. Keough and members of Salt River regarding notice issues (1.1);
emails with Mr. Harper and Mr. Dorris regarding issues with contracting tribes
and notice (.3); work on Q and A's for beneficiary hot line (2.1).

12/30/2009

Burns, Joseph V.

0.2

43.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review status of post-settlement phone messages (.1);
draft memo to Mr. Smith regarding same (.1).

12/30/2009

Dietz, Richard D.

1.2

354.00

Research regarding attorneys' fees (1.1); e-mail correspondence regarding
same (.1).

12/30/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Telcom. Levitas re Hill issues.

12/30/2009

Gingold, Dennis

11.3

10,452.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

12/30/2009

Smith, David C.

12

570.00

Emails with Salt River and Ms. Kinsella regarding notice on Salt River
reservation (.3); review further research on production of billing information and
emails with Mr. Gingold (.2); emails with Mr. Burns regarding calls from
beneficiaries (.3); review data from Interior on top 300 beneficiaries (.4).

12/31/2009

Dorris, William E.

0.1

62.50

Review statistics regarding call center (.1).

12/31/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.4

370.00

Telcom. TB re status of case.

12/31/2009

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Levitas re extension of settlement agreement.

12/31/2009

Gingold, Dennis

9.0

8,325.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

12/31/2009

Smith, David C.

0.1

47.50

E-mail to Mr. Rempel regarding settlement agreement language.

12/31/2009

Smith, David C.

0.3

142.50

Email to Ms. Kinsella regarding location centers (.2); emails with Mr. Quinn (.1).

12/31/2009

Smith, David C.

6.1

2,897.50

Prepare questions and answers for Cobell beneficiary line (6); e-mails to Mr.
Dorris and Mr. Harper (.1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

1/1/2010

Smith, David C.

3.7

1,850.00

E-mails with Ms. Moss on notice (.1); conference call with co-counsel on
legislation and items to complete (.8); review Garden City contract (.7); research
on privilege issues (.2); review motion and order on disclosure of privacy
information (.3); discussions with Mr. Gingold regarding contract and motion (.3);
e-mails regarding beneficiary addresses from call in number (.3); prepare list of
items to complete (1).

1/2/2010

Gingold, Dennis

3.4

3,145.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/2/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. TB re status of case.

1/3/2010

Gingold, Dennis

55

5,087.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/3/2010

Harper, Keith

0.4

200.00

Review decision on fiduciary exception.

1/3/2010

Smith, David C.

2.9

1,450.00

E-mails regarding beneficiary contact list.

1/4/2010

Applegate, Alexis

0.9

184.50

Review beneficiary correspondence and conference with Mr. Smith regarding
same (.3); review media coverage per Mr. Levitas' request; (.3); review Supreme
Court notice regarding petition for certiorari per Mr. Gingold and conference with
him regarding same (.3).

1/4/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

6.0

1,410.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review memo and proposed guidelines for caller
guestions and answers received from Mr. Smith (1.1); conference with Mr. Smith
regarding same (.1); prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding proposed handling of
calls (.1); review 68 phone messages and emails from beneficiaries regarding
settlement and prepare notes regarding same (1.3); review and prepare memos
to Mr. Smith regarding pending caller issues (.5); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.3); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.4);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.4); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.6).

1/4/2010

Dietz, Richard D.

0.3

96.00

Review Supreme Court rules regarding extensions.

1/4/2010

Gingold, Dennis

2.0

1,850.00

Telcoms. TB's re status of case; checks sent without explanation; scope of
class.

1/4/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

185.00

Telcom. Levitas re potential consequences of further delay re settlement
implementation.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/4/2010  |Gingold, Dennis 04 370.00 .Confer-ence (;all Ms. Cpbell re extension of ltlme vis-a-vis cert petition; easement
issues; reaction in Indian country to extension/settlement delay.

1/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re Supreme Court issues.

1/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 92.50 [Review Supreme Court docket notice.

1/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 185.00 [Telcom. Harper re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.2 7,585.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/4/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.2 384.00|Calls with beneficiaries.

1/4/2010 |Harper, Keith 0.4 200.00 [Email exchange/messages with Mr. Hauck regarding settlement implementation.
Efforts on Cobell Settlement including communication with Congressional staff

1/4/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 0.5 197.50|and communication with post-settlement team members on advocacy efforts
(.5).

1/4/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 135.00 |Disc w/ DG re status.

1/4/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 225.00 [CC w/ EC, DG re status and fee application.

1/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 270.00 |CC w/ AC, DG, EL re Supreme Court and options.

1/4/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 270.00 [Follow up re 300 beneficiaries with substantial assets

1/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 405.00 |CC w/ Contractor re website and changes, incl documentation request for notice.

1/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 405.00 |review KK memo re status of tribal outreach and provide comments.

1/4/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 540.00 [Review, edit documents to be requested in notice.

1/4/2010 |Smith, David C. 07 350.00 Discussions Wlth Ms. K_m_se_lla (.3); discussions with Ms. Applegate and Mr.
Burns. regarding beneficiaries and calls (.4).

1/5/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 06 123.00 Rewew Supreme.COlIth filings per Mr. Smith's request (.3); review updated press
index per Mr. Levitas' request (.3).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.3); conference with Ms. Murray regarding compilation
of caller information for settlement notice mailing lists (.6); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding case status and return call (.6); review

1/5/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 3.0 705.00{phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.3);
return call to beneficiary regarding case status (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.4); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.2).

1/5/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 0.3 156.00|Telephone conference with Judge Robertson and DOJ officials regarding status.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/5/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

1/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 |Telcoms. TB's re settlement status.

1/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom press re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/5/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 9.5 8,787.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

. Call on settlement implementation (.8); call with Judge Robertson and Tom

1/5/2010 ~ [Harper, Keith L4 $ 700.00 Perelli (.3); email Wither. Gingold EB)) ;

1/5/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 3.0 $ 1,185.00|Efforts on Cobell Settlement (3).

1/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |Follow up on KK memo.

1/5/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [Disc w/ DG re status and court schedule.

1/5/2010 |Roth, Katie 1.0 -|Review press articles regarding settlement per Mr. Levitas request.
Review attachments for conference call from Ms. Hayes (1.2); e-mails regarding

1/5/2010 |Smith, David C. 1.8 900.00|beneficiary list for Ms. Keough (.3); discussions regarding meeting for outreach
(.3).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.4); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); return call to beneficiary

1/6/2010 |[Burns, Joseph V. 3.5 822.50|regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.3);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.3);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.5); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
update phone log regarding calls (.6).

1/6/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. o5 800.00 Revievv_ Supreme _Court rules (.4); draft motion to defer consideration of petition
for certiorari pending outcome of settlement (2.1).

1/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 647.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re settlement issues; cert petition; 1292 appeal; Cobell XXI.

1/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 647.50 [Telcoms. TB's re settlement status; scope of class.

1/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 03 277 50 Telc_om_s. Levita§ re Hi_II concerns; gbsence of government en_g{age_ment re same;
continuing delay; hearing schedule; conference call with presiding judge.

1/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 185.00 Discussion Rempel re class communication issues; logistics; strategy; fairness

hearing.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

1/6/2010

Gingold, Dennis

9.8

9,065.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/6/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

0.8

256.00

Discuss settlement with beneficiaries.

1/6/2010

Harper, Keith

2.7

1,350.00

Call with notice contractors (.8); call with co-counsel (.7); discussion with Mr.
Loving (.5); review notice materials (.7).

1/6/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

2.0

790.00

Efforts on Cobell Settlement (2).

1/6/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.2

90.00

Disc w/ Dg re status and updated tasks.

1/6/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.0

900.00

CC w/ JK re database and alternative data

1/6/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.9

1,305.00

Review outreach memo and take notes.

1/6/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

3.5

@ (BB R p| P |

1,575.00

CC w/ KK and various (multiple calls) re outreach to tribal entities and related
allottee associations. KH, EC and others.

1/6/2010

Smith, David C.

6.5

3,250.00

Review outreach plan from Ms. Kinsella and provide comments (2.1); review
information from Ms. Keough (.4); conference call with Ms. Kinsella (.5); e-mails
regarding tribal contacts (.3); beneficiary discussions (3.2).

1/7/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

2.8

658.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: conference with Ms. Bambalis regarding compilation of
caller information for beneficiary lists (.2); review email correspondence from
beneficiary regarding status of case (.1); review message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.1); review message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.2); review message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.2); review message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); return call to
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.3); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); return call to
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.2).

1/7/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.0

925.00

Telcoms. TB's re scope of class; STR issues.

1/7/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Telcom. Levitas re legislative concerns.

1/7/2010

Gingold, Dennis

10.4

9,620.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/7/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 03 $ 96.00 Draﬁ and revise co_rrespond_ence to Mr. Levitas regarding settlement issues (.2);
discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas (.1).

1/7/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 15 $ 592.50|Efforts on Congressional consideration of Cobell Settlement (1.5).

1/7/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ media re outreach and correction to stories.

1/7/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ EC re outreach.

1/7/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 |Disc w/ Dg re status and updated tasks.

1/7/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [CC w/ JK re deliverables and disc status.

1/7/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Review NARF fees, expenses in prep for fee app, incl prep analysis for same.

1/7/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.5 $ 2,025.00 |Review top 300 beneficiaries and design outreach (incl draft letter).

1/7/2010 |Smith, David C. 3.4 $ 1,700.00|Beneficiary calls (3); discussions regarding legislation (.4).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.3); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);

1/8/2010 |Bums, Joseph V. 13 $ 305.50 return .caII to peneﬂqary reqardlng settlement (.0); ret.urn call tq beneflcu?\r_y
regarding notice/waiver (.3); prepare email to Mr. Smith regarding beneficiary
call (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding case settlement (.3); update
phone log regarding calls (.1).

1/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel re scope of class counsel fees.

1/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcom potential depository band re distribution of settlement funds.

1/8/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Harper re scheduled conference call; land consolidation issue.

1/8/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. TB re case status; scope of class.

1/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re Hill issues, e.g. CBO scoring vis-a-vis Judgment Fund.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/8/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 7.4 $ 6,845.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/8/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.9 $ 288.00|Discussions of legislative issues (.4); calls with beneficiaries (.5).

1/8/2010 |Harper, Keith 1.3 $ 650.00 [Discussions on settlement implementation and call with Court regarding same.

1/8/2010 |[Loving, John-Claude F. 3.0 $ 1,185.00|Efforts on Cobell Settlement (3).

1/8/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ EC re status.

1/8/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Disc w/ DG re outreach and fee application
Review IIM data from Ms. Keough (.4); discussions regarding petition (.1);

1/8/2010 |Smith, David C. 14 $ 200.00|€ViEW o.rder. from_cgurt on Bank's motion; dlsc.us.s call from beneflplary (.3);
review Jicarilla opinion and effect on case (.2); discussions regarding proposed
legislation (.4).

1/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Conference call Kirschman, Quinn re additional claim form clarification.

1/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Conference call Kirschman, Rempel re further clarifications.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. CRA counsel re plaintiffs’ expenses.

1/10/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. Levitas re affidavits; fee petition.

1/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 07 $ 647 50 Confergnce call Rempe!, Kirschman, Quinn, Stemplewicz re long form notice
and claim form clarifications.

1/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.3 $ 7,677.50 |Revise draft fee petition
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.4); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.3); review message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.4); draft memo to Mr. Smith regarding beneficiary call
(.2); return call to beneficiary regarding inquiry (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);

1/11/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 3.8 893.00|return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.5); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.4); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
update phone log regarding calls (.2).

1/11/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 15 480.00 Draft motion to defer consideration of petition for certiorari pending outcome of
settlement.

1/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Discussion Pearl re legislative settlement issues.

1/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re same; status.

1/11/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call Smith, Rempel re DOJ "check box" issue on class notice.

1/11/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, litigation team re legislative issues.

1/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Levitas re same.

1/11/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Guilder re conference call.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/11/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 7.3 $ 6,752.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/11/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 20 640.00 C_onferenc_e _ca_ll to discuss legislative vehicles and options (0.8); discuss issues
with beneficiaries (1.2).

1/11/2010 [Harper, Keith 0.8 400.00 |Call on settlement implementation; call with Mr. Hauck.
Prepare for Bloomberg interview (review court decisions and email from Mr.

1/11/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 36 2.610.00 Guilder) and meeting with Bloomberg representatives (2.8); prepare for

conference call regarding legislation and participation in conference call with Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Harper, Mr. Guilder, Mr. Rempel and Mr. Gingold (0.8).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/11/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 1.2 474.00|Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (0.8).
Participate in conference call with Cobell team members to resolve legislative

1/11/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 20 640.00|1SSues (0.8); cqmmunlcatg with Hill ;taﬁ (.2); conta.c't former Congressmpal .
staffers to obtain information regarding the debt ceiling bill and other legislative
vehicles (1).

1/11/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 |CC w/ team re legislative update and to do's.

1/11/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and top 300 and notice.

1/11/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 3.4 $ 1,530.00 |draft, edit outreach plan for top 300 beneficiaries.

1/11/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 4.5 $ 2,025.00 |Review, edit long form notice.

1/11/2010 |Roth, Katie 01 _|Receipt and_rev.lew Supplemental Re_cord on Appeal, and e-mail to litigation
team for review; update CRAF pleadings file with same.
Review memo from Justice on new policies in Indian country (.2); inquiry from

1/11/2010 |Smith. David C. 18 900.00 ben.ef|C|ar|es regarding |nternat|onallca.IIs on .1-800 numk?er; email to Ms. Keough
(.2); response from Ms. Keough (.1); discussions regarding suggested language
from Mr. Quinn and Mr. Kirschman for website (1.2); response to Mr. Quinn (.1).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.4);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.4); review additional phone

1/12/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 36 846.00|MESSagE from benef|C|ar.y and retur.n call (.2); receive cfal_l from bengﬂmary
regarding settlement (.3); draft email response to beneficiary regarding
confirmation of consultation and settlement (.3); return call to beneficiary
regarding confirmation of consultation (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.5); return call to beneficiary regarding land issues and settlement
(.6); update phone log regarding calls (.4); file maintenance (.1).

1/12/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 2.0 $ 1,850.00 |Telcoms. Hill staff re legislative settlement issues.

1/12/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re same.

1/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.4 $ 1,295.00 |Conference calls litigation team re above.

1/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Prepare settlement talking points for Hill.

1/12/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Telcoms. Dorris re above.

1/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 08 $ 240.00 ;I;eclgf)“r;)s/. TB's re settlement status; impact of probate issues on settlement

1/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/12/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 3.5 3,237.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of

time entries of this time/charges.]

25




Ca

hiPERePAaRR

Elowse%ep

I'I_Iy Je@v%‘f@c‘?&%@%?%ézl nté:ricln?,detoa?./ 1043 \F qga%g\%f_’{s%?t@m)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/12/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 11 352.00 Disguss legislative issues with Mr. Gingold and have conference call with team
to discuss same.

1/12/2010 |[Harper, Keith 1.3 650.00 [Discussions related to settlement implementation with co-counsel.
Review emails regarding status of Cobell legislation (.2); telephone conference

1/12/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 1.2 870.00|with Mr. Gingold regarding Cobell legislation and activity by Senator and others;
prepare for conference call (1).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.3); communication with

1/12/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 15 592.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement for legislative and political research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.2).

1/12/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 14 448.00 Par.t!cipate in conference call with oth.er Qobgll Team mgmbers regarding the
political landscape for passage of legislation implementing the Cobell settlement.

1/12/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [Prep for meeting w/ bank.

1/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.0 $ 450.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and legislation.

1/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [Meet w/ potential bank and vet.

1/12/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 1.9 $ 855.00 [CC w/ team re legislation and updates (multiple).

1/12/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 2.7 $ 1,215.00 |draft, edit outreach plan for top 300 beneficiaries. Review data.

1/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.0 $ 1,350.00 |Review, edit long form notice.
Email with Mr. Burns regarding beneficiary (.3); emails regarding status of

1/12/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.8 400.00|legislation (.2); review discussions and emails regarding top 300 beneficiaries
(.3).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: prepare memos to Mr. Smith regarding pending caller

1/13/2010 |Bumns, Joseph V. 14 329.00 issu.es (.1); receive call _fr_om benefic_iary regarding Ianq sale and notice/wa_iv_er
(.4); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.4); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.4); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

1/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Telcom. Hill staff re legislative settlement issues.

. . Conference Ms. Cobell, Levitas, Harper, Loving, Smith, Harmala re Hill issues;

1/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 DOJ/DOI activities; WH; Senate leadership.

1/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Levitas re same.

1/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Telcoms. Dorris re same; case management issues.

1/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Harper re legislative settlement issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.3 $ 5,827.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of

time entries of this time/charges.]
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Draft and revise correspondence regarding internal meeting to discuss
legislative issues (.5); draft and revise draft letter to Senator regarding

1/13/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 4.4 1,408.00|settlement (2); discuss legislative issues with Mr. Gingold (1); draft and revise
correspondence to Mr. Levitas regarding legislative issues and draft letter to
Senator (.9).

1/13/2010 |Harmala, Robert 06 315.00 Meeting regarding Iegislativg sFrategy with Iitigatipn team (.3); call to Senate's
staff regarding prospect of finding legislative vehicle for settlement (.3).

1/13/2010 |Harper, Keith 12 600.00 S(_attlement implementation telephone conference briefing from Mr. Loving to Mr.
Gingold and me.
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1); communication with

1/13/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 1.2 474.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement; legislative and political research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.2).
Conference call with team on settlement approval (1.0); strategize with Mr.

1/13/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 1.3 416.00|Harmala and Mr. Loving regarding information gathering and possible next steps
(0.3).

1/13/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [Disc w/ DG re same.

1/13/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 |Review GCG amendment to agreement.

1/13/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Review, edit long form notice.

1/13/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 $ 1,080.00 |Disc w/ team re legislative outreach (multiple)

1/13/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.3 $ 150.00|Emails regarding Garden City amended contract.
Conference regarding status of legislation (1.0); emails with Mr. Harmala (.1);

1/13/2010 |Smith, David C. 1.6 800.00(review information on beneficiaries in government database (.4); email to Mr.
Dorris regarding status of meeting on legislation (.1).

1/14/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 23 471.50 Conference with Mr. Harper regarding list of Cobell decisions and begin work per

his request for list summarizing them for Congress.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

1/14/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

4.9

1,151.50

Cobell Beneficiary LIne: review phone message irom beneficiary and return call
(.1); review recorded message at claims administrator toll-free number due to
questions from callers regarding same (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); draft email response to beneficiary and
others regarding settlement (.2); draft email response to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to
beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); draft memo to Mr. Smith regarding email inquiry from beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
receive return call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); return call to
beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive return call from beneficiary
regarding settlement (.3); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive return call from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); review email from beneficiary regarding settlement and forward
same, with comments, to Mr. Smith for guidance (.3); update phone log
reaqardina calls ( 5Y file maintenance ( 1) nrenare mema ta Mr Smith reaardina

1/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Review/comment draft Pyramid Lake letter.

1/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.7

1,572.50

Respond to Senate inquiries re settlement.

1/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Levitas re above.

1/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

9.0

8,325.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/14/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.2

384.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues (.7); call with Mr. Levitas to discuss
letter of support to Senator (.2); draft and revise letter to Senator (.3).

1/14/2010

Harmala, Robert

14

735.00

Group conference call (.9), telephone call to Senate staff regarding potential
legislative vehicle for settlement (.5).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

1/14/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

2.9

2,102.50

Email exchanges with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Harper and Mr. Charnes concerning
Cobell legislation and involvement of Associate Attorney General (.3); telephone
conference with Mr. Rempel, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Guilder, Ms. Cobell and
Mr. Harmala regarding contact and strategy for Cobell legislation involving White
House, Senator Reid and others (.7); review and comment on Tribal leader letter
to Senator, and email exchanges with Mr. Gingold and Ms. Cobell concerning
same (1.9).

1/14/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

12

474.00

Communication with Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.5); legislative
and political research on Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.7).

1/14/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

11

352.00

Team conference call on Congressional strategy (.7); conference with Hill staff
(.3); arrange call between Ms. Cobell and Administration (.1).

1/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.5

225.00

Disc w/ DG re same.

1/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

CC w/ team re legislative update.

1/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.8

360.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.

1/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.2

i el ol Rl PPN

540.00

Review, edit long form notice.

1/14/2010

Smith, David C.

11

550.00

Email to Mr. Burns regarding call from beneficiary (.2); conference with co-
counsel regarding status (.7); email to Mr. Kirschman (.1); email regarding draft
contract for Garden City (.1).

1/15/2010

Applegate, Alexis

1.5

307.50

Creation of Cobell decision list and summary per Mr. Harper's request.

1/15/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

3.0

705.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review email correspondence from beneficiary regarding
settlement and draft email response (.2); review Settlement Agreement and draft
proposed email response to beneficiary, per Mr. Smith (.6); review letter from
beneficiary regarding Cobell case information and draft proposed response letter
(.6); review letter from beneficiary regarding land issues and telephone
beneficiary (.1); review letter from beneficiary regarding Cobell case information
(.1); draft letter response to beneficiary (.3); receive call from beneficiary
regarding settlement status (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement
(.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
update phone log regarding calls, emails and letters (.3); file maintenance (.2).

1/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

10.4

9,620.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Conference call Harper, Rempel re Hill settlement issues.

1/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

&P

277.50

Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above; conference call.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/15/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference calls Rempel, Harper re notice issues; ITMA issues.

1/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Levitas re legislative concerns.

1/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 05 462 50 Copfergnce call Ms. Qobell, Levitas, Loving, Pearl, Rempel, Harper, Guilder re
legislative settlement issues.

1/15/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 07 224.00 E:g)nference call to discuss legislative issues (.5); discuss same with Mr. Pearl

1/15/2010 |Harper, Keith 19 950.00 Teleph_one conference W.ith_CobeI_I team_(.5); deal v_vith ITMA misrepresentations
regarding settlement (.8); discussions with Mr. Loving (.6).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.7); communication with

1/15/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 11 434.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement, and legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.4).

1/15/2010 |Pearl. Michael Alexander 10 $ 320.00 Participate on Cpbell co_nference call (.8); conference with Hill staff regarding
potential legislative vehicles (.2).

1/15/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [Disc w/ DG re legislation

1/15/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [CC w/ KK re notice status and update.

1/15/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [CC w/ team re legislation.

1/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Follow up re KK call w/ inquiries re outreach and research.
Status conference with co-counsel (.8); emails with Ms. Murray regarding

1/15/2010 |Smith, David C. 14 200.00 ber_leficiary. calls (.1); prepare response to beneficigry rega}rding release (_)f
claims (.3); forward response to co-counsel for review (.1); conference with Mr.
Pearl (.1).

1/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 462.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re all issues; legislative concerns.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 6.6 6,105.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/17/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 6.6 6,105.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 555.00 |Telcom. Infield re settlement issues.

1/18/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/18/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 5.3 4,902.50 [names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/18/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 10 395.00 Commu_r_lication with Congressiona_l staff on Cobell settler_nenF (.4);_ legislative
and political research on Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.6).

1/19/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 1.0 205.00|Further work on list and summary of Cobell decisions per Mr. Harper's request.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

1/19/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

3.4

799.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: conference with Mr. Smith regarding information
requests from beneficiaries (.1); review email correspondence from beneficiary
regarding settlement and draft response (.1); review email correspondence from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); prepare email response to inquiry by
beneficiary, per Mr. Smith (.1); file maintenance (.2); review phone message
from beneficiary regarding confirmation of consultation and return call (.4);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding case status and return call
(.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding contact information (.1);
review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.2); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.2); receive call
from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); receive
call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); review phone message from
beneficiary and return call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver and return call (.2); update phone log regarding calls and
emails (.4).

1/19/2010

Dorris, William E.

0.9

589.50

Team conference call regarding legislative effort (.5); telephone conference with
Mr. Gingold regarding strategy (.4).

1/19/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Telcom. Ms. Cobell re all issues; legislative concerns.

1/19/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.2

1,110.00

Conference call all hands re legislative issues.

1/19/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

&R ||

277.50

Telcoms. Levitas re same.

1/19/2010

Gingold, Dennis

9.4

*

8,695.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/19/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.2

384.00

Legislative update conference call (.5); discussions with Mr. Gingold and Mr.
Pearl regarding same (.7).

1/19/2010

Harper, Keith

1.1

550.00

Discussion on settlement implementation.

1/19/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

2.3

1,667.50

Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold concerning legislation and follow-up on
possible committee hearing; discussed Mr. Hauck and Pirelli telephone
conference (.4); conference call with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Guilder, Mr.
Dorris and Mr. Pearl regarding Cobell legislation, House Resources Committee
hearing, Senate Bill mark-up, report regarding House Resources Committee bill
consideration; preparation for telephone conference with Mr. Hauck and Mr.
Pirelli (1.9).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review, and respond to, email correspondence from
beneficiary (.1); file maintenance (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive
call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding

1/20/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 2.7 634.50(settlement and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement
(.3); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); update phone log
regarding email and calls (.4); review files and conference with Mr. Smith
regarding caller request (.2); conference with Mr. Gingold regarding beneficiary
(.3); research phone logs regarding same (.1).

1/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Levitas, Ms. Cobell, Guilder, Pearl, Harper re legislative issues.

1/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Dorris re same.

1/20/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re same.

1/20/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re same.

1/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcoms. Guilder re same.

1/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Harper re same.

1/20/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Standing Rock TB re status of case.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.2 $ 8,510.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Call team members to discuss conference call scheduling regarding legislative

1/20/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 16 51200 issueg (.5); draft and_ revise c_orrespond'ence to legislative as_sistant to _Sengtor
and discuss same with Mr. Gingold (.6); conference call to discuss legislative
issues (.5).

1/20/2010 |[Harper, Keith 1.0 $ 500.00 [Multiple calls with co-counsel on settlement implementation..

1/20/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 0.5 $ 197.50|Efforts on Cobell Settlement consideration by Congress (.5).

1/20/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 06 $ 192.00 (F;?r:g(c:)ilpc)ja(tei)in Cobell call (0.5); provide Administration contact information to Mr.

1/20/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.3 $ 150.00|E-mails with Mr. Burns and Ms. Applegate regarding beneficiary calls.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review email correspondence from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); review
letter from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary
regarding settlement status (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding case
status (.4); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); receive call

1/21/2010 |Bumns, Joseph V. o5 $ 587 50 from bene.ficiary reggrding settlement (.2); draft.memo to Mr.. Smith regarfjing
same (.1); draft email correspondence to beneficiary regarding same (.1);
receive call from NARF office regarding continuing availability of Beneficiary Line
(.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.2); update phone log regarding email and calls (.3); file maintenance
(.1).

1/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Harper, Levitas, Rempel, Pearl re above.

1/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re same.

1/21/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Harper re same.

1/21/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re all issues; legislative concerns.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/21/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 9.3 $ 8,602.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/21/2010 |[Guilder, Justin M. 0.6 $ 192.00|Talk with beneficiaries about settlement.

1/21/2010 |Harper, Keith 12 $ 600.00 Qall on §ettlement implementation and discussion on legislation; follow-up
discussions with co-counsel.

. . Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding contact with Representative

1/21/2010 |Levitas, Eliiott H. 0.4 $ 290.00 Rahall and others on House Committee relating to Cobell legislation.

1/21/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 1.0 $ 395.00|Congressional efforts on Cobell Settlement.

1/21/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |Follow up w/ KK re misc.

1/21/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ GCG re hilling.

1/21/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 |CC w/ team re update and status.

1/21/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Disc w/ DG re status.

1/21/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 4.5 $ 2,025.00 |Review long form notice and edit.

1/21/2010 [Smith, David C. 0.3 $ 150.00(Discussions with beneficiaries.

. Review media coverage and Supreme Court dates per Mr. Smith's request (.3);
1/22/2010 | Applegate, Alexis 1.0 $ 205.00 continue work on list (?f Cobell dgcisions per Mr. HaFr)per's request (.7)?1 9
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

1/22/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

11

258.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review pending matters for callers and prepare memos
to Mr. Smith regarding same (.2); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.1); review message from beneficiary and
return call (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); review
letter received from beneficiary (.1); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding land sale and return call (.3); update phone log regarding calls (.1);
prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding impact of land sale on settlement
participation (.1).

1/22/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.8

740.00

Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel, Levitas, Guilder re legislative issues;
concerns.

1/22/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.6

555.00

Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re same.

1/22/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Guilder re same.

1/22/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom potential contractor re notice help in the Dakotas.

1/22/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.4

AR |R|R| P

370.00

Telcom. Levitas re legislative issues; concerns.

1/22/2010

Gingold, Dennis

9.1

“

8,417.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/22/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.0

320.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues (.5); draft and revise
correspondence to legislative assistant to Senator Tester (.5).

1/22/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

2.0

1,450.00

Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding NYT editorial and status of

Cobell legislation (.4); conference call with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Harper,
Mr. Guider and Mr. Rempel regarding strategy for attaching Cobell legislation to
legislative vehicle (.8); contact with House Committee and two Senator's offices
and White House, and evaluation of debt ceiling bill, jobs bill, Haiti relief bill (.8).

1/22/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.5

225.00

Dis. w/ DG re status.

1/22/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.6

270.00

CC w/ Ms. Kinsella, Ms. Keough and Mr. Smith regarding notice and outreach
plans status.

1/22/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

Meet w/ DS, DG re status.

1/22/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.8

360.00

CC w/ team re legislative update.

1/22/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

5.0

AR |H| B B

2,250.00

Update long form notice.

1/22/2010

Smith, David C.

21

1,050.00

Conference call with Ms. Kinsella, Ms. Keough and Mr. Rempel (.6); discussions
with Mr. Rempel regarding long form notice (.6); email to Mr. Kirschman
regarding website (.1); emails regarding Tuesday meeting (.1); discussions
regarding legislative efforts (.2); email with Mr. Burns regarding calls from
beneficiaries (.1); email regarding questions from Ms. Kinsella on Osage (.2);
email regarding outreach requests on Cobell (.1); email to Ms. Kinsella regarding
outreach in New Mexico (.1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 45 4,162.50 [names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/24/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 277.50 |Telcom potential contractor re notice help in the Dakotas.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.2 3,885.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Review and forward recent beneficiary correspondence and Supreme Court

1/25/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 2.7 553.50(filings per Mr. Smith's request (.5); finalize list of Cobell decisions per Mr.
Harper's request (2.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding trust
land issue and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
land issue and return call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
case status and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary

1/25/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 20 470.00 regarding statu.s and return call (.2); rece?ve call frc_)m beneficiar)'/ rega_rding
settlement (.3); prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding same (.1); receive call
from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.2);
review letter from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); review letter from
beneficiary regarding Cobell case (.1); draft memo to Mr. Smith regarding same
(.2); file maintenance (.1).

1/25/2010 |[Dorris, William E. 0.7 458.50|Conference call with team regarding legislative efforts.

. . Conference call Ms. Cobell, Pearl, Harper, Loving, Dorris, Smith, Rempel,

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 08 740.00 Guilder legislative settlement issues; ITMA issues; ILWG.

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 14 1,295.00 Re\_/ieW/rev_ise drafts Il & V, responses to questions from Senate Committee on
Indian Affairs.

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 Telpom. Solicitor General re cert petition; extension of time to respond due to
legislative delay.

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Applegate re same.

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Harper re above; class communications; ITMA meeting; TB concerns.

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Conference call Harper, Rempel re response to SCIA inquiries.

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Levitas re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.5 $ 6,937.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of

time entries of this time/charges.]
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

1/25/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.6

512.00

Draft and revise answers to SCIA Vice Chairman Barrasso's questions for Ms.
Cobell (.3); draft and revise correspondence to Mr. Harper and Mr. Gingold
regarding same (.1); discuss legislative issues with Mr. Pearl and Mr. Loving
(.4); conference call to discuss legislative issues (.8).

1/25/2010

Harper, Keith

1.2

600.00

Call with litigation team on settlement implementation and discussion of notice
issues (.8); edit, answer SCIA questions (.4).

1/25/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

3.9

2,827.50

Review draft answers to SCIA, telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding
responses to committee; edit and re-write responses to SCIA,; various email
exchanges regarding responses with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Guilder and Mr. Smith;
transmit revised responses to SCIA and review comments from other Cobell
team members (1.7); various telephone conferences with Mr. Loving regarding
Cobell legislation and report on Senate committee consideration and majority
leader procedures (1.0); telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding Cobell
legislation and activities for enactment (.1); telephone conference with Mr.
Harper regarding White House status on Cobell legislation (.3); conference call
with Mr. Loving, Mr. Dorris, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel and Mr. Guilder regarding
Cobell legislation (.8).

1/25/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

2.9

1,145.50

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.8); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1.2); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.9).

1/25/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

11

352.00

Participate in Cobell team conference call (.8); review draft answers to Hill
questions regarding the settlement (.3).

1/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.3

135.00

Prep for CC

1/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.5

225.00

Disc w/ DG re same.

1/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

CC w/ EC re process and scheduling of notice/distribution tasks.

1/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.8

360.00

Draft, edit response to SCIA questions to EC. And disc w/ DG.

1/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.8

360.00

CC w/ team re status.

1/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.2

*H || B R R|n

990.00

Draft, edit write up in response to EC inquiries re tasking/schedule of notice and
dist.

1/25/2010

Smith, David C.

3.2

1,600.00

Status conference call (.7); respond to call from beneficiary (.3); review
extension of time on petition response and docket (.1); respond to inmate
(beneficiary) (.4); discussions regarding call from beneficiary (.3); review/revise
response to questions from Senator Barrasso (1.2); e-mail to Mr. Burns
regarding inquiry from beneficiary on land sales (.2).

1/26/2010

Applegate, Alexis

0.3

61.50

Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request and conference
with team members regarding editorial (.2); review correspondence regarding
beneficiary letter per Mr. Smith's request (.1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

1/26/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

2.6

611.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: conference with Mr. Smith regarding pending caller
questions (.2); review letter received from beneficiary regarding settlement and
conference with Mr. Smith regarding same (.1); review letter from beneficiary
regarding settlement and draft response letter (.4); file maintenance (.1); review
phone message from beneficiary regarding case status and return call (.3);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call
(.2); telephone beneficiary regarding land issues (.4); prepare memo to Mr.
Harper regarding same (.3); telephone beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3); update phone log
regarding calls (.2).

1/26/2010

Dorris, William E.

0.4

©»

262.00

Conference call with team regarding legislative efforts to approve settlement
agreement.

1/26/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.7

647.50

Telcom. CRA counsel re settlement status.

1/26/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Guilder re response to questions from Senator.

1/26/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.4

370.00

Review/revise current draft, response to Senator's questions.

1/26/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Levitas re same.

1/26/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.6

555.00

Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above; Wyoming tribal input.

1/26/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.7

AR | B |h B[P

647.50

Conference call all hands re legislative issues.

1/26/2010

Gingold, Dennis

7.6

*

7,030.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/26/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

2.4

768.00

Draft and revise transmittal letter to SCIA, draft and revise answers to written
SCIA questions, draft and revise correspondence to SCIA staffers to transmit
answers (2); call beneficiaries (.4).

1/26/2010

Harper, Keith

0.8

400.00

Telephone conference on settlement implementation.

1/26/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

1.9

1,377.50

Email exchanges with Mr. Guilder and Mr. Gingold regarding responses to SCIA
(.5); email exchange regarding White House telephone conference and
participation in White House telephone conference with Ron Nabors (OMB) and
White House staff regarding proposal for budget freeze (.5); telephone
conference with Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Guilder, Mr. Rempel and Mr.
Gingold regarding Cobell legislation and budget freeze and report on White
House telephone conference (.8); telephone call with Mr. Gingold regarding
Cobell legislation (.1).

1/26/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

4.5

1,777.50

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.8); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (2); legislative and political research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bill (1.7).

1/26/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

0.6

192.00

Participate in Cobell conference call.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/26/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ DOJ re outreach.

1/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |Disc w/ DG re same and related.

1/26/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [CC w/ DOJ, KK, GCG, DS re revising schedule.

1/26/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [CC w/ team re status and legislative update.

1/26/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [Disc w/ DG, DS re CC w/ DOJ and revised schedule.

1/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 25 $ 1,125.00 |Edit, revise response letter to Martin (re outreach).
Status conference on legislation (.7); review/revise answers to questions from
Senator Barrasso directed to Ms. Cobell (.8); emails with Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold and Mr. Levitas regarding questions from Senator Barrasso (.3);

1/26/2010 |Smith, David C. 3.6 1,800.00|responses to inquiries from beneficiaries (.7); emails with Mr. Burns regarding
questions from beneficiaries (.3); work on revisions to long form notice (.4);
email regarding White House call regarding budget (.1); discussions regarding
article in Indian Country Today affecting settlement (.3).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone messages from beneficiary (.1); receive
call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.4); receive call from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver (.4); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (1.3); draft memo to Mr. Smith regarding call (.3);

1/27/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 40 940.00 receive call regarding .Ietter inquiry (.1); telephon_e benefici_ary regardi.ng _
requested referral (.4); prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding call (.1); review
phone message from beneficiary (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.3); file
maintenance (.2); conference with Mr. Smith regarding settlement provisions
(.1); review current claims administrator recorded announcement and settlement
website (.2).
Meeting with Mr. Smith, Mr. Gingold and Mr. Rempel regarding status of and

1/27/2010 |Dorris, William E. 21 1,375.50 wor!< to be done on legislation .and feg re.que.sts (1.1); review research
assignment to Mr. Schulof (.3); participating in team telephone conference
regarding legislative efforts (.7).

1/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel re ITMA opposition to settlement.

1/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.5 $ 2,312.50 |Review/revise response to ITMA Martin opposition to settlement.

1/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Conference call all hands re legislative issues.

1/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832 50 Meet with Dorris, Smith, Rempel re fee petition issues vis-a-vis governing law
and settlement agreement.

1/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Levitas re legislative issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/27/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 8.8 8,140.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/27/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.7 224.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

38




hip PR 5

Elogs%%ep

I'I_Iy Jel;/)vglf @c?&g%%?%ezl nté:ricln?,detoa?./ 1043 \F E.’L%%(?\?O?ES%?(@FH)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/27/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.3 $ 157.50|Conference call with Mr. Harper regarding settlement legislation.
Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold concerning Cobell legislation and
activities concerning the Senate committee Republican position (.3); conference

1/27/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 10 $ 795 00 call with Ms._ Cobell, M_r. Dorris, Mr. _Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Pearl,_ Mr. Guilder
and Mr. Loving regarding Cobell legislation and report from Mr. Loving on
contacts from Republicans on Indian committee and strategy relating to
timetable and activity by Senator Dorgan (.7).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (0.8); communication with

1/27/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 4.0 $ 1,580.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (2.5); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.7).

1/27/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |CC w/ DOI re same.

1/27/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ EC, DG re same.

1/27/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re status.

1/27/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 |Review, edit long form notice.

1/27/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 2.2 $ 990.00 (Meet w/ BD, DS, DG re status and update.

1/27/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 4.5 $ 2,025.00 |Draft, edit response editorial for outreach.
Telephone call to Ms. Kinsella (.1); telephone conversation with Mr. Burns
regarding calls from beneficiaries (.5); conference with Mr. Rempel regarding

1/27/2010 |Smith, David C. 3.3 $ 1,650.00(long form notice (.2); discussions with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Dorris and Mr.
Rempel regarding incentive fee award and fee application (1.1); prepare memo
on research (1.1); review revised notice schedule (.3).

1/28/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.2 $ 41.00|Update Beneficiary files per Mr. Smith's request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call

1/28/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 14 $ 329.00 (.1).; receiye call f.rom .beneficiary (.3); receive call from 'beneficiary. regarding
notice/waiver (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement
and return call (.3); draft memo to Mr. Smith regarding call (.1); update phone log
regarding calls (.2).
Telephone conference with Mr. Schulof and Mr. Raider discussing necessary

1/28/2010 |Dorris, William E. 1.1 $ 720.50|research to be done regarding incentive awards and attorneys' fees (.5); revise
memo to Mr. Schulof setting forth issues which need to be researched (.6).

1/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 08 $ 240.00 Cor\fer(_ancg call I-llarper., Loving, Ms. Cobell Rempel, Guilder, Levitas re
legislative issues; Martin/ITMA.

1/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.4 $ 2,220.00 |Revise response to Martin/ITMA opposition.

1/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 |Telcoms. Guilder re above.

1/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
1/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.5 6,937.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Draft and revise response to criticism regarding the settlement and to dispel
1/28/2010 |[Guilder, Justin M. 2.4 768.00|false allegations to be published in Indian Country Today and correspond with
ICT staff (1.5); conference call on legislative issues (.9).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.1); communication with
1/28/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 4.0 1,580.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (2); legislative and political research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.9).
Prepare for and participate in conference with Messrs. Schulof and Dorris
1/28/2010 |Raider, Ron L. 0.8 -|concerning legal research on numerous issues related to recovery of attorney
fees.
1/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 225.00 |CC w JG, DS, DG re same.
1/28/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 405.00 [CC w/ team re status.
1/28/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 810.00 |Draft, edit response editorial for outreach.
Prepare for and patrticipate in conference with Messrs. Raider and Dorris
1/28/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 12 354.00 concernl.ng I(?gal research on numerous issues related Fo recovery of attorney
fees (.8); review memorandum from Mr. Dorris concerning same and
confidentiality agreement (.4).
1/28/2010 [Smith, David C. 0.1 50.00|E-mail to Ms. Cobell.
1/29/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.4 82.00[{Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review memo from Mr. Smith regarding caller issue (.1);
receive and review letter from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); draft reply
1/29/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 16 376.00 correspondg_nce to bengflmary_ (.5); f|.Ie maintenance (.1); re.v|ew. phone message
from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.3); review phone
message from beneficiary and return call (.2); receive call from beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); update phone log regarding letters and calls (.1).
1/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference call all hands re legislative issues.
1/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re all issues; the above, e.g., Sen. Barrasso issues.
1/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. BIA employee re continuing IIM issues at DOI.
1/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Levitas re legislative issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
1/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.2 $ 8,510.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
1/29/2010 |[Guilder, Justin M. 3.8 1,216.00|Draft and revise article on Cobell case and settlement for public relations.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

1/29/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.2 $ 105.00|Telephone call Cobell team regarding settlement legislation.

1/29/2010 [Harper, Keith 11 $ 550.00 [Call with group on settlement implementation (.5); call with Notice contractor (.6).
Review and analyze ICT article regarding objections to Cobell settlement (.3);
telephone conference with Mr. Gingold discussing objections to Cobell

1/29/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 0.7 $ 507.50|Settlement and ICT article and considered options of further discussions
concerning article (.2); discussed CBO decision on scoring of settlement and
efforts with Mr. Harper to arrange meeting with CBO (.2).

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.5); communication with

1/29/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 5.0 $ 1,975.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (2.2); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bill (2.3).

1/29/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Disc w/ DG re same.

1/29/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |CC w/ team re status.

1/29/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 50 $ 1,475.00 Conduct legal research concerning numerous issues related to obtaining fee
award and draft memorandum concerning same (5).

1/29/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.3 $ 150.00|Review responses of DOJ to request by Senator Barrasso.

1/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Telcoms. BIA employee re continuing 1IM issues at DOI.

1/30/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re all issues; the above.

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/30/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 3.5 $ 3,237.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/30/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 15 $ 592 50 Commu_r_lication with Congressiona_l staff on Cobell settler_nenF (.6);_ legislative
and political research on Congressional calendar and legislative bill (.9).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

1/31/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 4.1 $ 3,792.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

1/31/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 4.5 $ 2,025.00 |Review notice plan.

2/1/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.8 $ 164.00|Review status report per Mr. Levitas' request.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call
(.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding case status and return
call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and

2/1/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 2.6 611.00|return call (.4); receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.1); receive
call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3); receive call from beneficiary
regarding settlement (.3); review phone message from beneficiary and return call
(.1); review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.5); update phone
log regarding calls (.3).

2/1/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.8 740.00 [Conference call all hands re legislative issues.

2/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 370.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re same.

2/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 462.50 |Telcoms. Levitas re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.4 8,695.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/1/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 08 256.00 anferepce call to discuss Ieg.islative issues and to discuss issue_s that have
arisen with defendants regarding class members that do not receive statements.

2/1/2010 |Harmala, Robert 05 262 50 Telephone call with Copell team regarding contact with Senators (.2), telephone
call with contact regarding same (.3).

2/1/2010 [Harper, Keith 0.8 400.00 |Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.8).

2/1/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 10 795 00 Preparation for and conferenc'e call with Mr Qingold, Ms. Cobell, Mr. Smith, Mr.
Loving and Mr. Harper regarding Cobell litigation.
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.8); communication with

2/1/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 1.7 671.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.4); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.5).

2/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 180.00 |disc w/ DG re same.

2/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 360.00 [CC w/ team re status.

2/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.0 1,800.00 |Review naotice plan.
Conduct legal research concerning reasonableness of attorney fee requests and

2/1/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 4.6 1,357.00|class representative incentive payments and summarize research in legal
memorandum to Mr. Dorris (4.6).
Conference call regarding legislation and discussions with Mr. Kirschman (.8);
telephone conversation with Mr. Kirschman (2) (.4); email from Mr. Kirschman

2/1/2010 |Smith, David C. 18 900.00 regarding Turtle Mountain blog (.1); email to Ms. Kinsella and Ms. Keough

regarding Turtle Mountain blog and response (.2); email to Mr. Harmala
regarding status (.1); email from Mr. Loving (.1); discussions regarding
contractors meeting at Justice (.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);

2/2/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 09 211,50 recelv.e.call from b.enef|C|ary regarding settl.emen't (.2); receive call frgm
beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1); receive call from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver (.3); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

21212010 |Gingold, Dennis 05 462 50 iC'nglr;lfaesren(:e call Ms. Cobell, Levitas, Loving, Rempel, Guilder re legislative

2/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 277.50 |Telcoms. Levitas re CBO/scoring/offset issues; settlement issues.

2/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.1 1,017.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.8 8,140.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/2/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.2 384.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

21212010 |Harper, Keith 14 200.00 Telephone conference on settlement implementation and related email
exchanges.
Email exchanges regarding CBO contacts and Senator's offices on activity
regarding attaching a Cobell amendment (.2); various telephone conferences

2/2/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 15 1,087.50 with Mr. Glngpld regarding Ieg|slat|or1 and qontgcts Wlt.h DOI anql DQJ; telephone
conference with Mr. Charnes regarding legislation (.5); preparation for and
conference call with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Loving, Mr. Guilder and Mr.
Gingold regarding Cobell legislation (.8).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.6); communication with

2/2/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 2.4 948.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1); legislative and political research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.8).

2/2/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |Disc w/ DG re misc and status.

2/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ KM personnel.

2/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re status.

2/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.0 $ 1,350.00 |Review long form notice.

2/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.4 $ 1,530.00 |Review draft notice plan.

2/2/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 6.8 2.006.00 Conduct legal research concerning reaso'nable attorney fee awards and prepare
legal memorandum to Mr. Dorris concerning same (6.8).
E-mail to Ms. West at Ms. Kinsella's office (.1); telephone call to Ms. Kinsella
(.1); review notice plan of Ms. Kinsella (1.4); review Garden City contract (.7); e-

2/2/2010 |Smith, David C. 36 1,800.00 mail to Mr. Rempel regarding contract (.1); e-mails regarding status of legislative

efforts (.3); telephone conversation with Mr. Dorris regarding status (.1); e-mail
to Mr. Rempel regarding contract for Garden City (.1); e-mail to all counsel
regarding revisions to notice plan (.7).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding

2/3/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.6 $ 141.00|notice/waiver and return call (.1); receive return call from beneficiary regarding
settlement and related matters (.4); update phone log regarding calls (.1).
Conference call with team regarding legislative efforts (.6); emails regarding

2/3/2010 |Dorris, William E. 2.2 $ 1,441.00|Congressional contacts (.3); review cases regarding incentive awards to class
representatives (1.3).

2/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel re settlement status.

2/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above; WH engagement.

2/3/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 |Telcoms. Levitas re above.

2/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Harper re same.

2/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call Guilder, Rempel re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.5 $ 8,787.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/3/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 23 $ 736.00 Draft and re\{|se grass roots mate_rlal to garner s_upport from Republican
Senators (1); conference call to discuss legislative issues (1.3).

2/3/2010 |Harmala, Robert 05 $ 26250 Telephone .calls with Mr. Rempel regarding Sen. Staff (.1); telephone calls to
administration regarding settlement (.4).

2/3/2010 |Harper, Keith 0.3 $ 150.00 |Call to Mr. Gingold on settlement legislation language; email exchange.

2/3/2010 | Loving, John-Claude F. 29 $ 869.00 Commqqlcatlon with Congressmna! staff on Cobell settler.nenF (1.5); legislative
and political research on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.7).

2/3/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 10 $ 320.00 Paruupate in C_obeII team conference call (0.7_); cqnference with Mr. Loving
regarding possible avenues for settlement legislation enactment (.3).

2/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Review long form notice.

2/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.1 $ 495.00 |Disc w/ DG re legislative status and outreach.

2/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.4 $ 630.00 [CC w/ team re status.

2/3/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 |Outreach to various regarding settlement.

2/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 [Review DOI QR.

2/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Review draft notice plan.

2/3/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 6.9 $ 2.035.50 Conduc_t legal research concerning reaso_nable attorney fee awards and draft
and revise legal memorandum summarizing same (6.9).

2/3/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.4 $ 200.00(|Discussions with team regarding legislative issues.

2/4/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.2 $ 41.00|Conferences with Mr. Levitas and Mr. Guilder regarding misconduct research.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call

2/4/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.1 258.50((.2); receive call from attorney for beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3);
receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3); update phone log
regarding calls (.1).
Review and revise draft long form notice to class of settlement (.7); email to Mr.

2/4/2010 |Dorris, William E. 20 1,310.00 Rempel of suggested changes to the draft Ion'g form notice (.2); telephone .
conference with team members regarding legislative efforts and follow up emails
(1.2).

2/4/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Review draft settlement legislation.

2/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Levitas re same; Senator.

2/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Meet with press re settlement issues.

2/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Conference call all hands re legislative issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.5 $ 7,862.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/4/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.1 352.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

21412010 |Harper, Keith 14 200.00 Telephone confe.ren(.:e with co-counsel on settlement implementation (.9); email
exchange on legislation (.5).
Prepare for conference call with Cobell team (.5); review analyze and annotate
revised draft of legislation submitted by DOJ (.7); telephone conference with Mr.
Gingold regarding same (.1); email exchanges with Mr. Guilder, Mr. Harper, Mr.

. . Smith and Mr. Gingold regarding revisions, especially addition of "at the

2/412010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 3.0 2,175.00 discretion of the sgcretary?" (.2);greview, analyz?e and );nnotate 39th Status
Report (.8); review and analyze FY11 budget language regarding settlement
agreement, amd email to Mr. Gingold, Ms. Cobell and other Cobell team
regarding budget language for settlement agreement (.7).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (0.8); communication with

2/4/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 15 $ 592.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.2); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.5).

2/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Disc w/ DG re same.

2/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Review long form notice.

2/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [CC w/ team re status and legislation.

2/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |CC w/ GCG, KK re draft plan.

2/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.3 $ 1,035.00 |Review draft plan and edit.

2/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.3 $ 1,035.00 |Review short form notice.

2/4/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 59 $ 1,740.50 Conduct legal research concerning recovery of reasonable attorney fees and

draft legal memorandum to Mr. Dorris concerning same (5.9).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

E-mails regarding discussions with beneficiaries (.6); review draft legislation and

2/4/2010 |Smith, David C. 3.4 1,700.00|discussions regarding same (1.4); discussions regarding Ms. Kinsella's notice
program (.3); conference call regarding legislation (1.1).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: Receipt and review letter from beneficiary regarding
change of address (.1); review phone message from beneficiary (.1); receive call

2/5/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.6 376.00|from beneficiary regarding IIM issues (.7); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding status (.3); update
phone log regarding letter and calls (.2).
Review draft legislation received from DOJ following legislative counsel's
revisions and emails regarding it (.8); review information and emails from
negotiation of settlement agreement regarding the legislation and telephone

2/5/2010 |Dorris, William E. 21 1,375.50|conference with Mr. Gingold regarding draft legislation (.6); review draft short
form notice to the class of settlement and email to Mr. Rempel of my concerns
regarding it (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Rempel regarding draft short
form (.3).

2/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 12 $ 1,110.00 ggggirence call Harper, Guilder, Rempel, Levitas, et al re legislative settlement

2/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Review/comment new draft implementation legislation.

2/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Telcoms. Hill staff re legislative settlement issues.

2/5/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Dorris re same.

2/5/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Conference calls Harper, Rempel re same; draft legislation.

2/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Harper re same.

2/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Discussion Rempel re same.

2/5/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same.

2/5/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re draft legislation; budget issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 52 $ 4,810.00 [names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/5/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 24 768.00 Copfergnce call anld draft and revise cgrregpondence to discuss and review
legislative counsel's draft of Cobell legislation.
Discussions on provisions to mandate payment of funds for scholarship (.7);

2/5/2010 [Harper, Keith 2.8 1,400.00 |telephone conference with co-counsel on settlement implementation (1.2);

discussions with Mr. Hauck (.4); email discussion on notice .(5).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Email exchanges with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Guilder and Mr. Harper regarding
"discretion of secretary" in revised language of redline legislation (.7); email
2/5/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 19 $ 1,377.50 exchar_1ges _vvit_h_Mr. Gingold, Mr. Loving, Ms. Cobell and o_ther_CobeII team
regarding significance of FY11 budget language and possible impact on
legislation; telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding budget language
and impact on procedures in Senate and House (1.2).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.2); communication with
2/5/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 1.8 $ 711.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.3); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.3).
2/5/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 29 $ 204.00 Par.ticipate in ponference call (1.2); conference with Mr. Loving on possible
legislative options to enact settlement (1).
2/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |Review short form notice.
2/5/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 |Prep for meeting w/ notice plan.
2/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Review long form notice.
2/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [CC w/ team re update and tasks.
2/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Disc w/ DG re issues between settlement agreement and draft leg.
2/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Meet w/ KK re notice plan.
Conference call on status of legislation (1.2); discussions with Mr. Harper
regarding legislative issues (.4).); email from Mr. Gingold regarding Ms. Cobell
2/5/2010 |Smith, David C. 1.9 $ 950.00|and call from Mr. Wilkins on legislative issues (.1); emails with Ms. Kinsella
regarding notice issues and languages for DVD (.1); emails with Ms. Kinsella
regarding tribal meeting in Albuquerque (.1).
Telephone conference with Mr. Charnes regarding legislative language on the
2/6/2010 |Dorris, William E. 0.4 $ 262.00|Secretary's discretion to transfer funds to the scholarship funds (.3); email to Mr.
Gingold (.1).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
2/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 3.2 $ 2,960.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Review Charnes/DOJ email (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Charnes
2/7/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 1.1 $ 797.50|regarding legislation and contact with DOJ; email memo to Cobell team
regarding Charnes/Pirelli contact and follow up (.8).
2/7/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.1 $ 50.00|Review e-mail from Mr. Charnes regarding legislative issues.
Emails regarding Congressional contacts on legislative effort (.3); review
2/8/2010 |Dorris, William E. 0.7 $ 458.50|legislative language on the scholarship fund and revise email to Tom Perrelli
regarding it (.4).
2/8/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.1 $ 1,017.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.
2/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 |Telcoms. Dorris re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

2/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Harper re same.

2/8/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. Levitas re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.4 $ 8,695.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/8/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.9 $ 288.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

2/8/2010 |Harmala, Robert 1.0 $ 525.00|Cobell strategy call (.8); follow up with Senate staff (.2).

2/8/2010 |Harper, Keith 1.2 $ 600.00 [Telephone conference with co-counsel; email to Tom Perrelli.
Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding Ms. Cobell contact with
Baucus' office; preparation for Barrasso meeting (.5); prepare for and participate

2/8/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 1.3 $ 942.50(in conference call with Mr. Smith, Mr. Dorris, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Loving, Mr. Harmala and Mr. Guilder regarding Cobell legislation (.5); review
Harper/Pirrelli email (.3).

2/8/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 29 $ 869.00 Commgnication with Congressiona! staff on Cobell settler"nenF (.6);_ legislative
and political research on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (1.6).

2/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |Edit DOJ communication.

2/8/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 [CC w/ BD re notices.

2/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ Shannon re notices.

2/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Disc w/ DG re notices and outreach.

2/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re status and leg update.

2/8/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 |CC w/ GCG re plfs' counsel outreach.

2/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Review short form notice.

2/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 [Review long form notice.
Conduct legal research concerning reasonableness of attorney fees and

2/8/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 6.0 $ 1,770.00(incentive awards and prepare legal memorandum to Mr. Dorris concerning
same.
E-mail from Ms. Kinsella regarding outreach to beneficiaries at Gathering of

. . Nations (.2); e-mails with Mr. Rempel regarding outreach (.2); discussions

2/8/2010 | Smith, David C. 0.7 $ 350.00 regarding clarification letter with Mr. Perrelli and review of e-mail to Mr. Perrelli
(.3).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding case
status and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
case status and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary and

2/9/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.3 $ 305.50]return call (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); receive
call from beneficiary regarding case status (.1); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding case status and return call (.2); update phone log
regarding calls (.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

2/9/2010 |Dorris, William E. 05 $ 32750 Conference call with team regarding legislative efforts and next steps in effort to
get the settlement agreement passed (.5).

2/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 03 $ 277 50 Telcom. Yang, SG's office re further extension of date to respond to petition due
to Congressional delay.

2/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 07 $ 647 50 ggg\zrence call Dorris, Harmala, Harper, Loving, Rempel, Levitas, Guilder re

2/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re same; response to opposition efforts.

2/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Harper re same; ITMA.

2/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Levitas re House issue.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.5 $ 8,787.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/9/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.5 160.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

2/9/2010 |Harmala, Robert 10 525,00 Strategy call (.5); emails to Sen. Staff (.3); SCIA draft of DOJ legislative
language (.2).
Review re-drafted redline legislation and compare to settlement agreement (.3);

2/9/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 09 $ 652.50 conference call W.Ith Mr. Gingold, Mr..Gunder, M.r. Rempel, Mr. Dorris, Mr.
Harmala, Mr. Loving and Mr. Harper in preparation for telephone conference
(.5); follow-up call with Mr. Gingold regarding House of Representatives (.1).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.7); communication with

2/9/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 11 $ 434.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.2); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.2).

2/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ team re leg and status.

2/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.2 $ 1,440.00 |Prep, draft outreach plan.

2/9/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 45 $ 1,327.50 F:ondupt legal research concerning rgasonable'ness of attor.ney fee requests and
incentive awards (4.3); conference with Mr. Raider concerning same (.2).

. ) Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation (.5); multiple e-mails

2/9/2010 ~|Smith, David C. 1.2 $ 600.00 regarding legislation and Barrasso conference with Ms. Cobell (.7).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding status of case

2/10/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.5 $ 117.50((.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from
beneficiary regarding new address (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

2/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re Barrasso issues.

2/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Harper re northwest tribal issue.

2/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Smith re above.

2/10/2010 |Harmala, Robert 15 $ 787 50 (Sg[tlement background material to Sen. Staff (.9); Telephone call with Sen. Staff
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

2/10/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 08 580.00 Review emails regarding legislation, Barrasso meeting and House committee
contacts.

2/10/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 20 790.00 Commumcatlon with Congress_lonal staff on Cobell sgttle_ment_ (2); legislative and
political research on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (1).

2/10/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 6.4 1,888.00 F:ondgct legal research concerning reasonableness of 'aFtorney fee requests and
incentive awards and compose memorandum summarizing same (6.4).

2/10/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.2 100.00|E-mails regarding legislation.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding land issues (.2);

2/11/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.2 282.00|receive second call from beneficiary regarding same (.3); update phone log
regarding calls (.1); tend to maintenance of toll-free phone line (.6).

2/11/2010 |Dorris, William E. 0.7 $ 458.50|Review memo from Mr. Schulof on attorneys' fees.

2/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.

2/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Conference call Harper, Ms. Cobell re same.

2/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Smith et al. re same.

2/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Levitas re same.

2/11/2010 |Harmala, Robert 10 $ 525 00 Telephone conference with Cobell team regarding legislative approval of
settlement.

2/11/2010 |Harper, Keith 10 500.00 Telephone conference on Cobell settlement implementation and email
exchanges.
Conference call with Cobell team regarding legislation (1.0); telephone

2/11/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 17 1,232.50 conference Wlth Mr. C_slngoIFj reggrdlng legislation an_d procedures for attaching
amendment to jobs bill (.2); email exchanges regarding Senator Barrasso and
meeting with Ms. Cobell; status of Baucus legislation and Cobell legislation (.5).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.0); communication with

2/11/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 2.1 829.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.3); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.8).

2/11/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Review dissenting propaganda.

2/11/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |CC w/ team re leg status.

2/11/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [CC w/ EC, DG re beneficiary dissent.

2/11/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 25 $ 1,125.00 |Prep, draft outreach plan. Incl research.
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Post Settlement Fees
Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation (1); review draft of jobs bill
(.3); email to Mr. Harmala regarding conference call (.1); begin review of memo
from Mr. Schulof (.7); respond to inquiry from Ms. West regarding TV spot on
2/11/2010 |Smith, David C. 3.6 $ 1,800.00|Alaskan and Arizona lands (.2); discussions with Mr. Gingold (.4); discussions
regarding conference call between Ms. Cobell and Senator Barrasso (.5);
discussions regarding Cobell beneficiary line (.3); email and response to Mr.
Loving regarding Republican signatories on letter of support (.1).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
2/12/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.5 $ 117.50((.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.1); update phone log
regarding calls (.1).
2/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Loving, Ms. Cobell re Senate R's.
2/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. TB re probate/settlement issues.
2/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Dorris re fee petition; class counsel.
2/12/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Conference call Loving, Levitas, Guilder, Pearl, Harmala, Rempel re Hill issues.
2/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call Rempel, Ms. Cobell re Crow issues; class comments.
2/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.
2/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcom. Levitas re same.
2/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Smith re same.
2/12/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.0 $ 320.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.
2/12/2010 |Harmala, Robert 10 $ 525 00 Telephone conference with Cobell team regarding legislative approval of
settlement.
. Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.7); discussion with John
2/12/2010 |Harper, Keith 2.2 $ 1,100.00 Dossett (.2): draft FAQs (1.3).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.0); communication with
2/12/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 2.8 $ 1,106.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1.5); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.3).
2/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Disc w/ DG re outreach and class communications.
2/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 |CC w/ KH and Indians re class communications.
2/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [Coordinate e-mailing and creation of ask Elouise letter (multiple CC)
2/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.0 $ 450.00 |CC w/ team re legislative front and status.
2/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Draft, edit open Elouise letter.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

2/12/2010

Smith, David C.

3.4

1,700.00

Conference call regarding legislation (1); telephone conversation with Judge
Robertson (.3); telephone conversation with Mr. Gingold regarding legislation
(.6); telephone conversation with Mr. Harper regarding legislation (.4); telephone
conversation with Mr. Dorris (.1); email to Mr. Rempel (.2); email to Mr. Harmala
(.2); emails with Mr. Gingold regarding issues on legislation in Indian country and
guestions from Senator Barrasso (.4); email with Ms. West regarding languages
for DVD on settlement (.1); emails with Mr. Taylor regarding support from
Senator regarding legislation (.1).

2/13/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.8

740.00

Telcom. TB re scope of class; formula; opposition issues.

2/13/2010

Gingold, Dennis

7.4

6,845.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/13/2010

Smith, David C.

0.1

50.00

Review e-mail from Mr. Gingold regarding conversation with beneficiary.

2/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

5.8

5,365.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/15/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

0.9

211.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding case
status and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
land issue and return call (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1); prepare
memos to Mr. Smith and Mr. Harper regarding caller issues (.1); tend to
Beneficiary telephone line maintenance matters (.2).

2/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

15

1,387.50

Discussion with Rempel re Russell/Zuni/ITMA opposition issues; legislative
issues.

2/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.2

1,110.00

Review/revise Ask Elouise open letter to class.

2/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Dorris re class communication issues.

2/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

AR B

462.50

Telcom ally re issue in New Mexico.

2/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

7.7

©

7,122.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Telcom. Levitas re Hill issues.

2/15/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.2

384.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues (.8); draft and revise Ask Elouise
letter (.4).

2/15/2010

Harmala, Robert

1.2

630.00

Telephone conference with Cobell team regarding legislative strategy for
settlement approval.

2/15/2010

Harper, Keith

4.3

2,150.00

Implement settlement including edit "Ask Elouise" letter (2.5); respond to notice
issue (1.0); telephone conference on implementing legislation with lobbyist and
co-counsel (.8).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Review draft letter from Ms. Cobell to class members ("Ask Elouise") and
revisions to "Ask Elouise" letter (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Rempel

2/15/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 23 1,667.50 regarding "Ask Elouise" letter (.3);.further revisions and edits (.1); pre_paration for
conference call, conference call with Mr. Pearl, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Loving, Mr.
Harper, Mr. Dorris, Mr. Smith, Mr. Gingold and Mr. Guilder; follow up call with
Mr. Gingold (1.6).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.5); communication with

2/15/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.7 2,646.50(Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (4.6); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.6).

2/15/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 25 800.00 Participa_te in cqnfergnce call (1.5); conference with Mr. Loving (.9);
communicate with Hill staff (.1).

2/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ EL re Ask Elouise letter.

2/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [Disc w/ DG re outreach and Ask Elouise.

2/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 |CC w/ EC re Ask Elouise letter.

2/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.4 $ 630.00 [CC w/ team re status of leg and outreach.

2/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Draft, edit Ask Elouise letter.

2/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.0 $ 1,350.00 |Draft, edit letter to top 300 beneficiaries.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.4);
receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.2); receive call from

2/16/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.4 329.00|beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); update phone log regarding calls (.1);
prepare memo to Mr. Harper and Mr. Smith regarding settlement status (.1);
tend to maintenance of toll-free line (.3).

2/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference call Harper, Ms. Cobell, Rempel re settlement issues.

2/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel re legislative issues.

2/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Harper re same.

2/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Harper, Rempel re supp appropriation bill.

2/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Conference call Loving, Ms. Cobell re same.

2/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference Harper, Rempel re same.

2/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Pearl re leadership views; appropriations bill.

2/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Harper re above.

2/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re same; ITMA rebuttal.

2/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Dorris re same.

2/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Levitas re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 3.6 $ 3,330.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/16/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 13 416.00 Conference call to discuss legislative issues (1); review draft letters to ensure

accurate dissemination of information regarding settlement (.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Telephone conference regarding legislative approval of settlement (.8);
2/16/2010 |Harmala, Robert 21 1,102.50 telephor)e.calls with Dept.. of Interior (.3); review OMB supplemental .
appropriation request (.2); telephone calls to House and Senate appropriators
(.8).
Edit FAQ sheet (2.8); telephone conference on implementing settlement with Mr.
. Gingold, Ms. Cobell and others (1.2); call Gay Kingman to discuss possible GP
2/16/2010 - Harper, Keith 4.6 2,300.00 support and certain misinformation (.5); set up call with Kingman and GPTCA
(.1).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.4); communication with
2/16/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 5.4 2,133.00({Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (2.5); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (1.5).
Participate in conference call (1.4); conference with Mr. Loving regarding next
. steps and presentation of issues to Hill staff (2); review supplemental
2/16/2010 - |Pearl, Michael Alexander 7.4 2,368.00 appropriation (1.5); revise and review the "Ask Elouise" letter (2.3); follow up
with Hill meeting requests (.2).
2/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |CC w/ DOJ re outreach and database work.
2/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Review tribal information for Congressional request.
2/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 14 $ 630.00 |CC w/ team re same.
2/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [CC w/ EC, DG, KH (multiple) re leg process and outreach.
2/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.8 $ 1,710.00 |Draft, edit Ask Elouise letter. Finalize w/ GCG.
Meeting with Mr. Gingold (.7); conference call regarding legislation (1.2); e-mails
. . with Mr. Loving regarding beneficiaries in various states for legislative purposes
2/16/2010 Smith, David C. 46 2,300.00 (.8); discussions with court (.2); review/revise ask Ms. Cobell letter (.8); e-mails
regarding contacts with legislators and status of legislation (.9).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);
review phone message from beneficiary (.1); receive additional call from
beneficiary regarding land issues (.7); receive call from beneficiary regarding
settlement status (.1); review phone message from beneficiary and return call
2/17/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 23 540.50 (.1); draft memo to Mr. Smnh .and Mr. quper rggardlr!g her issues (.2); reweyv
phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.1);
review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1); receive and review
letter from beneficiary regarding Cobell case information (.1); prepare response
regarding same (.4); update phone log regarding calls/letters (.2); tend to toll-
free phone line maintenance (.1).
2/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 555.00 [Conference call all hands re legislative issues.
2/17/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 4.2 3,885.00 |Review/revise rebuttal Q's & A's re settlement.
2/17/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 277.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

2/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Levitas re legislative issues.

2/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

3.1

2,867.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/17/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.9

608.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues (.7); draft and revise Q & A
response to NCAI questions (.9); discuss to whom certain information regarding
settlement will be provided, including what to share with SPOA for tribal support

(3).

2/17/2010

Harmala, Robert

2.0

1,050.00

Cobell team conf call (1); telephone calls to Dept. of Interior (.4); House Natural
Resources Committee (.6).

2/17/2010

Harper, Keith

5.6

2,800.00

Telephone conference on settlement implementation (1.0); telephone
conference with Montana Wyoming Tribes on Cobell settlement (debate with
Majel Russell and Mary Zuni) (1.2); telephone conference with Great Plain Tribal
Chairman's Association (1.1); call with Marshall Matz regarding Lower Brule (.4);
review and revise FAQ sheet (.9) and review draft of GPTCA resolution (.7); call
with Chris Mansour (.3).

2/17/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

1.7

1,232.50

Email exchange with Mr. Harmala regarding new sub-committee chairman on
DOI appropriations; email information to Cobell team (.4); preparation for
conference call, conference call with Mr. Pearl, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Loving, Mr.
Harper, Mr. Dorris, Mr. Smith, Mr. Gingold and Mr. Guilder; follow up with Mr.
Gingold regarding conference call (1.3).

2/17/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

5.6

2,212.00

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.0); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (3.2); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (1.4).

2/17/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

55

1,760.00

Monitor call with Great Plains Tribal Chairman's Association (2); conference with
Mr. Harper and Mr. Loving (1); participate in conference call with team (.5);
correspond with Senate staff (.2); enter meeting requests with Senators for Ms.
Cobell (.3); draft resolution for the GPTCA (1.3); and draft a short briefing paper
on the Settlement (.2).

2/17/2010

Raider, Ron L.

0.6

Review and analyze incentives to class representative case law.

2/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.4

180.00

CC w/ team re status.

2/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.0

450.00

Disc w/ DG re same.

2/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

14

630.00

Follow up w/ Ask Elouise letter and coordinate review/analysis.

2/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.0

900.00

Review comments to Ask Elouise letter.

2/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

5.3

PR |R|B P

2,385.00

Draft, edit questions/answers for outreach.

2/17/2010

Schulof, Daniel G.

11

324.50

Conduct legal research concerning incentive awards and agreements to provide
incentive awards (1.1).

55




Ca

hiPERePAaRR

Elowse%ep

I'|_|y Jel;/)vglﬁ Lgpc%][

LS PGl LOR/ 1 U3 B AR DRI )

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Conference call on legislation (1); discussions regarding calls with beneficiaries

2/17/2010 |Smith, David C. 2.2 1,100.00((.2); review/revise questions and answers for Indian Country regarding
legislation (1).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding

2/18/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 05 117.50 settlement and return call (.2)5 review phone message frpm benef!mary regarding
settlement and return call (.1); prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding
beneficiary's call (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

2/18/2010 |Dorris, William E. 09 589.50 Meeting with and emails to M_r. Glngold discussing points made by Mr. Schulof's
memo on attorneys fees and incentive awards (.9).

2/18/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Discussion Rempel re class issues.

2/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.7 $ 1,572.50 |Conference call all hands re legislative issues.

2/18/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Review/revise draft letter to 300 class members, explaining terms of settlement.

2/18/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Meet with Loving re Hill issues.

2/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re ITMA opposition; Hill issues; NCAI.

2/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re same.

2/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 |Discussion Pearl re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 5.7 $ 5,272.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Cobell settlement implementation telephone conference (1.4); call with Ms.

. Cobell (.9); call with Mr. Gingold regarding settlement (.4); telephone conference

2/18/2010 - Harper, Keith 53 2,650.00 with Mr. Harmala and Mr. Loving (lobbyists) to discuss prospects of settlement
bill (.9); prepare and finalize GPTCA resolution of support (1.7).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.8); communication with

2/18/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 5.6 2,212.00({Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (3); legislative and political research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.8).
Draft GPTCA resolution (2.5); continue working on materials for explaining the

2/18/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 8.0 2.560.00 Settlement (3.5); correspond VYIth C.ongressmnal staff in arranging meetings with
Senators and Senate staff (.2); participate and prepare for Cobell team
conference call (1.8).

2/18/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ EL re ask Elouise letter.

2/18/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ DOJ re outreach and FTI product.

2/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ various re top 300 letter.

2/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re legislation and status.

2/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 06 $ 270.00 Coordinate preparation and distribution of top 300 letter (incl cc w/ GCG -

multiple).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

2/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Disc w/ DG re legislation and status.

2/18/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 2.3 $ 1,035.00 |Draft, edit version 2 of Ask Elouise.

2/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.2 $ 1,440.00 |Draft, finalize top 300 letter.

. Receipt and review Status Report, and e-mail to litigation team for review;

2/18/2010 - |Roth, Katie 01 $ “|update CRAF pleadings file with same.

2/18/2010 |Smith. David C. 10 $ 500.00 Confer.ence_ call vvjth co-pounsel regarding legislative status (.8); e-mail
regarding discussions with Senator McCain (.2).

2/19/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 03 $ 61.50 Review informat_ion regarding committee reassignment from Mr. Levitas and
research regarding same.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding address change
(.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding status (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); receive and review letter from

2/19/2010 - |Burns, Joseph V. 1.0 $ 235.00 beneficiari regarding Cobell informastio)n (.1); draft response letter to beneficiary
regarding same (.2); update phone log regarding calls and letter (.1); file
maintenance (.1).
Emails regarding upcoming Native American group meetings at which we may

2/19/2010 |Dorris, William E. 2.7 $ 1,768.50|need to make beneficiary presentations (.4); review cases regarding incentive
awards to class representatives (2.3).

2/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Conference call all hands re legislative issues.

2/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.9 $ 1,757.50 |Review/revise summary of issues/terms to the Hill.

2/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Review/revise draft Il, current Ask Elouise letter.

2/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcom. Harper re House issues.

2/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.

2/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Levitas re legislative settlement issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/19/2010 |(Gingold, Dennis 6.2 $ 5,735.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Draft and revise one page Congressional support letter (1.3); draft and revise
draft letter to senators for tribes to send as support (1.2); discuss edits to both
documents with Mr. Pearl and Mr. Loving and draft and revise correspondence

2/19/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 45 $ 1,440.00 rggarding same two letters (.2); confereqce call to disguss Iegisllative issues (1);
discuss with Mr. Pearl and Ms. Munson issues regarding how tribes can support
settlement and how we can facilitate such support (.4); draft and revise answers
to certain questions raised by NCAI regarding Cobell settlement in particular
distribution (.4).
Telephone conference on settlement implementation (2 calls) (1.5); telephone

2/19/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.6 $ 1,800.00 |conference with Mr. Harmala and Congressional staffer (.6); review FAQ sheet
and provide edits (1.5).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.0); communication with
. Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1); legislative and political research on
2/19/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.1 $ 2,409.50 . S . ) ) :
Congressional calendar and legislative bills (1.2); set up meetings for client
(2.9).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); draft tribal support
. letter (1.5); draft briefing materials for explaining Settlement (3.5); conference
2/19/2010 - |Pearl, Michael Alexander 9.0 $ 2,880.00 with I\/I(r. G)ingold, Mr. G?Jilder, and Mr. Lon/ing rggarding next(step))s and efforts to
pass legislation for the settlement (2.5).
2/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |CC w/ EL re ask Elouise letter.
2/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 11 $ 495.00 |Disc w/ DG re legislation and status.
2/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [CC w/ team re misc and status.
2/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 $ 810.00 [Meet w/ contractor and discuss status and application.
2/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.4 $ 1,980.00 |finalize top 300 letter.
2/19/2010 |Smith. David C. 14 $ 200.00 Confer.ence cal! with (Eo-couns.ellregarding status (1); conference with Mr. Harper
regarding meetings with beneficiaries (.4).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: conference with Mr. Smith regarding status of
2/20/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.3 $ 70.50|Congressional legislation required by settlement (.1); review Cobell settlement
website and prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding same (.2).
2/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 15 $ 1,387.50 Providg wr'ittep responses to TB inquiries regarding legislative status/land
consolidation issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
2/20/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 5.2 $ 4,810.00 [names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
2/20/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.5 $ 1,750.00 |Travel to Las Vegas for ITMA to discuss Cobell settlement.
Communication with Congressional staff on Cobell settlement and legislative
2/20/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 4.0 $ 1,580.00|bills (2); communication with Post-settlement team members on Advocacy
efforts (2).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
2/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 52 $ 4,810.00 [names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
202212010 |Applegate, Alexis 06 $ 123.00 Review media coverage and dockets' per Mr. Levitas' request (.2); review
committee memberships per Mr. Levitas' request (.4).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review new status letter (Ask Elouise), per Mr. Smith
2/22/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.3 $ 70.50((.1); conference with Mr. Smith regarding same (.1); review letter from Mr. Smith
regarding status of proposed settlement-related legislation (.1).
2/22/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Revise draft V, summary for Hill.
2/22/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Conference call all hands re legislative issues.
2/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Discussion Rempel re NCAI Q & A letter re settlement terms.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

2/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. TB re status of legislation.

2/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re above.

2/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.5 $ 2,312.50 [Meet with Ms. Cobell re all issues.

2/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Harper re further extension of settlement agreement.

2/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

2/22/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.8 $ 256.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

2/22/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.8 $ 420.00|Cobell team strategy call.

212212010 |Harper, Keith a1 $ 2.050.00 Meet with variqus tribal Iea_ders regarding settlemgnt (3.8); telephone conference
on settlement implementation (.2); email to Salt River (.1).
Telephone conference with Mr. Loving regarding Congressional contacts and
review Congressional talking points (.5); telephone conference with Mr. Gingold

2/22/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 1.2 870.00(regarding follow-up on conference call and discussions of Rahal meeting and
agenda (.4); telephone call with Mr. Harmala regarding arrangements and
agenda for Rahal meeting (.3).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.2); communication with

2/22/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 9.0 3,555.00({Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1.9); Setup meetings on Capitol Hill
with client (5.9).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); finalize Settlement

2/22/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 7.0 2,240.00|briefing papers (.5); revise schedule for meetings with Elouise and Senators and
Staff (1); conference with Mr. Loving regarding legislative strategy (4).

2/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.1 $ 495.00 |CC w/ team re status.

2/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 [Meet w/ team, EC re Congressional meetings (various).

2/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.2 $ 1,440.00 |Ask Elouise letter. Finalize. Transmit. Follow up.

2/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Finalize multiple page Q&A Doc.

2/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Meet w/ EC, DG re misc and congressional meetings.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1); review phone

2/23/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 192 28200 message from beneficiary rggarding notice/waiver al.nd rgturn call (.1); review
phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1); review message from
beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.2); review letter from
beneficiary regarding settlement registration (.1); prepare memo to Mr. Smith
regarding same (.1); update phone log regarding calls and letter (.1).

2/23/2010 |Dorris, William E. 03 196.50 Telephone conference with Mr._Smith rega_rding reports on Congressional
meetings today and plans for trip to Browning, Montana.

2/23/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.0 925.00 [Draft judgment fund memo for Hill.

2/23/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.4 1,295.00 |Meet with Ms. Cobell, Rempel re all issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

2/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Meet with Pearl, Levitas, Rempel re Hill settlement issues.

2/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above; extension of settlement agreement.

2/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call Harper, Rempel re extension of settlement agreement.

2/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Harper re legislative settlement issues.

2/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Smith re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.3 $ 6,752.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Conference call to discuss legislative issues and prep for meetings with

2/23/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.6 192.00(Senators (.5); draft and revise correspondence with Mr. Rempel regarding Q & A
NCAI document that addresses misinformation regarding settlement (.1).

2/23/2010 |Harmala, Robert 27 1.417.50 Cobell team strategy call (.9); mgetlng with Sen. Reid and E. Cobell (1.7);
telephone call Mr. Harper regarding same (.1).

. Telephone conference on settlement implementations with co-counsel (.4); meet

2/23/2010 Harper, Keith 45 2,250.00 with tribal leaders at Res2010 to discuss Cobell settlement (4.1).

2/23/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 90 3.555.00 P{irtlupate on Posf( Settlement team Cobell call (1.1); Attended meetings with
client on Capitol Hill. (7.9).

2/23/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 85 $ 2.720.00 Atte_nc_i meetings on the Hill with Elouise, Mr. Loving, and Mr. Harmala (6);
participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (2.5).

2/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |CC w/ KH, DOJ, DG (multiple calls) re Court outreach and extension.

2/23/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [CC w/ team re congressional meetings.

2/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.9 $ 1,755.00 |Meet w/ EC, various re debrief from meetings (multiple).

2/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 5.5 $ 2,475.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).
Conference call with co-counsel regarding status of legislation (1); telephone
conversation with Mr. Gingold regarding Ms. Cobell's conference with Senate

2/23/2010 |Smith, David C. 19 950.00 majority Ie_ader_(.3); telephpne conv_ersatlon with Mr_. Glngold (..1); telephone
conversation with Mr. Dorris regarding status of legislation (.1); telephone
conversation with Mr. Harper (.2); telephone conversation with Mr. Charnes
regarding conversation with Mr. Perrelli (.2).

2/24/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.2 41.00|Conference with team members regarding Supreme Court brief.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review memo from Mr. Smith regarding settlement
legislation and forward updated phone log regarding same (.1); receive call from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.1); review phone message from beneficiary

2/24/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.1 258.50(regarding case status and return call (.3); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.1); update phone log
regarding calls (.1); draft letter response to beneficiary regarding settlement
legislation (.3); file maintenance (.1).

2/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.0 $ 1,850.00 |Meet with Loving, Rempel, Ms. Cobell on all issues.

2/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. Dorris re above.

2/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 (Meet with Ms. Cobell re same.

21242010 |Gingold, Dennis 04 $ 370.00 Discuss with Levitas Hill issues; Kirschman proposed modification to extended
settlement agreement.

2/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

2/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Respond to inquiry from Hill staff.

2/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Smith re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/24/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 8.0 $ 7,400.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Meet and conference with Cobell team regarding legislative issues and Elouise's

2/24/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.9 608.00|schedule to visit on the Hill (1); discuss issues related thereto with Mr. Gingold,
Mr. Pearl, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Loving (.9).

2/24/2010 |Harmala, Robert 3.0 1,575.00 Cobelllteam strategy call (1); meeting with Mr. Levitas and House Resources
Committee (2).

21242010 |Harper, Keith 71 3.550.00 ITMA Meeting make pr.esen.tation and att(.and (Q.S); telephone conference with
co-counsel (.2); discussion with Hauck (.2); email exchange (.2).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1); communication with

2/24/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.0 2,370.00({Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.3); attended meetings on Hill with
client (4.7).
Attend meetings on the Hill (2.5); conference with Mr. Loving (1); conference

2/24/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 7.5 2,400.00(with Mr. Loving regarding letter from Hill (2); participate and prepare for Cobell
team conference call (2).

2/24/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Disc congressional status w/ EL, DG.

2/24/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ contractors re on the ground verification of posting.

2/24/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [CC w/ team re congressional meetings.

2/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |CC w/ EL, RH, JL re congressional status.

2/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 |Follow up w/ GCG re various, incl outreach and ask Elouise letters.

2/24/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 3.4 $ 1,530.00 |Meet w/ EC, various re debrief from meetings (multiple).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

2/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 5.0 2,250.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

2/24/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 4.2 1,239.00|Conduct legal research concerning reasonableness of attorney fee awards (4.2).
Review research memorandum from Mr. Schuloff (1); email regarding research
to Mr. Schuloff (.2); email to Mr. Dorris (.1); review inquiry from beneficiary
regarding registration with claims administrator (.1); response to Mr. Burns (.1);
email regarding beneficiary issue to Mr. Gingold and Mr. Rempel (.1); telephone

2/24/2010 |Smith, David C. 3.3 1,650.00|conference with Mr. Gingold regarding legislative issues (.4); email to Mr. Dorris
regarding update on legislation (.1); review inquiry from Rep. Doc Hastings
regarding status of legislation and email to Mr. Rempel on response (.2);
discussions regarding petition for certiorari and work on fee petition (.2); call with
co-counsel on status of legislation (.8).

2/25/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 06 123.00 Research regarding deaj[h rates aqd conferences with Mr. Guilder, Mr. Levitas,
Mr. Rempel and Mr. Loving regarding same.

Cobell Beneficiary Line: conference with Mr. Smith and Ms. Murray regarding

2/25/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.2 47.00 mainte_nance _qf phone log of ben_eficiary c_a!ls (.1); conference with Mr. Smith
regarding mailing address for claims administrator for settlement registration
(.1).

2/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.1 $ 1,017.50 |Conference call all hands re legislative issues.

2/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re House issues; above; extension.

2/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 01 $ 92.50 Telcom. Yang, SG's off.ice re further extension of date to respond to petition due
to continuing Congressional delay.

2/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Pearl re Hill.

2/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Discussion Loving re extension.

2/25/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Discussion with Levitas re WH.

2/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom potential depository band re distribution of settlement funds.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

2/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.3 $ 7,677.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

Conference call to discuss legislative issues (1); draft and revise NCAI resolution
(2); draft and revise response to question from Rep. Doc Hastings on House

2/25/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 5.3 1,696.00|Resources Committee (1); draft and revise correspondence regarding questions
from Senate Indian Affairs Comm (1); discuss same with Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving,
and Mr. Gingold (.3).

2/25/2010 |Harmala, Robert 21 1,102.50 Cobell team strategy call (1.2); telephone calls to House and Senate

Appropriations staff (.9).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
. Return from Las Vegas after ITMA conference (6.1); call regarding extension
2/25/2010 |Harper, Keith 6.5 $ 3,250.00 (.2); email exchange on ITMA response and NCAI resolution (.2).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.4); communication with
2/25/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 74 $ 2.923.00 Congress!onal staff on Cobell sgttlement_(3); Iegls_latlve :_;md po_lltlcal research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.7); discussions with Post
Settlement team members (2.3).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); conference with
2/25/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 4.0 $ 1,280.00|Mr. Guilder and Mr. Loving on next steps to take regarding legislative strategy
(2.5).
2/25/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [Research Indian mortality rates for congress.
2/25/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [Disc congressional status w/ DG.
2/25/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.4 $ 630.00 [CC w/ team re congressional meetings.
2/25/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Draft, edit answers to Congressional letter.
2/25/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.7 $ 2,115.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).
2/25/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 14 $ 413.00 Conduct legal research for Mr. Smith concerning issues related to attorney fee
requests (1.4).
Emails with Mr. Gingold regarding inquiries from Rep. Hastings of Washington
(.1); discussions with Mr. Burns regarding beneficiary calls (.2); emails to Mr.
. . Rempel regarding names and addresses of beneficiaries for Garden City (.1);
2/25/2010 | Smith, David C. 0.9 $ 450.00 emails with Ms. Lamon regarding trip for Ms. Cobell (.1); e-mail regarding
beneficiary call (.1); e-mail to Mr. Charnes regarding call with Mr. Perrelli (.1);
discussions regarding extension on deadline (.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: create new phone log, per Mr. Smith (.1); review phone
2/26/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.5 $ 117.50|message from beneficiary regarding settlement status and return call (.2);
update phone log regarding call (.1); file maintenance (.1).
2/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.4 $ 1,295.00 |Conference call all hands re legislative settlement issues.
2/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcoms. Kirschman re "check box" issue vis-a-vis notice to class.
2/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcoms. Harper re same; all issues.
2/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 [Telcom. Smith re same; fee petition.
2/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. TB re status of settlement.
2/26/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Yang, SG's office re further extension of response to cert petition.
2/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 13 $ 1,202.50 Reweyv NCAI amicus brief in Cobell structural injunction decision re response to
NCAI issues.
2/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re above.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

2/26/2010

Gingold, Dennis

7.3

6,752.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/26/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

3.6

1,152.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues (1.4); draft and revise draft
resolution for NCAI support of Cobell legislation (1); discuss with Mr. Pearl and
Mr. Loving legislative issues including NCAI resolution (.8); draft and revise
correspondence regarding NCAI resolutions (.4).

2/26/2010

Harper, Keith

41

2,050.00

Telephone conference on settlement implementation with co-counsel (.6); call
from Mario Gonzalez and Patty Marks re: misinformation in Dakotas about
settlement (.8); review Emery article (.2); email exchange with Tim Giago (.6);
address media inquiries (.3); review and execute extension (.3); email exchange
with Ms. Cobell (.3); review and mark names of beneficiaries (.7); discuss NCAI
resolution (.3).

2/26/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

6.5

2,567.50

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.4); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1.5); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills to move Cobell on in case of
settlement extension (3.6).

2/26/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

6.5

2,080.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); address NCAI
resolution issue (2); conference with Mr. Loving and Mr. Levitas regarding
Monday meeting with Administration (3).

2/26/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.4

180.00

Disc congressional status w/ DG.

2/26/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.6

720.00

CC w/ team re congressional meetings.

2/26/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.3

1,035.00

Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

2/26/2010

Smith, David C.

1.6

800.00

Discussions regarding extension of settlement agreement (.2); calls to news
media regarding extension (.3); discussions with Mr. Loving regarding inquiries
from Representative from Washington regarding legislation (.2); discussions with
Mr. Charnes regarding call with Mr. Perrelli (.1); review/revise proposed support
for legislation for NCAI (.8).

2/27/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Yang, SG's office re 4/16 extension.

2/27/2010

Gingold, Dennis

8.7

8,047.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/27/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

3.0

1,185.00

Legislative and political research on Congressional calendar and legislative bills
for legislative vehicle to move Cobell settlement (3).

2/28/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.4

370.00

Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

2/28/2010

Gingold, Dennis

6.1

5,642.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

2/28/2010

Harper, Keith

0.8

400.00

Begin on talking points.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Review/revise responses to questions from Congress regarding settlement (.9);

2/28/2010 |Smith. David C. 6.6 3.300.00 work on respons.e t.o p03|.t|on paper on legislation set'fort'h in Native Sun
newspaper (5.3); discussions with Mr. Harper regarding issue sheet for Ms.
Cobell (.3); e-mails with Mr. Gingold regarding arrangements for Ms. Cobell (.1).

3/1/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.4 82.00|Review Treasury's status report per Mr. Levitas' request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status
(.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding status of settlement (.1); receive call
from beneficiary regarding settlement (.4); receive call from beneficiary regarding

3/1/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.4 329.00(land issues (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1);
review several phone messages from beneficiaries (.1); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement status (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement
status (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.2).

3/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Meet with Ms. Cobell, Levitas, Rempel, Pearl re WH meeting on settlement.

3/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Review/revise draft Ask Elouise letter # (3.

3/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 |Discussion Pearl re legislative settlement issues.

3/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re all issues.

3/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Meet with Elouise re same.

3/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Post mortem meeting on WH discussions with Ms. Cobell et al.

3/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Smith re response to op ed re settlement terms.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.5 $ 7,862.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/1/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 16 51200 Ret.urn call to beneﬂuary .(.2); Qraft and revise response to Native Sun editorials
(.4); draft and revise media article on settlement (1).

3/1/2010 |Harmala, Robert 3.0 1,575.00 Legislative strateg;_/ meeting with Cobell team (1); telephone calls to Senate and
House staff regarding settlement (2).
Attend NCAI Panel with Perelli and Tompkins (2.0); discussion of settlement

3/1/2010 |Harper, Keith 5.4 2,700.00 |issues with various tribal leaders at NCAI (2.4); telephone conference on
settlement implementation (.3); draft Ms. Cobell's remarks (.7).

. Ms. Cobell visit to Washington, DC. Escorted client to meetings in DC and

3/1/2010  |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.0 2,370.00 attended NCAI conference events with client (6).

3/1/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 35 1,120.00 Attend meeting with Ms. Co-bc_all a_nd Mr. Levitas (_2_); attend prep session with
Cobell team members (1.2); finalize paper explaining Settlement (.3).

3/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 225.00 [Disc w/ DG re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.9 $ 855.00 [Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.3 $ 1,035.00 |Meet w/ DS, EC, DG re same.

3/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 $ 1,080.00 |Draft, edit Ask Elouise letter.

3/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.4 $ 1,530.00 |Meet w/ team re legislative visits (multiple).
Email to Salt River regarding beneficiary outreach (.1); emails regarding
legislative efforts (1.2); meeting with Ms. Cobell (3.2); telephone conversation

3/1/2010 [Smith, David C. 8.7 4,350.00|with Mr. Levitas (.1); work on Emery response and emails with Native Sun (2.3);
review ask Elouise letter (.2); review/revise response to Rep. Hastings inquiry
(1.2); work on travel arrangements (.2), telephone call with court (.2).

3/2/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.2 41.00|Research regarding payment of petition for certiorari per Mr. Smith's request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review second modification of settlement agreement
(.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding land issues (.2); draft letter response
to beneficiary regarding settlement registration (.2); draft letter response to

3/2/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 15 352.50|beneficiary regarding Cobell information (.2); receive call from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement
status (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); update phone
log regarding calls and letters (.1); file maintenance (.1).

3/2/2010 |Dorris, William E. 04 262.00 C_o_nference_ with Mr. Gingold regarding update on legislative effort and plans for
visits to Indian Country.

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel re House issues.

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel re above.

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 15 $ 1,387.50 Discussigns_with litigation team re constructive notice issues/class
communications per R-23.

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 31 $ 2.867.50 Meet with M.s. Cobell, Guilder, Rempe.l, Loving re all issues; trips to Indian
country to discuss settlement terms with class.

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.0 $ 1,850.00 |Attend NCAI meeting re discussion of Cobell settlement.

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same.

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call Harper, Dorris re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 3.3 $ 3,052.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 92.50 |Telcom. Levitas re above.

3/2/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 43 1,376.00 Draft and .re\_/ise materials f_or media (3); conference call to discuss legislative
issues (1); discuss same with Mr. Loving and Mr. Pearl (.3).

3/2/2010 |Harmala, Robert 32 1,680.00 Legislative strategy meeting (1); Meeting with House Republicans regarding

settlement (2.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Telephone conference with co-counsel on settlement implementation (.6); draft
Ms. Cobell's remarks and finalize same (3.7); attend NCAI accompanying Ms.

3/2/2010 |Harper, Keith 7.1 3,550.00 |Cobell in speaking to General Assembly (1.5); meet with Executive Session to
discuss Cobell related resolutions (1.0); discussion with government on
settlement (.3).

. Ms. Cobell visit to Washington, DC. Escort client to meetings in DC and

3/2/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 50 $ 1,975.00 attended NCAI conference events with client (5).

3/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.6 $ 1,170.00 |Attend NCAI and disc settlement w/ leaders.

3/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.2 $ 1,890.00 \C/Z;r(iaorgisr;ate travel to IC. Follow up w/ contractors re same. (includes CC w/

3/2/2010 |Smith, David C. 11 550.00 Conferenc_:e caI_I with co-cqunsel regarding legislation (1); telephone
conversation with Mr. Levitas (.1).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.3); return call to beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding notice/waiver form (.2);

3/3/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 29 51700 return call to beneficiary (.1); review .phor.1e message from beneficiary reggr_ding
settlement status and return call (.1); review phone messages from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding settlement status and return call (.1); update phone log regarding calls
(.3).

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Levitas, Harmala, Guilder re legislative issues.

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom press re status of settlement.

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 04 $ 370.00 Telcoms. Harper re Hastings letter; Hill issues generally; outreach to South
Dakota class members.

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Rempel re South Dakota trip.

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 [Telcom. Pearl re same.

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Discussion with Rempel re same.

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. TB re status of settlement.

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re South Dakota trip.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.5 $ 7,862.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/3/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.1 352.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
3/3/2010 |Harmala, Robert 20 1,050.00 I(Sglslatlve strategy meeting (1); contact House and Senate Members and staff
Meeting with tribal leaders on Cobell settlement and NCAI resolution (2.4);
. telephone conference with co-counsel on settlement implementation (.8); review
3/3/2010  \Harper, Keith 48 2,400.00 "Ask Elouise" and discuss with Mr. Gingold (1.2); call from DOJ and White
House (.4).
Participate on KS team Cobell call (1.1); communication with Congressional staff
3/3/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 4.5 1,777.50|on Cobell settlement and follow up from meetings (3); legislative and political
research on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.4).
3/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 6.5 2.925.00 \(/Z:r?orglsr;ate travel to IC. Follow up w/ contractors re same. (includes CC w/
3/3/2010 |Smith, David C. 1.0 500.00|Conference call with co-counsel.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); review phone
3/4/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.0 235.00|message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.2); review
phone message from beneficiary regarding case information and return call (.2);
update phone log regarding calls (.2).
3/4/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 0.8 $ 416.00|Attend telephone conference with co-counsel.
3/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Meet with Kirschman on class notice "check box" issue.
3/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Harper re same; Senate issues.
3/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Holt re all issues.
3/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Pearl re South Dakota trip.
3/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Guilder re class issue.
3/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Dorris, Loving, Rempel, Guilder re Hill issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
3/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.2 $ 8,510.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues (1.1); review ITMA presentation
3/4/2010 | Guilder, Justin M. 3.0 960.00 materials and draft and revise responsive letters to SCIA on related issues (1.9).
3/4/2010 |Harmala, Robert 33 1,732.50 Legislative strategy meetings (1.1); meetings with Senate staff regarding Inouye
amendment (2.2).
Call with Indian Land Working Group and prepare for same (2.1); telephone
3/4/2010 |Harper, Keith 55 2.750.00 conference with Cobell legal team on settlement implementation (.6); draft

outline of testimony - talking points (2.3); arrange travel and meetings (.1);
review and discuss letter that Rep. Hastings issued (.4).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.1); communication with

3/4/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 9.4 3,713.00({Congressional staff on Cobell settlement; (7.8) legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills to pass settlement (.5).

. Continue revision and amendment of various Cobell materials (1); coordinate trip

3/4/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 7.5 2,400.00 to South Dakota with Mr. Rempel (6.5).

3/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 1,080.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 6.0 2.700.00 Coc_)rdmate travel to IC. Follow up w/ contractors re same. (includes CC w/
various)
Conference call with co-counsel and Ms. Cobell (1.1); discussions with staffer
regarding legislation, discussions regarding legislation with Sen. Burr's office

3/4/2010 |Smith, David C. 4.4 2,200.00((1.1); e-mails regarding legislation (.8); discussions regarding beneficiary
outreach (.7); e-mails regarding content of Ms. Cobell's statement to Congress
(.4); review final materials from Ms. Kinsella (.3).

3/5/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 04 82.00 R_ewew media coverage ar_1d dock_gts per Mr. _Leeras request (.2); conference
with Counsel Press regarding petition for certiorari (.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding

3/5/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.4 $ 94.00|settlement and return call (.2); update phone log regarding call (.1); file
maintenance for beneficiary correspondence (.1).

3/5/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 0.7 $ 364.00|Attend daily telephone conference with co-counsel.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Smith, Harper, Loving, Pearl re Hill issues.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.2 $ 3,885.00 |Prepare for South Dakota trip; review docs re TB's.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 15 $ 1,387.50 |Meet with Pearl, Loving re FEMA supp approps bill; other legislative options.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Loving re Barrasso issues.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. Levitas re Hill issues; tax extenders bill.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Pearl re South Dakota issues.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Pearl re South Dakota trip; issues.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Conference call Rempel, Loving re WH issues.

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Smith re Hill issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.7 $ 4,347.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/5/2010 |Harper, Keith o8 1,400.00 Telephone conference on settlement implementation (1.2); review materials from

DOJ (1.2); call from White House (.4).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

3/5/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

9.2

3,634.00

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call and individual conversations with
Post Settlement team members (5); communication with Congressional staff on
Cobell settlement (4); legislative and political research on Congressional
calendar and legislative bills (.2).

3/5/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

6.5

2,080.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); coordinate press
releases and scheduling of South Dakota trip (3.5); strategize and discuss plan
for meeting with Mr. Gingold (1.5).

3/5/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.3

1,035.00

Draft, edit Ask Elouise letter.

3/5/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

35

1,575.00

Coordinate travel to IC. Follow up w/ contractors re same. (includes CC w/
various)

3/5/2010

Smith, David C.

7.2

3,600.00

Conference call with co-counsel (1.1); discussions regarding outreach to
members at San Carlos Apache Tribe (.3); email to Ms. Cobell (.2); discussions
with Mr. Gingold (1.2); responses to Sen. Kyl's additional questions (1.4); email
regarding conversation with Senator Burr (.3); email to Mr. Gingold regarding
Emery editorial (.1); emails with Mr. Page regarding outreach to California
beneficiaries (.7); arrange beneficiary outreach (1.3); review revisions to Rep.
Hastings letter (.2); telephone call from Ms. Kinsella (.3); email to Mr. Rempel

(1).

3/6/2010

Gingold, Dennis

10.0

9,250.00

Travel to South Dakota; review docs en route; meet with TB's, Ms. Cobell, and
Pearl re settlement terms.

3/6/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

2.0

790.00

Communication with Congressional staff on Cobell settlement and
communication with post-settlement team members on advocacy efforts (2).

3/6/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

7.0

2,240.00

Travel to Rapid City to begin meetings with South Dakota tribes to educate them
on the mechanics of the Cobell Settlement.

3/6/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.4

180.00

CC w/ various re SD travel.

3/6/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

15

&P

675.00

CC w/ team

3/6/2010

Smith, David C.

3.8

1,900.00

Discussions with Ms. Cobell regarding trip to Montana and Hasting's response
(.2); discussions with Mr. Page regarding outreach in California (.3); telephone
conversation with Mr. Levitas (.2); discussions with Ms. Kinsella regarding
outreach in California (.3); review Justice's response to Hasting's letter and
suggest revisions (.7); prepare draft response to inquiry from Senator Kyl (2.1).

3/7/2010

Gingold, Dennis

14.4

13,320.00

Travel to and meet with Ms. Cobell, Pearl and class members on the Pine Ridge
Reservation.

3/7/2010

Harper, Keith

15

750.00

Draft talking points for meetings with tribal leaders; revise draft testimony.

3/7/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

1.0

395.00

Communication with Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Travel to Pine Ridge Indian Reservation with Mr. Gingold and Ms. Cobell to

3/7/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 12.0 3,840.00(attend a meeting on the settlement, prepare for meeting, debrief meeting by
making notes and revisions to presentations.

3/7/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 14 630.00 Coc_)rdmate travel to IC. Follow up w/ contractors re same. (includes CC w/
various)

3/7/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.3 150.00(|Discussions with Mr. Guilder regarding judgment fund issue in Sen. Kyl's inquiry.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive and review letter from beneficiary regarding

3/8/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 07 164.50 reqyest for case information (_.1); draft and- s_end response letter to i_aenefluary
(.2); update phone log regarding letter (.1); file maintenance regarding
accumulated correspondence (.3).

3/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 15.3 14,152.50 Return to Pine Ridge, travel to Rosebud and meet with Ms. Cobell, Pearl, and
class members on the reservations.
Conference call to discuss legislative issues (.8); discuss with Mr. Harper and

3/8/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 2.2 704.00{Mr. Rempel the meetings in Arizona to inform beneficiaries about the settlement
(1.4).
Cobell team call (1.1); telephone calls House Resources Committee staff

3/8/2010 |Harmala, Robert 24 1,260.00(regarding hearing (.7); telephone calls appropriations staff regarding
supplemental appropriations bill (.6).

3/8/2010 |Harper, Keith 24 1,200.00 Telephone confergnce on S(_attlement implementation (.5); planning for House
Resources Committee hearing (1.9).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.1); communications with post-

3/8/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 79 3.120.50 settlemen_t team members on advocacy gfforts (1_); C(_)mmunlcat!c_)n with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement; (2) legislative and political research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bills (3.8).
Travel to Pine Ridge Indian Reservation and then to Rosebud Indian

3/8/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 13.0 4.160.00 Rese_rvatlon vyrrh Mr. angold anq Ms. Cobell to att_e_nd a meeting, prepare for _
meeting, debrief meeting by making notes and revisions to presentations, debrief
with Mr. Gingold and Elouise and strategize for future meetings.

3/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ contractor re outreach and communications to class.

3/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ team re status.

3/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ named plaintiff re status.

3/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.1 $ 945.00 |Dratft, edit ask Elouise.

3/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.2 $ 1,890.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Cobell travel for beneficiary meeting (2); beneficiary meeting (1.5); travel from

3/8/2010 |Smith, David C. 9.2 4,600.00|meeting (2); prepare testimony for Ms. Cobell (3.1); discussions regarding
beneficiary outreach (.6).

3/9/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 07 143.50 CH:Z:lfr(ianrgence with Mr. Levitas and preparation for House Resources Committee
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement

3/9/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.0 235.00(status (.1); review further messages from beneficiary regarding settlement and
return call (.6); update phone log regarding calls (.1); maintenance for toll-free
phone line (.1).

3/9/2010 |Dorris, William E. 23 1,506.50 Prepare for House hearing (1.3); meeting with Ms. Cobell regarding South
Dakota outreach results (1).

3/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 15.3 14,152.50 Travel to Cheyenne River Sioux and Standing Rock Sioux reservations; meet
with Ms. Cobell, Pearl, and class members re settlement terms.

3/9/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.1 352.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

3/9/2010 |Harmala, Robert 26 1,365.00 Schedule meetmg_wnh Ser)ators (.3); Cobell team strategy call (.9); review
Resources Committee testimony (1.4).

Review and revise testimony of Ms. Cobell (2.2); discussions on visits to class

3/9/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.4 1,700.00 |members (.6); call with Salt River to set up Cobell meeting (.3); call from House
Resources Committee on testimony (.3).

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call and communications with post-
settlement team members on advocacy efforts (2.5); communication with

3/9/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 7.0 2,765.00(Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1.5); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.5); set up meetings for client,
D.C. visit and reviewed Congressional Hearing testimony (2.5).

Travel to Cheyenne River and Standing Rock reservations with Mr. Gingold to

3/9/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 12.0 3.840.00 atten_d a meetlng with Indians on Fh_e settlement, prepare for m_eetlr_lg, debrief
meeting by making notes and revisions to presentations, debrief with Mr.
Gingold to strategize for future meetings.

3/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ team re status.

3/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.9 $ 855.00 [Edit EC testimony to House Resources Committee and coordinate testimony.

3/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Meet w/ EC, BD re status and hearing.

3/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.0 $ 1,800.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).

3/9/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 17 501.50 Conduct legal research concerning reasonableness of attorney fee awards and

revise memorandum concerning same (1.7).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Travel for beneficiary outreach meeting (2); meeting (1.5); return (2); work on
3/9/2010 |Smith, David C. 6.6 $ 3,300.00|article regarding settlement for beneficiary outreach (.8); discussions with Mr.
Rempel regarding San Carlos meetings (.3).
3/10/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 59 $ 1,066.00 Preparation fc_>r and attendance at House Resources Committee Hearing and
conference with team members.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review current status of settlement website, including
3/10/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 04 $ 94.00 Ms. Cobell's latest letter (.2)5 review cqrrent claims administrator phgne

’ message (.1); conference with Mr. Smith regarding toll-free information numbers
(.1).

Review membership of House Committee on Natural Resources (.4); studying
testimony of other witnesses for today's hearing (1.3); meeting with Ms. Cobell
3/10/2010 |Dorris. William E. 6.6 $ 4.323.00 and others to prepare for hearing k:?e_fore_ the_ Housg Committee on Natural _

' ' Resources (.9); attending and participating in hearing before House Committee
on Natural Resources (3.4); de-briefing with Ms. Cobell following visits with
various Congressional offices (.6).

3/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 14.0 $ 12.950.00 Travel to Sissiton Sioux and Yankton Sioux reservations; meet with Ms. Cobell,
Pearl and class members re settlement terms.
3/10/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.1 $ 352.00|Conference call regarding legislative issues.
Pre Resources Committee Hearing preparation meeting (1); Meeting with
3/10/2010 |Harmala, Robert 3.2 $ 1,680.00|Senator and Ms. Cobell regarding settlement (1); Meeting with House
Resources Committee (1.2).
Preparation for and appearance at hearing at House Resources Committee
. 2.0); appear at MAST (1.3); discussions and telephone conference regardin
3/10/2010 |Harper, Keith 48 $ 2,400.00 .Esettl)emgflt implementat(ion )(.6); e-mail exchange v?/ith DOI (.4); arrangegclassg
member outreach (.5).
. Ms. Cobell visit to Washington, D.C. and hearing; Preparation for hearing (1);
3/10/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 7.0 $ 2,765.00 Attended meetings and hegaring with client in D.g. (6).p 9w
Travel to Sisseton-Wahpeton reservation with Mr. Gingold to attend a meeting
3/10/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 12.0 $ 3.840.00 with Indians on _the settlement, prepare for_ meqting, debrief meeting by making
notes and revisions to presentations, debrief with Mr. Gingold to strategize for
future meetings.
3/10/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).
3/10/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [Prep EC for hearing on Hill.
3/10/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 |Post hearing debrief w/ team.
3/10/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 $ 810.00 [Edit NCAI doc for outreach to class members.
3/10/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.7 $ 1,215.00 |Hearing before House Resources Committee.
3/10/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.8 $ 1,710.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

3/10/2010

Schulof, Daniel G.

4.8

1,416.00

Draft and revise memorandum to Mr. Smith concerning legal issues related to
reasonableness of attorney fee awards and conduct legal research for use in
same.

3/10/2010

Smith, David C.

3.0

1,500.00

Work on article for Indian voices regarding Cobell settlement (2.4); discussions
with Mr. Rempel (.3); discussions with Mr. Titla regarding beneficiary meetings at
San Carlos (.3).

3/11/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

11

258.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status
(.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); prepare
memo to Mr. Smith and Mr. Harper regarding same (.2); review phone message
from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.3); review phone message
from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.2); update phone log
regarding calls (.2).

3/11/2010

Dorris, William E.

1.2

786.00

Review press coverage of House hearing (.4); emails regarding outreach efforts
(.5); emails regarding legislative efforts (.3).

3/11/2010

Gingold, Dennis

14.6

13,505.00

Travel to three more reservations, finishing with Winnebago, Nebraska; meet
with Pearl and class members re settlement terms.

3/11/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

3.0

960.00

Meeting with Interior officials regarding settlement outreach.

3/11/2010

Harmala, Robert

2.6

1,365.00

Meeting with Appropr Committee regarding appropriations supplemental (1.6);
strategy conference with Cobell Team (1).

3/11/2010

Harper, Keith

52

2,600.00

Plan meetings with class members regarding settlement (.8); call team members
regarding same (.7); telephone conference with team members on settlement
implementation (1.0); e-mail exchange with Mr. Hauck and two calls (.7);
discussion with Mr. Rempel on Arizona trip (.4); meeting with Tompkins and
Hayes at their request to coordinate travel and discussions with Indian Country
(1.3); arrange trip to GPTCA (.3).

3/11/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

8.0

3,160.00

Communication with Congressional staff on Cobell settlement and hearing (6.5);
legislative and political research on Congressional calendar and legislative bills
(.5); communications with post-settlement team members on advocacy efforts

(1).

3/11/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

13.0

4,160.00

Travel to Santee Sioux, Yankton, and Winnebago reservations with Mr. Gingold
to attend a meeting with Indians on the settlement, prepare for meeting, debrief
meeting by making notes and revisions to presentations, debrief with Mr.
Gingold to strategize for future meetings.

3/11/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

4.5

2,025.00

Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/11/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

6.3

2,835.00

Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

3/11/2010

Smith, David C.

0.9

450.00

Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation (.4); review proposed
legislative language (.1); conference with Mr. Rempel regarding beneficiary
meetings (.1); email to Ms. Cobell regarding meetings with beneficiaries in

Montana (.1); review proposed TV and radio spots from Ms. Kinsella (.2).

3/12/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.0

235.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review and respond to memos from Ms. Deringer
regarding correspondence received from beneficiaries (.2); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding settlement status and return call (.2); review
phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.4 );
review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1 ); update phone log
regarding calls (.1).

3/12/2010

Dorris, William E.

1.9

1,244.50

Email from K. Craven (.2); working on plans for trips to NW reservations to talk
to beneficiaries (.8); review draft responses to beneficiaries' questions (.6);
review press coverage regarding House hearing (.3).

3/12/2010

Gingold, Dennis

18.0

16,650.00

Meet with Pearl in Omaha; post mortem; and return to DC, completing 1,900
mile outreach to Sioux TB's.

3/12/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

2.1

672.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues (.4); return call to beneficiary
regarding settlement issues (.6); review materials for legislative outreach (.9);
discuss same with Mr. Loving (.2).

3/12/2010

Harmala, Robert

1.0

525.00

Strategy call with Cobell team.

3/12/2010

Harper, Keith

3.7

1,850.00

Settlement implementation including client class communication (1.9);
discussion with team on telephone conference (.9); call with Mr. Gingold, Mr.
Pearl and Mr. Harmala on Obey statements (.9).

3/12/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

4.0

1,580.00

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.6); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (2); legislative and political research on
Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.6); communications with post-
settlement team members on advocacy efforts (.8).

3/12/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

115

3,680.00

Debrief with Mr. Gingold and strategize for passing legislation (8.5); review notes
and prepare reports for other Cobell team members (1.0); correspond with Mr.
Loving and Mr. Rempel regarding next steps and review of the trip (.3),
coordinate future travel details with other team members (1.2), correspond with
various beneficiaries recently acquainted on the South Dakota tour (.5).

3/12/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

04

180.00

CC w/ team re status

3/12/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.9

405.00

Follow up on written correspondence from class.

3/12/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.3

585.00

Meet w/ contractor re outreach
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.3 1,035.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 7.0 3,150.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).

3/12/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 0.3 88.50|Conference with Mr. Dorris concerning fee award issues (.3).
Telephone conversation with Mr. Harper regarding Montana visits (.2); telephone
conversation with Mr. Guilder regarding beneficiary visits (.1); telephone
conversation with Mr. Rempel regarding travel to Montana to visit with

3/12/2010 |Smith. David C. 15 750.00 _benef|C|a_r|es (.2?; e-malls with Ms. Cobell regar_dlng meetings with b(?nef|0|§r|es
in Browning (.1); review reports on House hearing on settlement (.4); e-mails
with Mr. Pearl regarding meetings in Montana (.1); discussions with Mr. Powell,
Ms. Cobell's assistant, regarding scheduling beneficiary meetings in Montana
(.2); review Indian Country Today article on settlement (.2).

3/13/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 20 790.00 Commun.lcayon WH.Ih Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.5);
communications with post-settlement team members on advocacy efforts (1.5).

3/13/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 540.00 |[CC w/ DS re outreach and follow-up on coordination of same.

. . E-mails with Ms. Cobell regarding beneficiary visits in Montana (.3); review Salt

3/13/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.7 350.00 Lake Tribune article for meetings (.2); e-mails regarding travel to Montana (.2).

3/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 45 $ 4.162.50 Begin to respon_d to 671 emails and 24 voice mail messages received during
South Dakota trip re settlement terms/issues.

3/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Holt re status of settlement.

3/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 Telcoms. Louis LaRose re issues raised during meeting at Winnebago,
Nebraska.

3/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.
E-mail to Mr. Gingold regarding comments of Mr. Emery regarding settlement

3/14/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.3 150.00((.1); e-mail regarding motion for leave to appeal in forma pauperis (.1); e-mail
with Ms. Cobell (.1).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver

3/15/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 09 211,50 (.2); receive call frpm beneficiary regardmg-notlce/wawer (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding settlement status (.3); update phone log regarding calls
(.2).

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Telcoms. TB re settlement status/issues; ITMA opposition in Indian country.

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Revise current Ask Elouise letter.

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Discussion Loving re Hill issues.

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 |Discussion Harper re same.

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Harper re class communication issues; Hill.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Discussion Rempel re Hill issues.

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcoms. Levitas re Hill issues.

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Conference call re above issues all hands.

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Infield re settlement status.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 51 $ 4,717.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/15/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.5 480.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

3/15/2010 |Harmala, Robert 29 1,155.00 Stratggy ca_II with Cobell team (1.2); telephone calls with Congressional staff and
Administration (1).
Arrange for trips to visit beneficiaries; collect information for distribution (.8);

. discussions as to what areas to reach with Mr. Gingold (1.2); prepare for FBA

3/15/2010 |Harper, Keith 6.2 3,100.00 conference (Mr. Dorris to cover) regarding settlement (3); call with Mr. Harmala
and Mr. Loving on settlement implementation (.8); call with Mr. Dorris (.4).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.5); legislative and political

3/15/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 50 1,975.00 .research on Congresspnal calen.dar.and Ieglslatlve bills (.5); Grass roots efforts
in SD on settlement (2); communications with post-settlement team members on
advocacy efforts (1).

3/15/2010 |Pear, Michael Alexander 3.0 960.00 Continue planning trip to Indian Country (1.5); participate and prepare for Cobell
team conference call (1.5).

3/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.1 $ 495.00 |CC w/ team re status

3/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [CC w/ Ml re upcoming briefing for tribes.

3/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/15/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 |Disc w/ DG re status (incl fees and trip)

3/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 7.0 $ 3,150.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).

3/15/2010 |Roth, Katie 0.2 _|Receipt _anql review Status Report; e-mail to litigation case team and update
electronic files with same.
Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislative issues and beneficiary
outreach (1); discussions regarding beneficiary meetings at TON and Salt River
(.6); revisions to draft letter to Senator Kyl (.9); review comments on Sen. Kyl's

3/15/2010 |Smith, David C. 4.2 2,100.00(letter (.4); discussions regarding AP story for beneficiary outreach (.3);
conference call with Mr. Levitas regarding discussions with Ms. Howard on
legislative settlement 6); email with Mr. Gingold regarding response to
beneficiary (.1); review letter and questions from Rep. Hastings (.3).

3/16/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.3 61.50|Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from caller on behalf of
beneficiary (.1); prepare memo to Mr. Smith and Mr. Harper regarding same (.1);
exchange memos with Mr. Guilder regarding same (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1); receive call from beneficiary

3/16/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 2.1 493.50(regarding settlement (.3); review phone message from unidentified caller (.1);
receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver and return call (.6); update phone log regarding calls
(.2).

3/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Conference call Harper, Smith, Pearl re Hill issues.

3/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Telcoms. TB's re scope of class; status of settlement.

3/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 35 $ 3,237.50 Prepare response to Monette allegations, e.g., claim of collusion with defs in
settlement of case.

3/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Provide written response to press re same.

3/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Harper re Hill issues; continuing outreach to Indian country.

3/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Discussion Rempel re same.

3/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.4 $ 1,295.00 |Conference call all hands re above.

3/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same.

3/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Levitas re Hill issues; outreach.

3/16/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.3 $ 416.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues and outreach trips.

3/16/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 10.0 $ 3.200.00 lf{/li\)/(iii\(/)v materials and prepare for outreach meetings in Arizona and New

3/16/2010 |Harmala, Robert 16 $ 840.00 Strategy call with litigation group (.4); Meeting with House leadership staff
regarding FEMA supplemental (1.2).
E-mail exchange and discussions to plan trips to South Dakota, Idaho, Utah,
Oklahoma, Arizona, Washington to meet with beneficiary class (2.9); call from

. DOJ (.2); call from Interior (.2); call from DOJ (.2); discussion with Gay Kingman

3/16/2010 |Harper, Keith 57 2,850.00 about( G)PTCA meeting (.4)? tr)avel plans for my(/ n:eetings; e-mail exchgngeg\’/vith
Marigrace (.2); call to beneficiaries on list (1.4); edit draft responses to Senator
Kyl (.2).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call and communications with post-

3/16/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 5.5 2,172.50(settlement team members on advocacy efforts (5); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.5).

3/16/2010 |Munson, Catherine F. 0.5 -|Make arrangements for meeting with plaintiff class members at Salt River.
Continue planning trip to Indian Country (3.5); meeting with Mr. Loving, Mr.

3/16/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 6.0 1,920.00|Rempel and Mr. Harmala (1.5); participate and prepare for Cobell team
conference call (1).

3/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 135.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

78




Elogl:s

fion ESYR&E

I'I_Iy Je@v%‘f@c‘?&%@%?%ézl nté:ricln?,detoa?./ 1043 \F qga%g\%?{s%?t@m)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 405.00 |CC w/ team re status

3/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 675.00 [Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).

3/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 29 990.00 Travel to San Carlos from PHX, including discussions w/ JG re meetings and
outreach.

3/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 7.5 3,375.00 |Travel to Phoenix, including discussions w/ JG re meetings and outreach.
Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislative issues (1.3); conference
call with Judge Robertson on status (.3); work on revisions to Sen. Kyl's letter

3/16/2010 |Smith, David C. 6.8 3,400.00((.7); work on arrangements for Montana beneficiary meetings (3.1); revise press
release for beneficiary meetings (1); arrange to forward speaking materials to
Montana (.4).

Pull together photos of document destruction per Mr. Loving's request (.5);

3/17/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 16 328.00 conference Wlth Mr.. Pearl a.nd Mr. er?gold regarding Senatpr Dorga}n s
statement. (.3); review previous decisions for expert report information per Mr.
Dorris' request (.8).

3/17/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 08 $ 188.00 Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding land issues (.7);
update phone log regarding calls (.1).

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 10 $ 925.00 Prepare response to allegations that named plaintiff would be paid $15 million
for work on case.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. TB's re response to Monette allegations.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Conference call Loving, Ms. Cobell re above.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. Holt re above.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call Loving, Harmala, Harper, Pearl, Smith re above.

3/17/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Rempel re Monette allegations.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Pearl re Hill issues.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Loving re same.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Prepare settlement impact memorandum.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcom. TB re status of case.

3/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.1 $ 1,017.50 |Work on factual response to Monette allegations for Hill.

3/17/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 12.0 $ 3,840.00{Review materials, prepare for, and present at outreach meetings in Arizona.

3/17/2010 |Harmala, Robert 15 $ 787 50 Strategy call with Cobell team (.5); telephone calls to staff with House and

Senate leadership (1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

3/17/2010

Harper, Keith

4.4

2,200.00

Telephone conference on settlement implementation; prepare for trips to Rapid
City, Salt River, Gila River, Tohono O'Odham and Portland/Seattle (1.8); review
articles, resolution and S.1813 to determine how the "asset" management was
included (2.4); e-mail to DOJ and Judge Robertson (.2).

3/17/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

4.8

1,896.00

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call and communications with post-
settlement team members on advocacy efforts (2.5); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.8); legislative and political research
(.5); South Dakota grass roots efforts for settlement (1).

3/17/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

6.5

2,080.00

Review and revise response to litigation questions (1); conference with Mr.
Loving on grass roots materials (1.5); research facts of Cobell litigation (3);
participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1).

3/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.7

1,215.00

Meeting w/ WMA.

3/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.9

1,305.00

Travel to White Mt. Apache, including discussions w/ JG re meetings and
outreach.

3/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

4.2

1,890.00

Meeting w/ San Carlos members, including set up and follow up.

3/17/2010

Smith, David C.

4.8

2,400.00

Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation and beneficiary outreach
(1.0); second conference call regarding legislation (.4); meeting with Mr. Rempel
regarding outreach in Indian Country (.8); work on response to Rep. Hasting's
second set of questions (1.5); emails with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Rempel regarding
answers to questions (.3); work on arranging Fort Belknap meetings (.8).

3/18/2010

Applegate, Alexis

1.3

266.50

Research of opinions and expert reports per Mr. Dorris' request (.7); research of
previous article per Mr. Loving's request and conference with Mr. Gingold
regarding same (.6).

3/18/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.8

423.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive and review letter from beneficiary regarding
effect of settlement on recently probated estate (.1); prepare memo to Mr. Smith
regarding same (.1); receive and review letter from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.1); draft letter response (.3); receive call from anonymous caller
regarding notice/waiver (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement status and return call (.3); review phone message from anonymous
caller (.1); update phone log regarding letters and calls (.2); file maintenance
(.1); review Cobell settlement website (.1); review Claims Administrator phone
message (.1).

3/18/2010

Dorris, William E.

0.6

393.00

Emails and call with Ms. Applegate about resource investigation and assembling
materials for beneficiaries, and review materials forwarded by her.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell et al re CBO; Hill issues.

3/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 06 $ 555.00 Telcoms.. Ms. Cobell re continuing outreach to Indian country; White Mountain
Apache issues.

3/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Rempel re above; southwest trip re outreach.

3/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Harper re above.

3/18/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Senate staff re CBO issues.

3/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Smith re outreach to Montana.

3/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Levitas re CBO issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.2 $ 7,585.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/18/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 12.0 3,840.00{Review materials, prepare for, and present at outreach meetings in New Mexico.

3/18/2010 |Harmala, Robert 1.3 682.50|Strategy meeting (.9); research supplemental appropriations status (.4).
Preparations for visits with beneficiary class (Salt River, Tohono, Portland,

3/18/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.8 1,900.00 |Seattle) (2.9); telephone conference on settlement implementation (.5); e-mail
exchange with Rosebud (.4).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call and communications with post-

3/18/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 3.5 1,382.50|settlement team members on advocacy efforts (2.6); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.9).
Conference with Mr. Gingold (1); follow up emails with South Dakota class

3/18/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 7.0 2,240.00|members on various questions regarding the settlement (.5); continue arranging
next trip to Indian Country (5.5).

3/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 17 265.00 Travel to Fgrmlngton, NM for meeting w/ shi shi keyah, including discussions w/
JG re meetings and outreach.

3/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey o3 1,260.00 'SI';\T\]/EI to Churchrock chapter (NM Navajo), includes discussions with JG re

3/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.5 2,025.00 |Meet w/ Churchrock Chapter
Prepare PowerPoint for presentation for beneficiary meetings in Montana (3.1);

3/18/2010 |Smith. David C. 175 8.750.00 prepare for meetings with bene.flmarles. (2.1); travel to Montapa (1;.2); wor!< on
second response to Rep. Hastings (.9); telephone conversation with Mr. Gingold
(.1); email to Ms. West at Kinsella Media regarding meetings in Montana (.1).
Research of various Cobell decisions per Mr. Dorris and Mr. Levitas' request

3/19/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 15 307.50|(.6); research fee decisions per Mr. Smith's request (.6); research regarding New

York times article per Mr. Levitas' request (.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding land sale
question (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement
status and return call (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);

3/19/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 3.2 $ 752 0o|€CEIVe call from bgneflplary regarding probat_e guestions (.3); update phone log
regarding calls (.2); review phone logs regarding callers from Montana who may
be interested in Montana informational meetings the week of March 22, 2010
and telephone said beneficiaries regarding same (1.8); prepare table regarding
Montana beneficiaries (.2); conference with Mr. Smith regarding same (.1).
Letter and package of materials to Kimberly Craven (beneficiary) regarding

3/19/2010 |Dorris, William E. 23 $ 1,506.50 |nvest|g<'_;1t|on of resource management (.3); review and revise |nformat|o.n to
share with beneficiaries in outreach meetings in the coming weeks (1.4);
planning for trip to northwest during the week of March 29 (.6).

3/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Harper, Pearl, Smith, Levitas, Loving re Hill issues.

3/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 06 555.00 Telcoms. Pearl re ILCA relevan_ce to settlement issues; FT. Hall TB issues; tribal
efforts to determine settlement issues.

3/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcom. TB re distribution formula; scope, etc.

3/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Harper re testimony.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/19/2010 (Gingold, Dennis 9.0 $ 8,325.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/19/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 10.0 3,200.00{Review materials, prepare for, and present at outreach meetings in New Mexico.

3/19/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.8 420.00|Strategy meeting with Cobell team.
Telephone conference on settlement implementation with legal team (1.0);

. discussions with Mr. Harmala and White House on developments (.7); call with

3/19/2010 Harper, Keith 9.1 $ 4,550.00 Mr. Hauck (.4); travel to Rapid City to meet with Plains tribes and David Hayes,
Deputy Interior Secretary (7.0).

3/19/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. o5 $ 98750 Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (1); Grass roots efforts in SD on
settlement (1.5).
Conference with Mr. Gingold on Land Consolidation issue (.6); follow up emails

3/19/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 6.0 $ 1,920.00 with .South. Dakota cIa;s membgrs on vgrlous guestions regar.dllng the settlement
(1.5); continue arranging next trip to Indian Country (3.4); participate and
prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5).

3/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.1 $ 45.00 |Pre-meeting w/ Solicitor's Office.

3/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Pre-meeting w/ JG
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 1,575.00 |Travel to Alb. Follow up w/ JG re meeting.

3/19/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 5.0 2,250.00 |Meeting in Farmington

3/19/2010 |Smith. David C. 125 6,250.00 Travel to Blackfeet Reservation (2); meetings at Blackfeet reservation (8.5);
travel to Great Falls (2).

3/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 277.50 |Telcom. Harper re meeting with him and Hayes with tribal leaders in Rapid City.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.0 5,550.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/20/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 7.0 $ 2,240.00[|Outreach meetings in Arizona and New Mexico.

3/20/2010 |Harper, Keith 105 $ 5,250.00 Meet with beneﬁmary and tribal leaders in Rapid City, SD on Cobell settlement;
travel back to Washington, DC.

3/20/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 8.0 $ 3,600.00 |Travel to DC, includes discussions with JG and review meeting notes.

3/20/2010 |Smith. David C. 14.6 $ 7.300.00 ;I'rla)\vel for beneficiary meetings (14.5), telephone conversation with Ms. Cobell
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.8 6,290.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/22/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 17 348.50 Research of fee de'C|sl|ons per Mr. Smith's request (.8); research of 1993 GAO
Report per Mr. Loving's request (.9).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding land sale (.2); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding information on case and return call (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding case status and return call
(.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding beneficiary status and

3/22/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 23 540.50 return call (.2); review phone mes§age from beneficiary regarding case status
and settlement and return call (.2); receive anonymous call regarding land
question (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding status (.1); receive call from
beneficiary regarding status (.1); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver and return call (.4); receive phone message from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.1); update phone log
regarding calls (.3).

3/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 11 1,017.50 Conferen_ce call Ms.. .Cobell, Harper, Rempel, Pearl, Guilder, Harmala, Loving re
above; tribal opposition to settlement.

3/22/2010 |(Gingold, Dennis 0.3 277.50 [Telcom. Hill staff re FEMA supp approp bill as vehicle for settlement provision.

3/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Loving re same.

3/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same; NCAI issues.

83




Ca

hiPERePAaRR

Elowse%ep

I'|_|y Jel;/)vglﬁ Lgpc%][

LS PGl OR/ 1 U3 B AR ED IR )

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
3/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.6 $ 1,480.00 |Telcoms. Levitas re above.
3/22/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcoms. Dorris re Monette allegations, e.g., collusion.
3/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Harper re Hill settlement issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
3/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.2 5,735.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Conference call to discuss legislative issues and outreach trips (.6); draft and
3/22/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.0 320.00|revise correspondence regarding legislative support from Arizona and New
Mexico allottees following outreach (.4).
3/22/2010 |Harmala, Robert 29 1,155.00 Qonference F:all with Class counsel team(.9), legislative strategy
implementation(1.3).
Telephone conference on settlement implementation and possible bill progress
3/22/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.7 1,850.00 |(.8); preparations for trips to Salt River, Tohono O'odham, Gila River, Hoopa,
Portland Seattle (2.9).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (1.1); legislative and political
3/22/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. a1 1,619.50 research on Congressmryal calendgr a_nd Ieg|_slat|ve bills (1.2); Grass roots
efforts for settlement (.8); communications with post-settlement team members
on advocacy efforts (1).
. Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.1); coordinate trip to
3/22/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 75 2,400.00 Indian Country (5.9); discuss legislation with Mr. Loving and Mr. Gingold (.5).
3/22/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 [CC w/ team re update.
3/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [Disc w/ BD, JL re leg update (separate disc).
3/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Update grass roots doc.
3/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.4 $ 630.00 [Disc w/ DG re update
3/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Follow up w/ contacts in field re commitments for info.
3/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.3 $ 1,035.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).
3/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).
3/22/2010 |Smith, David C. 14.8 7.400.00 Travgl through Montana} for beneficiary meet.lngs. (10.5); beneficiary meetings
(3.4); conference call with co-counsel on legislation (.9).
Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request (.3); conference
3/23/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 1.8 369.00|with Mr. Levitas regarding Hill contacts and draft correspondence regarding

same (.2); research regarding individual stories per Mr. Loving's request (1.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver and return call (.3); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding settlement status and return call (.4); receive call from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1);

3/23/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 3.0 $ 705.00]receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding settlement status and return call (.1); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding new address/status and return call (.3); review email
message from beneficiary regarding addresses change and settlement
information (.1); telephone beneficiary regarding same (.1); update phone log
regarding calls (.3).
Review testimony of Richard Monette (.2); began preparing response to his

3/23/2010 |Dorris, William E. 3.5 $ 2,292.50(allegations (2.3); team conference call regarding legislative efforts (.5);
conference with Mr. Gingold on legislative issues (.5).

3/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Smith re Montana outreach.

3/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference call Dorris, Harper re Hill issues.

3/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Smith re forced fee patents; Hill issues.

3/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call all hands re Hill issues.

3/23/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Revise Ask Elouise Letter to class No. VI.

3/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Loving re Hill.

3/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Hill staff re settlement issues.

3/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Levitas re same.

3/23/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.0 $ 6,475.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/23/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Discussion Dorris re above.
Conference call to discuss legislative issues and outreach (.4); draft and revise

: . materials for grass roots efforts (1); discuss needs of grass roots efforts in

3/23/2010 - |Guilder, Justin M. 3.4 $ 1,088.00 Southwest angd Great Plains and( d)raft and revise corr(gspondence regarding
same (.6); draft and revise letter responsive to White Mountain Apache (1.4).

3/23/2010 [Hanson, Cindy D. 0.4 $ 232.00|Review Monette testimony (.4).

3/23/2010 |Harmala, Robert 1.0 $ 525.00]|Legislative implementation strategy call with Cobell team.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Telephone conference on settlement implementation and discussion regarding

3/23/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.6 $ 1,800.00 |settlement implementing legislation (1.0); prepare paperwork for beneficiary
visits (2.2); discuss with Mr. Gingold outreach to Garland CBO issues (.4).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call and communications with post-

3/23/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 35 $ 1,382.50(settlement team members on advocacy efforts (2.4); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1.1).

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.3); conference with

3/23/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 70 $ 2.240.00 Mr. Re_mpel regarding arrapgement of trayel for upcoming trip _to Idaho,
Wyoming and Montana (4); conference with Mr. Loving regarding grass roots
materials (1.7).

3/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ JL, KH, Congressional staff re settlement and freedmen.

3/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Follow up w/ contacts in field re commitments for info.

3/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [Disc w/ DG re update

3/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [CC w/ team re update.

3/23/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 6.5 $ 2,925.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).
Travel to Fort Belknap (7); call with Mr. Gingold and Ms. Cobell regarding status
of legislation (.2); conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation and
status of beneficiary meetings (.6); telephone conversation with the court

3/23/2010 |Smith. David C. 15.0 $ 7.500.00 regarding status (.3); telephone conversation with Mr. Gmgold regarding eﬁect of
settlement agreement on forced fee patents and per capita payments (.3);
beneficiary meeting at Fort Belknap (3); meeting with Ms. Aragon, counsel for
Fort Belknap (1.3); travel to Fort Peck (2); email regarding status conference
(.1); email to AP regarding beneficiary outreach (.2).

. Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request (.2); review

3/2412010 - |\Applegate, Alexis 0.6 $ 123.00 information regarding Hill contacts per Mr. Levitas' request (.4).

3/24/2010 |Bertschi, Craig E. 4.4 $ 2.552.00 Review Mc-mette tesUmony (2); review CAFA provisions and terms of Cobell
settlement; conference with Ms. Hanson regarding same (3.4).

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement status and return call (.4); receive call from beneficiary regarding

3/24/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.0 $ 235.00 settlement (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); update
phone log regarding calls (.1).

3/24/2010 |Dorris, William E. 37 $ 2.423.50 Workm_g on response to C_ongressmna_ll and beneficiary questions (2.3);
preparing for visits to Colville and Yakima (1.4).

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.1 $ 1,017.50 |Conference call all hands re Hill issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 04 $ 370.00 'Fl)'glic;ic;rss. Yang, SG's office, re further extension of time to respond to cert

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Telcoms. Senate Hill staff re D support; R's, House leadership.

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Conference calls Loving, Pearl re above.

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.

3/24/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 |Telcoms. Levitas re House leadership/settlement issues.

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Loving re above.

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Harper re above.

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom counsel for allottee association re status of settlement.

3/24/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Dorris re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 3.7 $ 3,422.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/24/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.1 352.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

. Review testimony before Subcommittee (1.3); draft outline of objections to

3/24/2010 - |Hanson, Cindy D. 3.9 2,262.00 settlement and rgsponses (2.2); Conferergce \)/vith C.E. Bertschi (.J4).

3/24/2010 |Harmala, Robert 12 $ 630.00 Cobell t(_ear_n strategy _meeting (.7); follow up calls to House and Senate
Appropriations committees (.5).
Telephone conference on settlement implementation and discussion regarding
settlement bill passage - update from lobbyist (Mr. Loving and Mr. Harmala) (.8);

. review, revise and distribute letter to White Mountain Apache answering their

3/24/2010 |Harper, Keith 4.6 $ 2,300.00 questions (1.6); call regarding Freedmen desire to be irFl)cIuded (1.2); digcussion
with Interior regarding Indian Country outreach and Freedmen issue (.2); call
with Mr. Gingold regarding Freedmen issue (.8).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call and communications with post-
settlement team members on advocacy efforts (3); communication with

3/24/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 5.2 $ 2,054.00({Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1.3); legislative and political research
on Congressional calendar and legislative bills (.5). Grass roots efforts for
settlement (.4).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); continue

3/24/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 9.5 $ 3,040.00(arrangement of meetings for trip to Indian Country (7.5); conference with Mr.
Loving regarding legislative strategy (.5).

3/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |Follow up w/ contacts in field re commitments for info.

3/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Disc w/ DG re update

3/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [CC w/ team re update.

3/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 [Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 6.0 $ 2,700.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/24/2010 |Smith, David C. 8.3 4.150.00 Tra_v_el for b.enefici_ary outreach (S); e-mail_rggarding extension on certiorari
petition (.2); e-mail to AP regarding beneficiary outreach (.1).

3/25/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 12 246.00 Review infprmation regarding Rah'al‘l and Kildee per Mr. Levitas' request (.4);
further review of fees per Mr. Dorris' request (.8).

3/25/2010 |Bertschi, Craig E. 20 1,160.00 Review and co_mment on draft memo to Mr. Dorris (1.7); revise memo;
conferences with Ms. Hanson (.3).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding Cobell
informational meetings (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding case
information (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding land issues
(.1); prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding same (.1); review phone message
from beneficiary regarding enroliment (.3); receive call from beneficiary

3/25/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 2.5 587.50|regarding settlement (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
(.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver and return call (.2); update phone log regarding calls
(.2); review website letter from Ms. Cobell and schedule of visits (.1).
Review Class Action Fairness Act of 2005 in connection with criticism by
Richard Monette (.6); review information regarding tribes which | will be visiting

3/25/2010 |Dorris, William E. 3.2 2,096.00[{next week (.7); review press reports on Ms. Cobell's visits to Indian country (.3);
preparing memo on Rule 23 issues for Albuquerque conference (1.2); emails
regarding additional questions from Congressman Hastings (.4).

3/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 11 $ 1,017.50 |Conference call Loving, Harper, Rempel et al re above issues.

3/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 |Conference call Rempel, Levitas re same.

3/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Hill staff re Senate legislative settlement issues.

3/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Dorris re Pigford linkage problems.

3/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.

3/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 |Telcoms. Loving re above; blue dogs in House.

3/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call Loving, Pearl re above.

3/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. TB re status of settlement.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of

3/25/2010 |(Gingold, Dennis 7.4 $ 6,845.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

3/25/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.8 576.00(Legislative conference call.

3/25/2010 |Hanson, Cindy D. 12 696.00 Revise Qutline regarding responding to objections (.9); conference with C.E.
Bertschi (.3).

3/25/2010 |Harmala, Robert 1.1 577.50|House and Senate meetings (.6); strategy call with Cobell team (.5).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

3/25/2010

Harper, Keith

2.3

1,150.00

Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.6); discussion with
Tohono O'odham and Salt River to finalize preparation for meetings with
beneficiaries (.8); discussion with lobbyist on Freedmen issue (.9).

3/25/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

4.5

1,777.50

Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call and communications with post-
settlement team members on advocacy efforts (2.2); communication with
Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1.5). Grass roots efforts for SD and AZ
on settlement (.8).

3/25/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

6.0

1,920.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); continue arranging
meetings and finalizing preparations for trip to Indian Country (3.8); respond to
class member questions (.7).

3/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.0

450.00

CC w/ team re update.

3/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

14

630.00

Disc w/ DG re update

3/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.8

810.00

Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).

3/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

7.0

A |h AP

3,150.00

Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).

3/25/2010

Roth, Katie

15

Review press articles from Jan 2010 to March 2010, and file management per
Mr. Levitas' request.

3/25/2010

Smith, David C.

0.5

250.00

E-mails with Mr. Burns regarding beneficiary calls (.1); e-mail to Ms. Cobell (.1);
e-mail to Mr. Loving regarding status of legislation (.1); review Monette interview

(2).

3/26/2010

Bertschi, Craig E.

14

812.00

Prepare for and meet with Mr. Dorris regarding class action issues on Cobell
settlement.

3/26/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

2.7

634.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive calls from beneficiary regarding 1IM account (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call
(.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call
(.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call
(.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return
call (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.6); review email from beneficiary regarding land sale and
telephone beneficiary regarding same (.2); receive call from beneficiary
regarding status (.2); update phone log regarding calls/email (.2); review news
articles regarding settlement hearing in Congress and forward same to Mr.

Smith (.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Review memo from Mr. Bertschi regarding class issues raised by Richard
Monette's testimony (.4); meeting with Mr. Bertschi regarding Monette's
3/26/2010 |Dorris, William E. 24 1,572.00 testimony (.3_);_te|e_phone gon_ference WiFh Mark Br9wn's attorn_eys rt_egardi_ng
possible participation by him in fee application (.4); telephone interview with
reporter for Congressional Quarterly (.3); listening to Monette's House testimony
and making outline of points he raised (.8); emails from Mr. Gingold (.2).
3/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, et al re above; all issues.
3/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Discussion Rempel re same.
3/26/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. TB re settlement status; scope of class.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
3/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 11.0 10,175.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
3/26/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.7 224.00|Legislative conference call.
3/26/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.6 315.00|Strategy call with Cobell team.
Set up meetings in Arizona and discussion of meeting in Pacific Northwest;
3/26/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.7 1.850.00 te_lephor_1e co_nferen_ce on settlement implem_entation and_ prepare for same (2.9);
discussion with White House on settlement implementation and next steps on
Congressional action (.8)
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.7); communication with
3/26/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 2.7 1,066.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1). Grass roots efforts for SD and AZ
on settlement (1).
3/26/2010 |Munson, Catherine F. 0.3 -|Prepare slide for meeting with Salt River class members.
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.7); meet with Mr.
3/26/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 9.5 3,040.00(Loving regarding Hill issues (.8); finalize trip details for meetings in Indian
Country (8).
3/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re update.
3/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [Disc w/ AP re travel.
3/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.0 $ 450.00 |Disc w/ DG re update
3/26/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 $ 810.00 |Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).
3/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 8.3 $ 3,735.00 |Coordinate travel (incl outreach to IC leaders and facilitate communications).
3/26/2010 |Smith, David C. 7.0 3,500.00(Travel for beneficiary outreach.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g. redaction of
3/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.8 7,215.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues; review partial payment on Infield
sanctions.
3/27/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [Disc w/ DG re travel and leg update.
3/27/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 35 $ 1,575.00 |Finalize Travel plans and organization. Prep for meetings.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

3/28/2010

Dorris, William E.

8.5

5,567.50

Prepare for meetings with beneficiaries at Colville and Yakama during trip to
Spokane, Washington.

3/28/2010

Gingold, Dennis

6.3

5,827.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

3/28/2010

Harper, Keith

6.5

3,250.00

Travel to Tucson, AZ for meeting with Cobell class members to present
settlement terms.

3/28/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

9.0

2,880.00

Travel to Spokane and Lewiston, ID for Settlement meeting at Nez Perce.

3/28/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

8.0

3,600.00

Travel to Spokane for Nez Perce meeting.

3/28/2010

Smith, David C.

0.1

50.00

E-mails regarding request from Garden City.

3/29/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

2.9

681.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding beneficiary letter
inquiry from beneficiary (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
(.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return
call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return
call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement status
and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement
and return call (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1);
receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1); receive call from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); review
phone message from beneficiary regarding land probate issues and return call
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1); receive call
from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3); prepare email correspondence to
beneficiary regarding same (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.2).

3/29/2010

Dorris, William E.

114

7,467.00

Telephone conference with team regarding legislative efforts (.5); meeting with
Ms. Cobell and Steven Powell at hotel in Spokane, Washington to prepare for
presentations (1); travel from Spokane to Colville, Washington for meeting with
beneficiaries (1.8); setting up for and conducting informational meeting with
beneficiaries at Colville (4.2); travel from Colville to Toppenish, Washington for
meetings tomorrow with Yakama beneficiaries (3.9).

3/29/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.6

555.00

Conference call Ms. Cobell, Harmala, Dorris, Harper, Levitas re Hill issues.

3/29/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

185.00

Telcom. Loving re same.

3/29/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

185.00

Telcom. Levitas re Hill/status conference.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call Rempel, Pearl re status of meeting.

3/29/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Check Black Farmers' settlement agreement re 3/31 deadline.

3/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. TB re status of settlement.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

3/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.9 $ 9,157.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

3/29/2010 |Harmala, Robert 17 $ 892 50 Strategy call(.6), meetings regarding Interior legislative strategy with Cobell
team(1.1).
Meeting with Cobell class members at Tohono O'odham outside Tucson, AZ

. (3.3); travel to Salt River Indian Community Cobell class members meeting (4.3);

3/29/2010 |Harper, Keith 8.5 $ 4,250.00 e-mail exchange on Cobell settlement implementation (.3); discussion with Mr.
Gingold on settlement implementation (.6).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.6); Cobell settlement team on

3/29/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 3.8 $ 1,501.00|legislative efforts (1.5). Communication with Congressional staff on Cobell
settlement (1.7).

3/29/2010 |Munson, Catherine F. 40 $ i Prepare for apd partmpatg in meeting with allottees at the Salt River Pima
Maricopa Indian Community.

3/29/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 15.0 $ 4.800.00 Travgl to rr_1eet|ng at N(_ez Perce, meet with class members, travel to Billings for
meeting with Crow Nation and Northern Cheyenne.

3/29/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 225.00 |Meet w/ potential PR firm (for notice).

3/29/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 45 2.025.00 '(Ij'(raatl)\:i(zlfto and meet w/ Nez Perce, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming meetings and

3/20/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 59 $ 2.655.00 :r?éu(;zgz(asfpokane and travel to Billings, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming meetings

3/30/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.5 $ 102.50|Continue work on fee information per Mr. Dorris' request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.4); draft email response to beneficiary regarding

3/30/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 15 $ 352 50 set@lemen.t classes (.2); review phong message from beneficiary reggr@mg
notice/waiver and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding effect of land sale and return call (.4); update phone log regarding
calls/email (.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Telephone call to reporter at Seattle radio station (.4); preparing for meeting at
Yakama reservation with Ms. Cobell and Steve Powell (.5); tour of Yakama
museum and reservation (2.2); emails regarding meetings in DC next week with
3/30/2010 |Dorris, William E. 12.1 $ 7,925.50{Administration regarding legislative efforts (.4); setting up for and conducting
informational meeting with beneficiaries at Yakama reservation in Toppenish,
Washington (5); travel from Toppenish, Washington to Portland, Oregon (3.1);
email from/to individual beneficiaries (.5).
3/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Conference call Loving, Levitas, Pearl, Ms. Cobell re above.
3/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Dorris re WH issues.
3/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Loving re above; Pigford notice.
3/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above; meeting on Hill.
3/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Telcoms. Harper re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
3/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.7 $ 4,347.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
3/30/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 12.0 3.840.00 gg;!;\év materials, prepare for, and travel to outreach meetings in Portland
3/30/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.9 472.50|Strategy meeting with Cobell team.
Travel to Portland, OR for meeting with Cobell Class members (3.7); meet with
3/30/2010 |[Harper, Keith 4.3 $ 2,150.00 |Mr. Dorris on prior meetings and additional steps for settlement implementation
(.6).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.9); updated Cobell settlement
3/30/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 3.6 $ 1,422.00|team on legislative efforts (1.5). Communication with Congressional staff on
Cobell settlement (1.2).
3/30/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 16.0 $ 5.120.00 \I\//Iv(;?)tmv;/rl]tg class members at Crow Nation and Northern Cheyenne, travel to
3/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 405.00 |Meet w/ allottees at Crow before meeting.
3/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 14 $ 630.00 [Travel to N. Cheyenne, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming meetings and debrief.
3/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 [Travel to Crow for meeting, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming meetings and debrief.
3/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.9 $ 1,755.00 |Crow meeting.
3/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.0 $ 1,800.00 |N. Cheyenne meeting.
3/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 50 $ 2.250.00 '(Ii'(raa;)\:;lfto Wyoming for meetings, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming meetings and
3/30/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.2 $ 100.00|E-mail to Ms. Cobell.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
3/31/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 04 82.00 Rewgw medla coverage anq dockets per Mr. Levitas rque'st (.2); review
previous information regarding fee decisions per Mr. Dorris' request (.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding case
and return call (.5); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.4);
3/31/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 29 517.00 recelv.e.call from b.enef|C|ary regardlr?g set?lement status (.2);. receive caII.from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.4); receive call from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.2); review several pending
beneficiary call issues and forward same to Mr. Smith for guidance (.3).
Telephone conference with reporter for radio station KIRO in Seattle (.3);
breakfast meeting with Ms. Cobell and others regarding legislative efforts and
. - plans for Albuquerque trip (.6); during return trip from Portland to Atlanta,
3/31/2010 | Dorris, William E. 8.9 5,829.50 working on (1) plans for further informational meetings and packets (1.4) (2)
rebuttal of criticism by Monette and others (1.9), (3) plan for work following
legislation (1.8) and (4) review of previous attorneys fees decisions in case (2.9).
3/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Conference call Harmala, Loving Levitas re Hill issues.
3/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcom. TB re settlement status; formula.
3/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re WH meeting; issues.
3/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Loving re Senate leadership.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
3/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.2 8,510.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
3/31/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 7.0 2,240.00{Review materials, prepare for, and present at outreach meetings in Portland.
3/31/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.4 210.00|Strategy meeting with Cobell team.
Travel to and hold beneficiary meeting in Portland, OR (2.9); review e-mail
. exchange on implementation of settlement (.5); discussion with Ms. Cobell on
3/31/2010 |Harper, Keith 6.5 3,250.00 necessary beneficiary outreach (1.4); dinner meeting with Ms. Cobell and others
to discuss settlement and next steps (1.7).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.4); updated Cobell settlement
3/31/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 3.0 1,185.00|team on legislative efforts (1). Communication with Congressional staff on Cobell
settlement (1.6).
3/31/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 15.0 4.800.00 Meet with Wind River Reservation tribes (Eastern Shoshone and Northern
Arapaho) and travel to Idaho.
3/31/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 15 675.00 Travel to N. Arapahoe for meeting, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming meetings and

debrief.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

3/31/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.2 $ 1,440.00 Travgl to Wind RlV(_ar for Easter Shoshone meeting, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming
meetings and debrief.

3/31/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.8 $ 1,710.00 |Eastern Shoshone meeting.

3/31/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.2 $ 1,890.00 |N. Arapahoe meeting.

3/31/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.5 $ 2,025.00 |Travel to Idaho for meeting with Sho-Ban.
Receipt of request for beneficiary interview for outreach (.1); e-mail to co-

3/31/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.6 300.00|counsel regarding request (.1); review articles in Potawatomi News for outreach
(.1); review inquiries from beneficiaries (.3).

. Review of fee materials per Mr. Dorris' request (.8); review media coverage and

4/1/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 1.0 205.00 o
dockets per Mr. Levitas' request (.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);

4/1/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 08 188.00|"€ViEW phone message from beneflc!ary a_nd return call (.1); receive call f_rom
beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding
settlement status (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

4/1/2010 |Dorris, William E. 09 589.50 Reylew press reports on informational me_etlngs _(.3);_ preparing for meetings with
White House personnel next week regarding legislative efforts (.6).

4/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Kirschman, Quinn meet and confer on 23d issue.

4/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Kirschman re same.

4/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Harper re same.

4/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. Dorris re all issues; Yankton Sioux.

4/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call Levitas, Loving re Hill issues.

4/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Levitas re Portland outreach meeting.

4/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. TB re frozen IIM account.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.0 8,325.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/1/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 8.0 2,560.00({Outreach meeting in Seattle.

4/1/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.8 420.00|Strategy conference call with Cobell team.

4/1/2010 |Harper, Keith 75 3,750.00 Travel from Portlgn_d to Seattle for meeting with class members (3.5); appear at
class member briefings (4.0).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.8). Advocacy efforts on

4/1/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 40 1,580.00 Congressional approval of the settlement including; communication with

members of Congress and Congressional staff (1), legislative research (1),
internal and client advocacy strategy meetings, and tribal outreach efforts (1.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

4/1/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 10.0 3,200.00{Meet with Shoshone-Bannock class members, members of the media.

4/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 585.00 |Pre-meeting w/ allottees at Sho-Ban.

4/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 585.00 [Travel to Idaho Falls to return, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming meetings and debrief.

4/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 392 1,440.00 'clj';lj\:%fto Sho-Ban for meeting, incl disc w/ AP re upcoming meetings and

4/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 1,575.00 |Sho-Band meeting.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1);

4/2/2010 (Burns, Joseph V. 0.5 117.50(|review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1); receive call from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

4/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Kirschman re meet and confer.

4/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. TB re status of settlement.

4/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 |Conference call Guilder, Levitas re Hill issues.

4/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.7 $ 7,122.50 |Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement.

4/2/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 6.0 $ 1,920.00|Outreach meetings in Seattle.

4/2/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.9 $ 472.50|Strategy call with Cobell team.

. Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.4); call with tribal leaders

4/2/2010 - \Harper, Keith L4 $ 700.00 (.4); call with Chris Mansour (.3); call with Mr. Gingold (.3).

4/2/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 14 553.00 Communication with Congressional staff (.5); communications with post-
settlement team members on advocacy efforts (.9).

4/2/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 55 1,760.00 Review mefatlng notes, prepare record of mgetlngs (1.5); debrief with Mr.
Rempel (2); respond to class member questions (2).

4/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 8.0 3,600.00 |Return to DCA, incl disc w/ AP re debrief. Review meeting notes
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.8 8,140.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 185.00 Reylew Reed Elevier v Michnick, 3/2/10 re district ct jurisdiction absent
legislative approval.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 5.0 4,625.00 [names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/512010 |Applegate, Alexis 04 82.00 Review m_edla coverage and do_ckets per Mr. L_eV|tlas request (.2); confirm
Congressional contact information per Mr. Levitas' request. (.2).

4/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 04 370.00 Conference call Loving, Harper, Harmala, Rempel, Guilder, Levitas re Hill

issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
4/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Kirschman re 23d issue.
4/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Provide written response to Kirschman re same.
4/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above; Albuguerque meeting.
4/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Loving re WH meeting.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
4/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.8 $ 9,065.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
4/5/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.4 $ 128.00|Conference call to discuss outreach meetings and legislative issues.
4/5/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.6 $ 315.00|Strategy call with Cobell legislative team.
4/5/2010 |Harper, Keith 0.6 $ 300.00 [Call on settlement implementation.
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.5). Advocacy efforts on
. i Congressional approval of the settlement including; communication with
4/5/2010  |Loving, John-Claude F. 3.5 $ 1,382.50 members of Congress and Congressional staff (1.1), legislative research (1),
internal and client advocacy strategy meetings (.9).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); compile, format,
4/5/2010 |[Pearl, Michael Alexander 3.5 $ 1,120.00|and memorialize names and addresses of individuals requesting information
regarding the Settlement (3).
4/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ team re status and leg update.
4/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 $ 810.00 [Disc w/ DG re settlement and leg meeting.
4/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 [Call Top 300 beneficiaries re settlement (multiple calls).
4/5/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Debrief and close materials from MT-WY-ID trip.
4/52010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 35 $ 1,575.00 @ftkeflomse letter, includes research Osage issue and review questions for
4/6/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.4 $ 82.00|Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request (.4).
Meeting with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harmala and Mr. Guilder
. - preparing for meeting with White House representatives regarding legislative
4/6/2010 |Dorris, William E. 2.6 $ 1,703.00 efforts (.8); meeting with Rob Nabors and Kim Teehee to discuss status of the
legislative efforts (1.2); telephone conference with Ms. Cobell (.6).
4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 |Revise Ask Elouise Letter to class No. VII.
4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Prepare memo to Hill in response to request.
4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 03 $ 277 50 Egg:‘gence call Ms. Cobell, Rempel, Pearl, Harper, Harmala, Levitas re Hill/WH
4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Dorris re WH meeting at 3:00PM.
4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Meet with Loving, Pearl, Rempel et al in preparation for WH meeting.
4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 10 $ 925.00 Meet with DOFF-IS, Loving, Pearl, WH staff re legislative settlement issues;
judgment fund; offsets.

97




Ca

hiPERePAaRR

Elowse%ep

I'I_Iy Je@v%‘f@c‘?&%@%?%ézl nté:ricln?,detoa?./ 1043 \F E_{%%&%?{s%?t@m)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.8 1,665.00 |Conference call Dorris, Loving, Rempel, Pearl, Levitas re post mortem.

4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.5 1,387.50 |Meet with Dorris re all issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.0 5,550.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/6/2010 |Harmala, Robert 20 1,050.00 Meet!ng with W'hlte House staff regarding settlement (1); internal strategy
meeting regarding same (1).

. Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.9); call with Mr. Dorris

4/6/2010 | Harper, Keith 31 1,550.00 and Ms. Cobell to prepare for panel (1.3); discuss Cobell with tribal leaders (.9).
Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.5). Advocacy efforts on
Congressional approval of the settlement including; communication with the

4/6/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 7.5 2,962.50|Administration, members of Congress and Congressional staff, (1) internal and
client advocacy strategy meetings, and tribal outreach efforts (2). Preparation for
meeting with Administration officials (4).
Participate in prep meeting with Mr. Dorris, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

4/6/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 45 1,440.00 ngmala, anq Mr. Guilder regarding s.trategy (2); att.end me?etlng (2); conference
with Mr. Loving as to next steps for Hill strategy (.5); participate and prepare for
Cobell team conference call (1.0).

4/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |[CC w/ team re status and leg update.

4/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 13 $ 585.00 thlé:flowse letter, includes research Osage issue and review questions for

4/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.4 $ 630.00 |[brief and debrief following WH meeting.

4/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.8 $ 1,260.00 |outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/6/2010 |Roth, Katie 01 i Rece'lpt apq review Motion for Permission to Commgnlcatg with Class Members;
e-mail to litigation case team and update electronic files with same.

4/6/2010 |zacks, David M. 05 i Tele_phone conference with prior mediator regarding case status and briefing Mr.
Levitas regarding same.
Preparing outline of Ms. Cobell and my remarks at Albuquerque meeting (2.4);

4/7/2010 |Dorris, William E. 39 2.554.50 telephone conference_ Wlth Jennifer Weddle (moderator) regardlng panel debate
at Federal Bar Association Law Leaders Conference (.4); telephone conferences
with Mr. Harper and Ms. Cobell regarding FBA law leaders conference (1.1).

4/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 185.00 |Conference call Rempel, Guilder, Pearl re all issues.

47712010 |Gingold, Dennis 05 46250 Telt_:oms. Srr_uth re unopposed motion; conference call at 3:30PM with Judge,
Smith and Kirschman re same.

4/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 462.50 |Telcoms. Pearl re same; Hill issues.

98




Elogs%%e&é%%gk\)/épg’tza? K

I'I_Iy Jel;/)vglf @c?&g%%?%ezl nté:ricln?,detoa?./ 1043 \F q%%&?OJQES%%?FH)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

4/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Telcoms. Loving re Hill issues.

4/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel re above.

4/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re Hill; WH issues.

4/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Levitas re House leadership.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.2 $ 7,585.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/7/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.5 $ 262.50|Legislative team strategy meeting.

. Return from West Coast class member visits (5.9); telephone conference on

47712010 \Harper, Keith 7.0 $ 3,500.00 settlement implementation (.5); call with Mr. Dorris (.3); e-mail to beneficiary (.3).

Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.6). Advocacy efforts on
. i Congressional approval of the settlement including; communication with

4/7/2010  |Loving, John-Claude F. 45 $ 1,777.50 members of Congress and Congressional staff (1.5), legislative research (.5),
internal and client advocacy strategy meetings (1.9).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); follow-up with

4/7/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 2.0 $ 640.00|various questions asked by individuals regarding the settlement (.5); correspond
with Administration officials (.5).

4/7/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/7/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/7/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.4 $ 630.00 [Disc w/ DG, DS re status and chambers meetings.
Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request (.4); review

4/8/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 1.1 $ 225.50|transcript of hearing per Mr. Levitas' request (.5); update Congressional contact
information per Mr. Levitas' request (.2).

. - Travel to Santa Fe, New Mexico for FBA Indian Law Leaders panel discussion

4/8/2010  |Dorris, William E. 13.0 $ 8,515.00 on Cobell settlement (9.5); speaking at conference (2); return to Santa Fe (1.5).

4/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 05 $ 462 50 Meet with Levitas, Rempel, Harper, Pearl, Guilder re prep for meeting in
chambers.

4/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Meet with Rempel, Pearl, Harper re same.

4/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 10 $ 925.00 Meet in chambers with Judge, Cobell team, government re status of legislative
settlement efforts.

4/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Telcoms. Holt re same.

4/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Rempel, Smith re post mortem.

4/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Meet with Levitas re same.

4/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Levitas re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.9 $ 6,382.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/8/2010 [Harmala, Robert 0.8 $ 420.00|Strategy meeting, Cobell legislative team.
Pre-meeting with Cobell team prior to conference with Court (.8); hold

4/8/2010 |Harper, Keith 4.3 $ 2,150.00 |conference with Judge Robertson (1.2); debriefing meeting afterwards (.7);
review media material and comment (1.6).
Advocacy efforts on Congressional approval of the settlement including;

4/8/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.0 $ 2.370.00 commqmcaﬂon with members of Congress and Congressional staff 3),
legislative research (1), internal and client advocacy strategy meetings (1.2), and
tribal outreach efforts (.8).

4/8/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 4.0 $ 1,280.00 Pa.rt|C|p§te in prep mgetlng for chgmbers hearmg (1.2); attend chambers hearing
(1); continue preparation of materials for explaining Settlement terms (1.9).

4/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Disc w/ DG, EL re meeting and leg status.

4/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [Chambers meeting w/ Court, parties.

4/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 |Meet w/ team re pre-chambers meetings

4/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/8/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 $ 1,080.00 |Post chambers meeting and follow-up.

4/8/2010 |Roth, Katie 01 $ _|Receipt and review docket entry rt—_:'gardl_ng Status Conference; e-mail to litigation
case team and update electronic files with same.

4/9/2010  |Applegate, Alexis 03 $ 61.50 Review media coverage and dopkets per Mr. Levitas' request (.2); draft
correspondence to team regarding hearing (.1).

4/9/2010 |Dorris, William E. 50 $ 3.275.00 gj:.l;g]t]:gm Albuquerque to Atlanta and preparing email regarding conference

4/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 11 $ 1,017.50 (a:I?ir;f:lzzgce call Rempel, Levitas, Ms. Cobell, Harmala, Guilder, Loving, Pearl re

4/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. TB re settlement status; land consolidation issues.

4/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Levitas re Hill/lWH issues.

4/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Harper re Hill settlement issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.9 $ 6,382.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/9/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.1 352.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

4/9/2010 [Harmala, Robert 1.0 525.00|Legislative strategy call regarding Cobell appropriations with Cobell team.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

4/9/2010 |Harmala, Robert 13 682.50 Strategy cor_lference ca_II (.8);_te|e_phone (_:all Administration regarding tax
extenders bill as potential legislative vehicle (.5).

4/9/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 0.8 316.00|Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call.

4/9/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 20 640.00 Discuss legislative strategy with Mr. Harmala and Mr. Loving (.9); participate and
prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.1).

4/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Disc w/ DG re status and chambers meetings.

4/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.4 $ 1,530.00 |Outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.5 $ 4,162.50 [names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.0 $ 5,550.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review correspondence from beneficiary regarding
Indian issues and prepare memo to Mr. Smith and Mr. Harper regarding same
(.2); review correspondence from beneficiary regarding BIA records and prepare

4/12/2010 (Burns, Joseph V. 1.4 $ 329.00|{memo to Mr. Harper and Mr. Smith regarding same (.2); review correspondence
from beneficiary regarding Cobell information (.1); receive call from beneficiary
regarding settlement status (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding
settlement (.4); update phone log regarding calls and letters (.3).

4/12/2010 |[Dorris, William E. 0.3 $ 196.50|Telephone conference with Mr. Harper regarding legislative strategy.

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Rempel, Guilder, Harper, Harmala, Loving re Hill issues.

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Revise Ask Elouise letter # VIII.

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.0 $ 1,850.00 |Prepare invoice for reimbursement of expenses for South Dakota outreach.

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.1 $ 1,942.50 |Review/revise proposed class notice.

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above; need to intervene in tribal cases.

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Discussion Rempel re settlement issues/Ct options; Hayes; intervention issues.

4/12/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Levitas re same.

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Austin re intervention in tribal cases if settlement is not approved.

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Meet with press re settlement issues; WH; leadership.

101




Case 1

Elotise gep

b8 TE

y JewEnHaGI a:)r)y9 gf%ﬁg In!éirllgr(gi qu(.]ioé]é§e @@86%%19&@ a@H)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.4 1,295.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/12/2010 |[Guilder, Justin M. 1.0 $ 320.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

4/12/2010 |Harmala, Robert 11 $ 577.50|Cobell team strategy call.

. Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.4); talk with Mr. Gingold

4/12/2010 |Harper, Keith 2.4 1,200.00 on next steps (.4); discussion with Mr. Loving (.3); review notice (1.3).

Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (1.3). Advocacy efforts on
. i Congressional approval of the settlement including; communication with

4/12/2010 jLoving, John-Claude F. 1 2,804.50 members of Congress and Congressional staff (2.2), legislative research (1),
internal and client advocacy strategy meetings (2.6).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); work with Mr.

4/12/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 6.5 2.080.00 Lovm.g on legislative ;trategy (4); arrange fo!r individuals signing up at.the Cobell
meetings to have their names added to the list of people receiving notice
regarding the Settlement (1).

4/12/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 |Disc w/ DG re intervention in tribal cases.

4/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Disc w/ DG, status

4/12/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Ask Elouise, Draft and edit.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review April 12, 2010 letter from Ms. Cobell regarding
status of settlement (.2); receive call from David Armstrong, attorney for
beneficiary, regarding land sale/settlement issues (.5); prepare memo to Mr.
Smith and Mr. Harper regarding Armstrong call (.2); receive call from beneficiary

4/13/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. o5 587 50 regarding notice/waiver (..3); review phone message from ben_e_flmary regarding
status and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary and return
call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return
call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return
call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return
call (.3); update phone log regarding calls (.3).

4/13/2010 |[Guilder, Justin M. 0.5 $ 160.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

4/13/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.7 $ 367.50|Cobell strategy call.
Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.4); call with Ms. Cobell

4/13/2010 |Harper, Keith 1.4 700.00 ((.4); discussion with Mr. Loving (.3); telephone conference with White House

(3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

4/13/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

7.5

2,962.50

Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call (.7). Advocacy efforts on
Congressional approval of the settlement including; communication with
Administration (.8), members of Congress and Congressional staff (1.5),
legislative research (.5), internal and client advocacy strategy meetings (2);
preparation for conference call with Administration officials (2).

4/13/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

55

1,760.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); attend conference
call with White House (.7); strategize with Mr. Loving regarding legislative efforts
(1.8); prepare emails and mail outs for those individuals requesting information
regarding the Settlement (1.5); review and comment on form letter initially
drafted by Mr. Rempel for publication on the Cobell website (.5).

4/13/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.3

135.00

CC w/ contractor re outreach firms.

4/13/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/13/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.8

360.00

Draft, edit form letter for Congress.

4/13/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.9

855.00

outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/14/2010

Applegate, Alexis

0.2

w |||

41.00

Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request (.2).

4/14/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

4.6

1,081.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.5);
receive call from beneficiary regarding land issues (.3); review phone message
from anonymous caller regarding settlement and return call (.1); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.4); review phone message from anonymous
caller and return call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and land issues and return call (.7); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding settlement status and return call (.1); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding settlement status and return call (.2); review
phone message from unidentified caller (.1); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding land sales and settlement (.3); receive call from beneficiary
regarding land issues (.7); prepare notes regarding call from beneficiary (.1);
review phone message from unidentified caller and return call (.1); update phone
log regarding calls (.3); file maintenance (.1).

4/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Conference call Harper, Rempel, Harmala, Guilder re above.

4/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.9

832.50

Prepare Cobell litigation time-line for Hill.

4/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.4

370.00

Telcoms. TB's re settlement status; formula.

4/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

185.00

Telcom. Harper re all issues.

4/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.1

AR BB P

1,017.50

Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same; Hill/WH.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

4/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 370.00 [Telcom. Levitas re Hill.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.1 7,492.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/14/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.2 $ 384.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

4/14/2010 [Harmala, Robert 1.2 $ 630.00|Cobell legislative strategy call with Cobell team.
Review and revise long form notice (2.6); discussion regarding same (.5);

4/14/2010 |Harper, Keith 4.4 2,200.00 |telephone conference on settlement implementation (.6); discussion on
arguments being raised regarding settlement (.7).

4/14/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 1.2 474.00|Participate on Post-settlement team Cobell call.
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); assist Mr. Loving

4/14/2010 (Pearl, Michael Alexander 4.0 1,280.00|with drafting materials concerning judicial developments and trips to Indian
Country (3).

4/14/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Disc w/ DG re status.

4/14/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/14/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/15/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.3 $ 61.50|Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request (.3).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review letter from beneficiary regarding settlement and
draft response letter (.7); review letter from beneficiary regarding settlement and
draft response letter (.7); conference with Ms. Deringer regarding call from
beneficiary (.1); review pending beneficiary matters and phone Mr. Smith
regarding same (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding status of case (.2);
receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); receive call from
beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); review letter from beneficiary regarding

4/15/2010 (Burns, Joseph V. 4.7 1,104.50|case information and draft response letter (.5); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.1); review phone message
from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.2); review phone message
from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.3); receive further call
from beneficiary regarding same (.1); update phone log regarding letters and
calls (.3); file maintenance (.1); review file and draft memo to Mr. Harper
regarding issues raised by beneficiary (.6); review pending beneficiary issues
and prepare memo to Mr. Smith regarding same (.2).

4/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Discussion Harper, Rempel re Hill/WH issues.

4/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Loving re Hill issues.

4/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

4/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Holt re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

4/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 740.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Harper, Guilder, Loving, Levitas, Rempel re above.

4/15/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 1.5 $ 480.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

4/15/2010 [Harmala, Robert 0.3 $ 157.50(Strategy call with Cobell team.

. Telephone conference on settlement implementation (1.4); discussion with Mr.

4/15/2010 |Harper, Keith 2.9 1,450.00 Gingold on strategy on Hill (.7) and same with Mr. Loving and Mr. Harmala (.8).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1). Advocacy efforts on

4/15/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 55 2.172.50 Congressional approval of the settlement including; co_mml_Jnlcat|on with
members of Congress and Congressional staff (2), legislative research (.5), and
tribal outreach efforts (2).

4/15/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 45 $ 1,440.00 Part|C|pate anq prepare for Cobell team _conference call (1); conference with Mr.
Loving regarding assessment of legislative outlook (3.5).

4/15/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Disc w/ DG re status.

4/15/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.9 $ 855.00 [outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/15/2010 |Roth, Katie 01 _|Receipt and review docket entry regardl_ng Status Report; e-mail to litigation
case team and update electronic files with same.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary

4/16/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 2.1 493.50|regarding status of settlement and return call (.2); review phone messages from
beneficiaries and return call (.6); draft memo to Mr. Harper regarding beneficiary
call (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding issues (.3); update phone log
regarding calls (.2).

4/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Harper, Guilder, Levitas re above.

4/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom. TB re settlement status.

4/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Loving re Dakota issues.

4/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Harper re above.

4/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Dorris re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.9 8,232.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/16/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.6 315.00|Cobell team strategy call.
Settlement implementation telephone conference (.6); e-mail exchange with

4/16/2010 |Harper, Keith 2.2 1,100.00 |White House (.4); review press release and discuss response to same (.5);

appointment with Senator Inouye (.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.5); communication with

4/16/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 7.0 2,765.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (2); set up meetings for client for
Washington, DC trip the week of April 26th (4.5).

4/16/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 15 $ 480.00 Conference with Mr. Loving and Mr. Harmala (1); participate and prepare for
Cobell team conference call (.5).

4/16/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 [CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/16/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.1 $ 945.00 [outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Holt re settlement status.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.2 $ 6,660.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation order.

4/17/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 3.2 1,264.00 Political research on b_ehalf _of cI_ignt (.8); prepare briefing information and
response to Congressional inquiries (2.4).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.0 6,475.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
notice and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding

4/19/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. o5 587 50 settlement status a.md rgturn call (.2); review phone message from penefic_iary
and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice and
settlement and return call (.3); review letter from beneficiary regarding case
information (.1); draft letter response to beneficiary (.4); review phone message
from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.2); update phone log
regarding calls and letter (.3); file maintenance (.1).

4/19/2010 |Dorris, William E. 09 589.50 Re\_/ievv_ status of legislative efforts (.4); Wor_k_ing on outline of work to be done on
legislative efforts (.2) and attorneys fee petition (.3).

4/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.4 $ 2,220.00 |Review TEB docs, 2d, 5th, 7th, and 9th.

4/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcom ally re judgment fund issues.

4/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call Harper, Loving, Rempel re Hill issues.

4/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Harper re affidavits; Hill.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.7 7,122.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/19/2010 |Harmala, Robert 1.0 525.00|Cobell team strategy call.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.7); call with Mr. Loving to
4/19/2010 |Harper, Keith 2.7 $ 1,350.00 |discuss approach and meetings necessary during Elouise's visit (.8); e-malil
exchange with Patricia Zell (.4); review of media reports (.8).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.0); communication with
4/19/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.3 $ 2,488.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1); set up meetings for client for
Washington, DC trip the week of April 26th (4.1).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); strategize with Mr.
4/19/2010 (Pearl, Michael Alexander 5.5 $ 1,760.00|Loving regarding legislative strategy (.5); attend meetings with Mr. Loving on
Capitol Hill (4).
4/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |CC w/ EC
4/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status.
4/19/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [Disc w/ DG re status and update.
4/19/2010 |Smith, David C. 1.0 $ 500.00|Conference call with co-counsel.
4/20/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 1.8 $ 369.00|Finalize fee research per Mr. Dorris' request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
4/20/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 09 $ 211.50 recelv_e_call from b_enef|C|ary regarding notlt?e/walver (.2); receive caII_from
beneficiary regarding settlement status (.4); update phone log regarding calls
(.1).
4/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Revise Ask Elouise letter # IX.
4/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 07 $ 647 50 ggﬂgesrence call Loving, Levitas, Pearl, Harmala, Guilder, Harper, Rempel re Hill
4/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re all issues.
4/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. TB's re settlement status; scope of class.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
4/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.3 $ 7,677.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
4/20/2010 |[Guilder, Justin M. 0.7 224.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.
4/20/2010 [Harmala, Robert 0.8 420.00|Legislative strategy call regarding Cobell appropriations with Cobell team.
4/20/2010 |Harper, Keith 13 $ 650.00 Participate in telephone conference on se_ttlement implementation (1.1); arrange
self-governance conference speaker (Smith) (.2).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.8); communication with
4/20/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 5.6 $ 2,212.00|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (3); political and legislative research on
appropriations and budget legislation on Capitol Hill (1.8).
4/20/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 0.8 $ 256.00|Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.8).
4/20/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [CC w/ team re leg update and status.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

4/20/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 675.00 |outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.

4/20/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 1.9 855.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.3); receive phone call from beneficiary regarding

4/21/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 14 329.00|notice (.2); review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1); receive
call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary
regarding settlement status (.5); update phone log regarding calls (.2).

4/21/2010 |[Dorris, William E. 0.8 $ 524.00|Preparing emails to beneficiary.

4/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call all hands re Hill issues.

4/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Provide written response to TB re appropriations issues.

4/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 07 $ 647 50 _Re_vie_W_Perdue and Gaubert re FTCA/discretionary functions/exceptions; dist ct
jurisdiction absent Cong approval.

4/21/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom Dorris re Perdue.

4/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.4 8,695.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/21/2010 [Harmala, Robert 0.5 262.50|Cobell team legislative strategy call.
E-mail exchanges and brief meeting with Mr. Gingold on settlement

4/21/2010 |[Harper, Keith 0.8 400.00 |implementation (.3); discussions with Robert Harmala and Mr. Loving (.3);
review and comment on response to Craven (.2).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.5); communication with

4/21/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 3.7 1,461.50|Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (2). Political and legislative research on
appropriations and budget legislation on Capitol Hill (1.2).

4/21/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 20 $ 640.00 Par;icipate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); conference with Mr.
Loving and Mr. Harmala (1.5).

4/21/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/21/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update.

4/21/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [Review Supreme Ct. Decision re attorneys fees and disc w/ DG.

4/21/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |outreach to IC re settlement - speak with beneficiaries re same.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver

4/22/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.5 $ 117.50((.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement (.3); update
phone log regarding calls (.1).

4/22/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 0.2 $ 104.00|Telephone conference with Mr. Levitas regarding strategy on settlement.

4/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. TB re status of settlement.

4/22/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.6 $ 1,480.00 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re all issues.

4/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call all hands re Hill issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
. . names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
4/22/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.4 $ 8,695.00 retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Call on settlement implementation (.3); discussion on next steps in light of
4/22/2010 |Harper, Keith 1.6 $ 800.00 [congressional leadership statement (.5); make calls on language translation
services at Cherokee (.8).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.3); communication with
4/22/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 71 $ 2.804.50 Congregspnal staff on Cobell .settl.ement (2)..POI|t|.cal and legislative researgh on
appropriations and budget legislation on Capitol Hill (.3). Follow up on meeting
requests for client for Washington, DC trip the week of April 26th (4.5).
4/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status.
4/22/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update.
4/22/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Review Long form notice, incl disc w/ DS.
4/22/2010 |Smith, David C. 38 $ 1,900.00 Review enharjced fee award cases _(.7); re_\/leW/reV|se long form notice and
conference with Mr. Rempel regarding notice (3.1).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: conference with Mr. Smith regarding pending
beneficiary issues (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
4/23/2010 (Burns, Joseph V. 1.2 $ 282.00|notice/waiver and return call (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.5); update
phone log regarding calls (.1).
4/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 03 $ 277 50 i(;gg;esrence call Pearl, Harmala, Ms. Cobell, Loving, Rempel, Guilder re Hill
4/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Discussions Rempel re all issues, including fee petition.
4/23/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. Harper re same.
4/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Loving re Hill issues.
4/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re senate leadership; Hill issues.
4/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. TB re settlement status.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
. . names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
4/23/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.6 $ 7,955.00 retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
4/23/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.5 $ 262.50|Cobell team legislative strategy update call.
4/23/2010 |Harper, Keith 0.3 $ 150.00 |Telephone conference on settlement implementation.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.5); communication with
. i Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (1). Follow up on meeting requests for
4/23/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 55 $ 2,172.50 client for Washington, DC trip the week of April 26th (3); communications with
post-settlement team members on advocacy efforts (1).
. Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); meet with Hill staff
4/23/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 2.5 $ 800.00 (.5); conference with Mr. Loving on legislative strategy and outreach (1.5).
4/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status.
4/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [Disc w/ DG re status and update.
4/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 $ 810.00 [Disc w/ DG re fees and application.
4/23/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Review Long form notice, incl disc w/ DS.
Discussions regarding outreach to beneficiaries at self governance conference
4/23/2010 [Smith, David C. 0.9 $ 450.00|(.4); review reports from Congress on status of settlement approval (.3); emails
with Mr. Quinn and Mr. Rempel regarding long form notice (.2).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
. . names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
4/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.4 $ 6,845.00 retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
4/24/2010 |Harper, Keith 06 $ 300.00 E-mall_exchanges on Reid and Pelosi support; discussion with Mr. Loving
regarding same.
Communication with Congressional staff on Cobell settlement (.5). Meeting
4/24/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 25 $ 987.50|request efforts and meeting preparation for client April 27-29 Washington, DC
visit (2).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
4/25/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 5.6 $ 5,180.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns
4/25/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 20 $ 790.00 Follpw up on meeting requests for client for Washington, DC trip the week of
April 26th (2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.3);
4/26/2010 (Burns, Joseph V. 0.5 $ 117.50(receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1); update phone log
regarding calls (.1).
Emails regarding potential attorney fee issues (.8); telephone conference with
4/26/2010 |[Dorris, William E. 1.3 $ 851.50(Mr. Gingold regarding status of legislative discussions and legal issues in judicial
approval process (.5).
4/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.5 1,387.50 |Discussions Rempel re all issues.
4/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 04 370.00 'Fl)'gli(;i%n;. Yang, SG's office, re additional extension for filing response to cert
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

4/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Email to Cobell team issues implicated in SG discussion.

4/26/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call all hands re Hill issues; SG.

4/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Harper re SG, DOJ, cert petition issues.

4/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Loving re legislative issues.

4/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

4/26/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcoms. Levitas re all issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 78 7.215.00 names, facts, re privilege/confidgntial iss_ue;, including prqtective qrders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 370.00 [Telcom press re status of settlement.

4/26/2010 [Harmala, Robert 0.5 262.50|Cobell team legislative strategy call.

4/26/2010 |Harper, Keith 0.3 150.00 |Telephone conference on settlement implementation.
Preparation for and conference call with Mr. Rempel, Mr. Gingold; Mr. Pearl, Mr.
Harper, Mr. Harmala and Mr. Loving regarding Cobell legislation (.7); telephone

4/26/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 1.7 1,232.50|conference with Mr. Loving regarding Cobell meeting schedule, Rahall and
Hoyer (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding congressional staff
contact and White House staff activity and offset information (.6).
Participate on Post Settlement Cobell call (.7). Preparation for meetings with

4/26/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 7.4 2,923.00(client on Capitol Hill 4/27-2/29 (5.2); communications with post-settlement team
members on advocacy efforts (1.5).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); preparation of

4/26/2010 (Pearl, Michael Alexander 2.5 800.00|materials to be used in meetings with Hill staff (.5); conference with Mr. Loving
on strategy (1.5).

4/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 [CC w/ team re leg update and status.

4/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 |Draft, edit Ask Elouise.

4/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.7 $ 765.00 [Disc w/ DG re status and update.

4/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.0 $ 900.00 [Review notice plan
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1); review email and
phone message from beneficiary regarding notice received (.2); draft email
response to beneficiary regarding his inquiry (.2); review phone message from

4/27/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.9 446.50|beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.3); review phone message

from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.1); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding status of settlement and return call (.3);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding status and return call (.3);
update phone log regarding calls and email (.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
4/27/2010 |Dorris, William E. 12 $ 786.00 Telephor_le (_:onfere_nce with team regarding discussions on Hill today and
strategy in light of it.
4/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.5 $ 2,312.50 |Meet with Ms. Cobell, et al. re all issues.
4/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom press re status of settlement.
4/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Levitas re Hill issues; WH.
4/27/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel re same.
4/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Dorris re all issues; case management.
4/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Harper re WH staff; DOI.
4/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom ally re DOJ issues; settlement.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
. . names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
4/27/2010 | Gingold, Dennis 7.6 $ 7,030.00 retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
4/27/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 03 96.00 Draft and revise correspondence to Mr. Loving regarding legislative issue in
South Dakota.
4/27/2010 [Harmala, Robert 1.4 735.00{Meeting with Senate staff (.4); legislative strategy team meeting (1).
Meeting on Congressional meetings preparation with litigation team (.4); discuss
4/27/2010 |[Harper, Keith 1.8 $ 900.00 |regarding ATNI meeting (.3); call from Mr. Loving (.4); call with White House (.2);
Review Barrasso letter (.5).
Conference call with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harmala, Mr.
412712010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 13 $ 942 50 Rempel, Mr. Harper, Mr. Dorris a_nd Mr. Guilder regarding Cobell legislation and
reports from Congressional meetings and House and Senate strategy offsets
and emergency spending.
Attended meetings with client on Capitol Hill and with Settlement team; (7.5)
4/27/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 12.0 $ 4,740.00|conference call with Administration; (1) communications with post-settlement
team members on advocacy efforts (3.5).
Attend prep meeting with Cobell team (3); attend meetings with Hill staff with Ms.
. Cobell and Mr. Loving (4.5); conference with Mr. Loving, Mr. Rempel, and Mr.
4/27/2010 - |Pearl, Michael Alexander 9.5 $ 3,040.00 Gingold (.5); conference with Mr. Harmala regarding legislative strategy (1);
participate in "weekly" White House conference call (.5).
4/27/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [Review notice plan
4/27/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.1 $ 495.00 |Disc w/ DG, JL re status and update.
4/27/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 |Meet w/ AP, JL, DG re leg update and meetings on Hill.
4/27/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and status (2 meetings, includes post meetings).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver

4/28/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 08 $ 188.00 (.3); receive pall from bgneﬂmgry regardmg stettlenjent status (.1); receive call
from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); receive call from beneficiary
regarding status (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

4/28/2010 |Dorris, William E. 11 $ 720.50 Mgetlng with M.r. Lovmg rggardlng legislative efforts (.5); meeting with Mr.
Gingold regarding legislative efforts (.6).

4/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.8 $ 1,665.00 |Meet with Ms. Cobell and Hill staff re settlement issues.

4/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 5.2 $ 4,810.00 |Meet with Ms. Cobell re all issues; Dorris participation in part of meeting.

4/28/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Loving re Hill issues.

4/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 (Meet with Dorris re Hill issues.

4/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. TB's re scope of settlement class; status

4/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re Hill issues.

4/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Dorris re same.

4/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Harper re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

. . names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-

4/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.6 $ 4,255.00 retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/28/2010 |Harper, Keith 29 $ 1,100.00 Presentauon_ to Arizona trlb_es (1.6); call_/meetmg with others on the litigation
team regarding settlement implementation (.6).
Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold concerning White House conference
and meeting with Congressman (.5); conference with Mr. Gingold and Mr.

4/28/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 18 $ 1,305.00 Rempel concerning report on meetm_g with .Sarah Garland _(Senator Conrad) and
follow-up strategy based on information (.5); conference with Mr. Rempel and
Mr. Loving regarding legislation action plan based on Garland information;
preparation for meeting with Majority Leader (.8).

4/28/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 35 $ 1,382.50 Eﬁlrt(lglg?te in post-settlement conference call (1). Meetings with client on Capitol

4/28/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 1.0 $ 320.00|Conference with Mr. Loving and Mr. Rempel regarding legislative strategy (1).

4/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ DG re update and meetings w Hill.

4/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ EL, JL re same.

4/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.4 $ 630.00 [Disc w/ DG re status and update.

4/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Review notice plan

4/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Contact IC re settlement and answer questions.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement status and return
call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding status of settlement
and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary and return call (.1);

4/29/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.7 399.50|review email and return call to beneficiary (.1); receive call from beneficiary
regarding settlement (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver and return call (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding land
sale (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding status (.2); update phone log
regarding calls (.2).
Meeting with Mr. Gingold regarding strategy in light of discussions on Hill (.3);

4/29/2010 |[Dorris, William E. 1.8 1,179.00|review reports of yesterday's and today's meetings on the Hill (.4); working on
outline and time line for post-legislative actions (1.1).

4/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.0 $ 1,850.00 |Meet with Holt, Rempel re all issues, e.g., legislative concerns.

4/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Meet with Loving, Pearl, Levitas re same.

4/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same.

4/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Dorris re above.

4/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re same; hearing.

4/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Yang, SG's office, re extension for response to cert petition.

4/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.7 $ 6,197.50 |Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., rent.

4/29/2010 |Harper, Keith 0.4 200.00 |Call with Mr. Gingold; call with Mr. Loving regarding settlement implementation.
Conference with Congressman, Ms. Cobell, Mr. Loving, Mr. Pearl and

4/29/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 3.5 2,537.50(Congressional aide (2.5); debriefing conference with Mr. Gingold; Mr. Rempel,
Mr. Holt, Mr. Loving and Mr. Pearl (1).

4/29/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 93 3.673.50 Attended meetings with client on Capitol Hill (7.5). Debriefing with Cobell
settlement team (1.8).
Attend meetings on Capitol Hill with members and staffers with Ms. Cobell and

4/29/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 8.5 2,720.00(Mr. Loving (7); conference with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Rempel and Mr. Loving
regarding the substance of Capitol Hill meetings (1.5).

4/29/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [Disc w/ DG re status and update.

4/29/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 $ 810.00 [Meet w/ team re meetings on Hill.

4/29/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 2.7 $ 1,215.00 |Contact IC re settlement and answer guestions.

4/29/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.8 $ 1,260.00 |Meet w/ TH, DG re status.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.2); return call to beneficiary regarding settlement
status (.1); return call to beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.1); return call to

4/30/2010 (Burns, Joseph V. 1.2 282.00|beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive
call from beneficiary regarding attorney referral (.2); update phone log regarding
calls (.2).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

4/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 57 5.272.50 names, facts, re privilege/confide_ntial iss_ues, including prqtective qrders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

4/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 Telcom. Kirschman re threats of violence made against named plaintiffs et al re
settlement.

4/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms. LaRose re same.

4/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Eva Cobell re same.

4/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Pearl re same.

4/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |[Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same.

4/30/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Meet with Rempel, Pearl re same; options.

4/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Discuss same with Rempel.

4/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Conference call Pearl, Rempel, Loving Harper, Levitas re above.

4/30/2010 [Harmala, Robert 0.6 $ 315.00|Prepare legislative strategy email for Cobell team.
Call with litigation team on developments of legislation authorizing litigation

4/30/2010 |Harper, Keith 1.2 $ 600.00 [settlement (.6); e-mail exchange on settlement (.3); review letter threatening
violence to Ms. Cobell (3).

4/30/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 05 362,50 Conference caI_I with Mr. Gingold_, Mr. Loving, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Harper and Mr.
Rempel regarding Cobell legislation.
Cobell settlement team conference call and strategy session (1.2). Follow up

4/30/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 5.9 2,330.50(with Congressional offices on meetings 4/27-4/29 (3.5); communications with
post-settlement team members on advocacy efforts (1.2).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); conference with Mr.

4/30/2010 (Pearl, Michael Alexander 2.5 800.00|Gingold and Mr. Rempel and Elouise regarding the receipt of a letter from
disgruntled faction of Indians (2).

4/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [CC w/ team re update.

4/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.7 $ 765.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update.

4/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.2 $ 990.00 [Disc threat letter received by named plaintiffs. research consequences.

4/30/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.4 $ 1,530.00 |Contact IC re settlement and answer questions.

5/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 10 $ 925.00 Telcoms. Pearl re Hill issues; due diligence issue; discretion re district court

jurisdiction.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/1/2010

Gingold, Dennis

7.3

$ 6,752.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/2/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.2

$ 1,110.00

Review/revise memo re Judgment Fund.

5/2/2010

Gingold, Dennis

7.1

$ 6,567.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/3/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

13

$ 305.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review email from beneficiary regarding settlement and
draft response email (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.3); review Cobell Settlement website
regarding updates (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding land
sale and return call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement and return call (.2); update phone log regarding calls and email (.1).

5/3/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.8

$ 740.00

Conference call Ms. Cobell, et al re above; all issues.

5/3/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.8

$ 740.00

Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re threats; WH issues; Hill.

5/3/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

$ 185.00

Telcom. Levitas re same.

5/3/2010

Gingold, Dennis

10.2

$ 9,435.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/3/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

0.5

$ 160.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

5/3/2010

Harmala, Robert

3.7

$ 1,942.50

Telephone conference with Cobell strategy team (.5); Telephone calls and
meetings with members of the Blue Dog coalition regarding emergency spending
designation (3.2).

5/3/2010

Harper, Keith

11

$ 550.00

Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.4); review update on bill;
revise press re: certain tribal oppositions (.5); edit and provide particulars to Mr.
Smith (.2).

5/3/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

11

$ 797.50

Preparation for and conference call with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Loving,
Mr. Pearl and Ms. Cobell regarding Cobell legislation (.6); telephone conference
with Congressman's staff regarding follow up (.5).

5/3/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

6.5

$ 2,567.50

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.5). Advocacy efforts on
Congressional approval of the settlement including; communication with
members of Congress and Congressional staff (1.2), legislative research (2),
internal and client advocacy strategy meetings (1.5), and tribal outreach efforts
(1.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

5/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ team re update.

5/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Disc w/ BD re status and update

5/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Disc w/ DG re status and update.

5/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [Disc threat letter received by named plaintiffs. research consequences.

5/3/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.6 $ 720.00 [Contact IC re settlement and answer questions.

5/3/2010 |Roth, Katie 01 Rgce!pt and review docket entry regardlng F:obe!l Status Report; e-mail to
litigation case team and update electronic files with same.
Discussions with Mr. Harper regarding self-governance conference to speak to

5/3/2010 |Smith. David C. 10 500.00 ben.ef|C|ar|es (.4); discussions with Ms. Pittman on self-governance confe.renc.e
(.2); research on speakers for self-governance conference on Cobell (.3); review
extension of time for response to certiorari petition by DOJ (.1).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
settlement status and return call (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding land
issues (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and
return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding status and

5/4/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 24 564.00 return call (.2)5 review phone message from beneﬁqary regardmg settlement and
return call (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return
call (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding case information (.2); draft letter
to beneficiary regarding same (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.2); review
letter to Mr. Harper from "Hereditary Chiefs" regarding an objection to the
settlement agreement (.1); conference with Mr. Smith regarding same (.1); file
maintenance (.1).

5/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 740.00 [Revise Ask Elouise letter # X.

5/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 03 277 50 Cpnference call Rempel, Loving, Harmala, Guilder, Pearl, Levitas, Ms. Cobell re
Hill issues.

5/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 647.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re bicameral leadership meeting re settlement; all issues.

5/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcom. Levitas re same, including House approp issues.

5/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Harper re House approp issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 85 7.862.50 names, facts, re pr|V|Iege/c0nf|de_nt|aI issues, including prqtectwe Qrders/ant|-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/4/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.4 128.00|Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

5/4/2010 |Harmala, Robert 09 472 50 Strategy call with Cobell team (.6); telephone calls Speaker staff regarding

schedule (.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

5/4/2010 |Harper, Keith 0.6 300.00 |Telephone conference on settlement implementation.
Conference call with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Smith, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Loving, Mr.
Harmala and Mr. Pearl regarding Cobell legislation (.6); telephone conference
with aide in Congressional office regarding status of Cobell legislation and mark
up of more supplemental appropriation and issues relating to Cobell legislation

5/4/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 23 1,667.50 (.8); further telephone conference with Congreesienal aide r.egarding schedulir?g
of Cobell legislation and supplemental appropriations and bi-cameral leadership
meeting (.3); telephone conferences and email exchanges with Mr. Gingold
regarding scheduling of supplemental appropriation; email exchanges with Mr.
Harmala and Mr. Gingold regarding supplemental appropriations bill, education
bill, scheduling and Congressional action on Cobell legislation (.6).
Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.6). Advocacy efforts on

5/4/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 2.3 908.50|Congressional approval of the settlement including; internal and client advocacy
strategy meetings (1.7).

5/4/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 0.6 192.00|Participate in Cobell team conference call.

5/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Disc threat letter received by named plaintiffs. research consequences.

5/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re update.

5/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.0 $ 450.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update.

5/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Contact IC re settlement and answer questions.

5/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.9 $ 1,305.00 |Draft, edit Ask Elouise.
Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislative efforts (.6); conference with
Mr. Harper regarding outreach to beneficiaries for meeting at Salt River (.3);
prepare for meeting with beneficiaries (4.2); review statement of Senator

5/4/2010 |Smith, David C. 5.9 2,950.00(Barrasso on Cobell legislation (.3); emails with Mr. Derrick regarding beneficiary
meeting (.2); email from Mr. Burns regarding beneficiary inquiry (.1); review NPR
interview with Ms. Cobell regarding Barrasso letter in preparation for beneficiary
meeting (.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding

5/5/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.4 94.00|settlement and return call (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

5/5/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 1.0 520.00|Attend strategy conference call with co-counsel.

5/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 15 1,387.50 Conference calls all hands re all issu_es, e.g, retirement of Judge Robertson,
transfer of case to Judge Hogan, legislative efforts in House/Senate.

5/5/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.1 $ 1,017.50 |Telcoms. Harper re same.

5/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Dorris re same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/5/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.9

1,757.50

Meet with Boyd re black farmers' Hill issues/linkage to Caobell.

5/5/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.

5/5/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

AR\ h

185.00

Telcom. Levitas re same.

5/5/2010

Gingold, Dennis

5.9

5,457.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/5/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.3

416.00

Conference calls to discuss legislative issues.

5/5/2010

Harmala, Robert

5.3

2,782.50

Cobell team strategy calls (1.6); telephone calls Blue Dog coalition (3.4);
telephone call staff of Senator regarding Pigford hold (.3).

5/5/2010

Harper, Keith

2.2

1,100.00

Call with team on settlement implementation (1.5); call with Judge Robertson
and set up call with Judge Robertson (.3); second call with Brian Hauck (.2) and
conference call with Cherokee Nation about letter (.2).

5/5/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

5.3

3,842.50

Conference call with Mr. Harmala, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Gingold and Mr. Harper
regarding Cobell legislation (1); follow up telephone conference with Mr. Gingold
concerning legislation and bi-cameral leadership meeting (.5); review and
analyze Quarterly Report from government; telephone conference with Mr.
Rempel regarding Judge Robertson and replace and impact on settlement (.2);
telephone conference with Majority Leader staff regarding scheduling of
supplemental and status of Cobell legislation (.2); review and analyze "Ask
Elouise" letter; telephone conference with Mr. Rempel regarding same (.1);
conference call with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Loving, Mr.
Guilder and Mr. Rempel regarding Cherokee Tribe letter regarding Senator, the
designation of a new judge, proposed status conference with Congress and
others, the Cobell legislation and timing (1.2); telephone conference with Mr.
Gingold regarding Cherokee Nation letter and Senator and Judge Robertson's
meeting with House and Senate counsel (.2); review letter from Cherokee Nation
response by Mr. Harper and report; draft and analysis of Cherokee Nation
position by Mr. Rempel; draft memorandum to team regarding response to
Cherokee National letter and revised position of Cherokee Nation (1.9).

5/5/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

5.5

1,760.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (2); conference with Mr.
Gingold and Mr. Rempel regarding legislative strategy and meet with John Boyd
(2.3); participate in conference call regarding response to Hill statements (1.2).

5/5/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.9

405.00

Disc w/ DG re status and update.

5/5/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

15

@A

675.00

Contact IC re settlement and answer guestions.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/5/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.8

810.00

CC w/ team re update (2 calls).

5/5/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.2

990.00

Response to Cherokee letter - review and analyze.

5/5/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.3

AR h

1,035.00

Meet w/ J. Boyd (Black farmers) re settlement and DG, AP.

5/5/2010

Smith, David C.

12.7

6,350.00

Review report on status of legislation (.1); prepare for beneficiary meeting (.7);
travel to the airport (.5); travel to Phoenix (5.5); travel to Scottsdale (.7); attend
meeting of beneficiaries and tribal leaders to debate Cobell Settlement with
opponents (2.5); conference call with Mr. Gingold and co-counsel regarding
legislative efforts and call from court (.5); telephone conversation with Judge
Robertson (.1); telephone conversation with Mr. Dorris regarding beneficiary
meeting (.3); telephone conversation with Mr. Harper regarding beneficiary
meeting (.3); telephone conversation with Mr. Harper regarding Cherokee
response to Barrasso letter (.2); emails with Mr. Rempel regarding meeting with
Justice and Ms. Kinsella on long form notice (.1); begin return trip to DC from
outreach meeting (1.2).

5/6/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.0

235.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary (.1); review
email correspondence from beneficiary regarding settlement and draft response
(.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call
(.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and return call
(.4); update phone log regarding calls and email (.1).

5/6/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Telcom. Ms. Cobell re all issues.

5/6/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.7

647.50

Telcoms. Levitas re Hill issues.

5/6/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.7

647.50

Conference call all hands re above.

5/6/2010

Gingold, Dennis

10.5

9,712.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/6/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.0

320.00

Conference call on legislative issues (.7); discuss same with Mr. Pearl (.3).

5/6/2010

Harmala, Robert

3.8

1,995.00

Cobell team legislative strategy call (.8); telephone calls and meetings with
House Appropriators regarding supplemental appropriations legislation (3).

5/6/2010

Harper, Keith

14

700.00

Cherokee Nation -- deal with letter (.3); telephone conference with team on
settlement implementation (.7); call with White House on settlement (4).

5/6/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.8

580.00

Conference call with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Guilder, Mr. Harper and Mr. Loving
regarding Cobell legislation.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (.8); advocacy efforts on
Congressional approval of the settlement including, communication with

5/6/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.0 $ 2,370.00{members of Congress and Congressional staff (2); legislative research (.7);
internal and client advocacy strategy meetings (1.8); call with Administration
officials (.7).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.2); reach out to
individuals in Nebraska and South Dakota regarding newspaper reporter who

5/6/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 5.5 $ 1,760.00|requested a source for discussing the Cobell settlement (1); participate in WH
conference call (.5); prepare materials and scheduling for legislative strategy (1);
conference with Mr. Loving on WH and legislative strategy (1.8).

5/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update.

5/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ DOJ re compacting, incl brief DG and write up memo.

5/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re update.

5/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.5 $ 1,575.00 |Contact IC re settlement and answer questions.

5/6/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 5.7 $ 2,565.00 |Follow up on Notice and review Notice Plan.
Travel from Phoenix to DC from outreach meeting (9); email to Mr. Harper
regarding meeting (.1); review Congressional report on legislation (.1);

5/6/2010 |Smith, David C. 10.7 $ 5,350.00|conference call with co-counsel regarding status of legislation (.8); discussions
regarding long form notice (.3); discussions with Mr. Austin regarding beneficiary
question (.3); review email from Mr. Loving in Barrasso letter (.1).

5/7/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.2 $ 4700 Col_t)ell Be_neficiary Line: review phone message from bene_ficiary regarding
notice/waiver and return call (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. TB re "notice and waiver" sent by DOI re 1IM land.

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. TB re settlement status/issues/timing.

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Conference call all hands re above.

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 06 $ 555.00 Confererjce call Loving, Pearl, Ms. Cobell re senate leadership; unanimous
consent issues.

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Discussions Rempel re same.

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. Harper re above.

5/7/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Loving re all Hill issues.

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re Senate leadership issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/7/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.3 $ 5,827.50 names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-

retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/7/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

11

352.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues.

5/7/2010

Harmala, Robert

2.3

1,207.50

Cobell team strategy call (1.1); , telephone calls Blue Dogs regarding emergency
spending designation (1.2).

5/7/2010

Harper, Keith

13

$ 650.00

Conference on settlement implementation (.2); call with White House (.3); call
with Mr. Gingold (.8)

5/7/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

11

$ 797.50

Conference call with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Pearl
and Mr. Guilder regarding Cobell legislation.

5/7/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

13

$ 942.50

Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding the Senator Reid unanimous
consent request and background and impact on legislative efforts (.4); additional
telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding Cobell legislation and efforts to
rely on judgment fund (.3); review of judgment fund (.1); review of email
exchange regarding reliance on judgment and review and analysis of
memoranda of judgment fund activities (.5).

5/7/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

7.0

$ 2,765.00

Participate on Post Settlement team Cobell call (1.1). Advocacy efforts on
Congressional approval of the settlement including; communication with
members of Congress and Congressional staff (1.1), legislative research (.5),
internal and client advocacy strategy meetings (3), and tribal outreach efforts
(1.2).

5/7/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

55

$ 1,760.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); prepare
memorandum to Mr. Loving regarding Hill strategy (3); conference with Mr.
Loving on legislative strategy (.5); communicate with Hill staff (.5); conference
with Mr. Gingold and Ms. Cobell and Mr. Loving on Senate leadership (.5).

5/7/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

CC w/ team re update.

5/7/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.1

495.00

Follow up on Notice and review Notice Plan.

5/7/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.3

585.00

Disc w/ DG re status and update.

5/7/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.5

1,125.00

Contact IC re settlement and answer questions.

5/7/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

3.5

*R|R|B|B (P

1,575.00

Review NARF attorney fee documentation

5/7/2010

Smith, David C.

3.5

$ 1,750.00

Conference call with co-counsel on legislative efforts and Barrasso letter (1);
emails regarding response to Barrasso letter (.3); meeting with Mr. Gingold and
Mr. Rempel regarding Barrasso letter (.2); review CBO letter to Hastings (.3);
review efforts by Senator on passage of Cobell legislation and emails with co-
counsel (.4); review budget tracker newsletter for legislation (.1); discussions
with Mr. Dorris regarding Barrasso letter to tribes on legislation and review of
American Law Daily article to be prepared for beneficiary calls (.2); review
documents for fee petition (.8); email to Mr. Gingold regarding Barrasso letter
response (.2).

122




C

Elou

b8 TE

Hy JQVPe‘ﬁ,“é‘é%r% a:)r)y9 gf%ﬁg In!éirllgr(gi qu(.]ioé]é§e l\!:c))ags&i%lggg a@H)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
. . names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
5/8/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.4 $ 5,920.00 retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.] [See
reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
5/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.4 $ 5,920.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
5/9/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 25 $ 987.50|Communication with Congress and Congressional staff on Cobell settlement.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding case status and
5/10/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 08 $ 188.00 probate issues (.3).; review phone message from beneflc_lary regard_lng status
and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding status and
return call (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1).
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference call Rempel, Levitas re all issues; fee petition.
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Charnes re Judgment Fund issues.
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 03 $ 277 50 Conference call Ms. C;opell, Levitas, Harper, Loving, Harmala, Pearl, Smith,
Guilder, Rempel re Hill issues.
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Discussions with Loving Hill issues; strategy.
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Pearl re same.
5/10/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Conference call Levitas, loving re same.
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Rempel re same.
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Levitas re Judgment Fund; above.
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re all issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
5/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.3 $ 7,677.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
5/10/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.4 $ 210.00|Strategy call regarding Sen. Reid Amendment with Cobell team.
5/10/2010 |Harmala, Robert 06 $ 315.00 Meetln.g with Repybllpan appropriators regarding funding of settlement and
potential GOP objections.
5/10/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.7 $ 367.50|Review Senator Reid settlement amendment.
Telephone calls to gather information and urge support of settlement to Speaker
5/10/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.7 $ 367.50 Pelosi staff (.3): Rep. Clyburn staff (.4).
5/10/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.8 $ 420.00|Cobell post-settlement strategy call with Cobell team and Ms. Cobell.
5/10/2010 |Harper, Keith 11 $ 550.00 Telephone conference with litigation team on settlement implementation and

input from our lobbyist (.9); call with Brian Hauck (.2)
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Conference call with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Loving, Mr.
Harmala and Mr. Guilder regarding Cobell legislation (.8); telephone
conferences with Mr. Gingold concerning status of legislation and information
feedback from Mr. Charnes regarding Pirelli (1.2); telephone conference with
. . congressional aide regarding status of legislation and tax extenders vehicles
5/10/2010  |Levitas, Elliott H. 31 $ 2,247.50 (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding information from aide (.2);
telephone conference with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Loving regarding aide's
information and tax extenders legislation as vehicle (.5); telephone conference
with Mr. Gingold regarding follow up on congressional aide's information and
preparation for conference call (.2).
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.3);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
5/10/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 95 $ 3.752.50 with members of Cong.ress anq Copgressmnal stgff (2.2);.pol|t|cal and Ieg|§lat|ve
research on Congressional legislation and committee business that potentially
effects the Cobell settlement (2.5); Cobell post-settlement team and individual
legislative strategy discussions (3.5).
5/10/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 20 $ 640.00 Part.|C|pate and prepare for Copell tegm cpnference call (.5); conference with Mr.
Loving and Mr. Gingold regarding legislative strategy (1.5).
5/10/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Disc w/ DG.
5/10/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re update.
5/10/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.7 $ 1,215.00 |Contact IC re settlement and answer questions.
. . Conference call with co-counsel on legislation (1.8); emails regarding work on 23
5/10/2010 | Smith, David C. 15 $ 750.00 b2 classes (.3); email to Senator Burr's assistant on status of legislation (.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
5/11/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.5 $ 117.50((.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding status of settlement (.2); update
phone log regarding calls (.1).
5/11/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell et al re Hill issues.
5/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Smith re same.
5/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Harper re Senate options; hearing.
5/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Levitas re above.
5/11/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Review Aetna, 59 F.2d 2, 142 (2d Cir. 1999).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
5/11/2010 ([Gingold, Dennis 9.9 $ 9,157.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

5/11/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.5 160.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

5/11/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.4 $ 210.00|Strategy and update call with White House Cobell team.

5/11/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.5 $ 262.50|Review responses to questions by conservative legislators.

5/11/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.6 $ 315.00|Strategy call with post-settlement team.
Find translators for DVDs (.6); telephone conference on settlement

5/11/2010 |Harper, Keith 1.6 800.00 |implementation (.4); discussion of $1.4 billion with Brian Hauck (Reid Bill) (.2);
White House call (.4).

5/11/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 05 362.50 Cpnference call with Ms. CobeII., Mr. Loving, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Harper, Mr.
Gingold and Mr. Rempel regarding Cobell legislation.
Participate on Cobell settlement conference call (.8). Advocacy efforts on Cobell

5/11/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 91 3.594.50 settlemen_t including communl_catlon with me_mbers of Congress and _
Congressional staff (6.2) and internal and client advocacy strategy meetings
(2.2).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.8); conference with Mr.

5/11/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 45 1,440.00 Gingold and Mr. Loving _regardlng strategy (.5_); participate in White H(_)use
conference call (.5); review answers to questions posed by members in
Congress (2.7).

5/11/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [CC w/ team re update.

5/11/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.9 $ 405.00 |Disc w/ DG, JL re status and leg update.

5/11/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 14 $ 630.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and update.

5/11/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.5 $ 1,125.00 |Follow up on Notice and review Notice Plan.

5/11/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.0 $ 1,350.00 |Contact IC re settlement and answer questions.
Prepare response for Mr. Loving on questions raised on settlement by
Republicans (1.8); conference call with co-counsel on legislation (1.1); review

5/11/2010 |Smith. David C. 90 4.500.00 text of amendment d_raftgd _by_Cc_)ngre_ss for legislation (.3); rewgw memos from
Mr. Charnes discussing jurisdictional issues for settlement (1.2); emails to Mr.
Hefferan and Mr. Dietz regarding research needs on due process issue (.4);
work on response to editorial on settlement (4.2).

5/12/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.6 123.00|Review media coverage and dockets per Mr. Levitas' request (.6).

5/12/2010 |Bertschi, Craig E. 08 464.00 Conference with Mr. Smith regarding notice issues/plan; locate exemplar fee

petitions.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review email from beneficiary regarding settlement and
draft email response (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
5/12/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 13 $ 305.50 (.2); review ph.one_message from beneficiary regard_mg settlem_ent status and
return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding status and
return call (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); update
phone log regarding calls and email (.2).
. . Discuss class certification issues with Mr. Charnes (.3); research regarding Rule
5/12/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 15 $ 480.00 23(b) class certification standard (1.2).
5/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, Pearl, Harmala, Loving, Levitas re Hill issues.
5/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Discussion with Rempel re DOJ meeting on draft class notice issues.
5/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Hill staff re WH Pigford linkage to Cobell; problems.
5/12/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Discussion with Loving re all Hill issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
5/12/2010 (Gingold, Dennis 10.4 $ 9,620.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
5/12/2010 | Guilder, Justin M. 0.4 $ 128.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.
5/12/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.4 $ 210.00|Strategy call with post-settlement team.
5/12/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.8 $ 420.00|Review tax extenders legislation.
5/12/2010 |Harmala, Robert 21 1,102.50| Telephone calls to Blue Dog leadership and members, meetings with same.
Meet with Kathy Kinsella, DOJ lawyer, Mr. Rempel and Mr. Smith to review long
5/12/2010 ([Harper, Keith 4.3 $ 2,150.00 |form notice (2.5); call with Mr. Gingold regarding settlement implementation and
developments on the Hill (.4); Conference on Settlement implementation (1.4).
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.8);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
5/12/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 8.3 $ 3,278.50 with members of Cong_ress and_ Co_ngressmnal stgff (5); pglltlcal and Ieglslqtlve
research on Congressional legislation and committee business that potentially
effects the Cobell settlement (1.3); Cobell post-settlement team and individual
legislative strategy discussions (1.2).
. Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); conference with Mr.
5/12/2010 - |Pearl, Michael Alexander 2.0 $ 640.00 Loving, Mr. Harmala and Mr. Gingold on legislative strategy (1.5).
5/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ GCG re claim form and update.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

5/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ KK re edits to notice/plan (multiple calls).

5/12/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |Disc w/ DG re status and leg update.

5/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 $ 1,080.00 |Follow up on Notice and review Notice Plan.

5/12/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.4 $ 1,980.00 |Meet w/ DOJ, KK re long form notice. Incl debrief w/ DG, KH, DS.
Attend meeting with members of Ms. Kinsella's team, Justice, and co-counsel to
review long form notice (4.2); conference with Mr. Bertschi on fee application
and filing of notice plan (.2); review Craven editorial (.2); discussions with Mr.
Dorris and Mr. Harper regarding editorial (.2); telephone conversation with Mr.

5/12/2010 |Smith, David C. 9.4 4,700.00|Gingold regarding status of legislation (.3); emails with Mr. Dietz on research for
response to Eaglewoman editorial (.4); conference with Mr. Harper (.3); emails
with Mr. Charnes regarding due process issues raised In editorial on Cobell
settlement (.2); review email from Mr. Loving on status of legislation (.1); review
budget tracker on legislation (.1); work on draft fee application (3.2).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status
(.2); review Cobell settlement website and May 3 letter from Ms. Cobell (.2);

5/13/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.9 211.50(review phone message from beneficiary regarding status and return call (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); update phone
log regarding calls (.1).

5/13/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 0.6 312.00|Conference with Mr. Dietz regarding class certification issues.

5/13/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 32 $ 1.024.00 Research regarding due process issues in class action certification and
settlement.

5/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 03 $ 27750 Conference pgll Loving, Rempel, Pearl, Guilder re Hill issues; OST funding of
ITMA opposition to settlement.

5/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re same.

5/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Loving re above.

5/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 [Telcom. Levitas re Hill.

5/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Hill staff re settlement issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.6 8,880.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/13/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 04 $ 128.00 Conference call to discus§ legislative issues (.1); conference call to discuss
letter from Rep. Doc Hastings (.3).

5/13/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.3 $ 157.50|Cobell post-settlement strategy call.

5/13/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.8 $ 420.00|Review Sen. Barrasso and Rep. Hastings letter.

5/13/2010 |Harper, Keith 04 $ 200.00 Review and revise Cherokee letter (0.1); telephone conference on settlement

implementation (0.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/13/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.8

580.00

Conference call with Mr. Loving, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Rempel and Mr. Guilder
regarding Cobell legislation (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Gingold
concerning Congressional letter and inquiry and strategy for dealing with same

(5).

5/13/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

8.5

3,357.50

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.5);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff (5.5); political and legislative
research on Congressional legislation and committee business that potentially
affects the Cobell settlement (.5); Cobell post-settlement team and individual
legislative strategy discussions (1.2). Call with Administration (.8).

5/13/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

2.0

640.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); conference with Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Loving and Mr. Guilder regarding receipt of letter from
Congress (1); review draft of response to recent editorials regarding the
proposed settlement (.5).

5/13/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.2

90.00

CC w/ team re status.

5/13/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.6

270.00

Meet w/ DG, JL, others re Congressional letter to DG.

5/13/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

3.5

1,575.00

Review fee application and begin analysis of EC docs.

5/13/2010

Smith, David C.

3.8

1,900.00

Conference call with co-counsel regarding status of legislation (.3); work on
response to Craven editorial regarding Cobell settlement (3.2); email with Mr.
Charnes on jurisdictional issue on settlement (.3).

5/14/2010

Bertschi, Craig E.

0.5

290.00

Locate and review exemplar fee petitions for Mr. Smith.

5/14/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.4

329.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding land
sale (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and
return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
and return call (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3);
receive call from beneficiary regarding status (.3); update phone log regarding
calls (.1).

5/14/2010

Charnes, Adam H.

0.5

260.00

Conference with Mr. Dietz regarding class certification issues (.2); analysis
regarding same (.3).

5/14/2010

Dietz, Richard D.

6.5

2,080.00

Research regarding due process issues in class action certification and
settlement (4.2); draft e-mail memorandum regarding same (2.3).

5/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Telcom. Ms. Cobell re funding source for Craven opposition to settlement.

5/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

185.00

Telcoms. Harper re above.

5/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

@A

185.00

Discussion with Rempel re Craven issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

10.6

9,805.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/14/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

0.6

192.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

5/14/2010

Harper, Keith

1.2

600.00

Telephone conference on settlement implementation (.5); review and revise
Craven op-ed response (.7).

5/14/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

9.6

3,792.00

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff (4.5); political and legislative
research on Congressional legislation and committee business that potentially
affects the Cobell settlement (2); Cobell post-settlement team and individual
legislative strategy discussions (2.1).

5/14/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

2.0

640.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); communicate with
Mr. Gingold and Mr. Loving regarding legislative strategy (.5); review draft of Mr.
Rempel's response to op-ed piece concerning the settlement (.5).

5/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.8

360.00

CC w/ team re status.

5/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.9

405.00

Disc w/ DG re misc and status.

5/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.0

900.00

Review fee application and begin analysis of EC docs.

5/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

5.6

&P |r|H

2,520.00

Prep, edit and draft response to Kim Craven op ed.

5/14/2010

Smith, David C.

3.8

1,900.00

Review response to editorial from Mr. Rempel (.2); telephone conversation with
Mr. Rempel regarding editorial (.1); telephone conversation with Mr. Guilder
regarding conference call on legislation (.2); work on billing information for fee
application (2.3); review recent tax ruling relating to beneficiaries from Mr.
Gingold (.1); review memo from Mr. Dietz to respond to editorial by Angelique
Eaglewoman on the settlement (.8); email to Mr. Dietz (.1).

5/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

7.5

6,937.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/15/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Note 1/22/98 NARF disavowal of contingent fees.

5/15/2010

Smith, David C.

4.6

2,300.00

Work on billing information for fee application (4.2); emails to co-counsel
regarding billing information (.3); review article on Rep. Hastings' letter regarding
legislation (.1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
5/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.1 3,792.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Work on draft response to Eaglewoman editorial on the Cobell settlement (4.4);
5/16/2010 |Smith. David C. 47 2.350.00 emalls with Mr. Dietz regardlng.rese.arch on due process issues in settlemept
raised by Ms. Eaglewoman (.1); review recent editorial by Kimberly Craven in
Sioux Falls Argus Leader regarding settlement and discuss response (.2).
5/17/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.2 41.00|Review media coverage per Mr. Levitas' request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
5/17/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 06 141.00 notlce/_wawer_and re_turn call (.2); review pr.lone message from benef|_0|ary
regarding notice/waiver and return call (.3); update phone log regarding calls
(.1).
5/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 06 555.00 Conference cgll' Ms. Cobell, Rempel, Harper, Loving, Pearl, Guilder, Smith,
Harmala re Hill issues.
5/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 05 462 50 Conference call Dc_)rrls, Rempel re class counsel references in settlement
agreement/fee petition.
5/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 08 $ 240.00 Preparg memo re same; scope of class counsel designation re fee agreement;
related issues.
5/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Dorris re same.
5/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Discussion with Rempel re same.
5/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Loving re Hill issues.
5/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Levitas re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
5/17/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.0 7,400.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
5/17/2010 (Guilder, Justin M. 04 128.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.
5/17/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.6 315.00(Strategy call with post-settlement team.
Telephone conference with Cobell trial team on settlement implementation (.6);
5/17/2010 |Harper, Keith o8 1,400.00 review material from Representative Doc Hastings (.7); discuss response to

Hastings with Harmala and separately with Gingold (.7); review op ed by Kim
Craven and discuss with team (.8).

130




Cas

Elotise ge][f):lgnG &)\éé(ﬂ]é%QI.SQTgalﬁly JQVPe‘ﬁ,“é‘é%r% a:)r)y9 gf%ﬁg In!éirllgr(gi qu(.]ioé]é§e @@86%%/619&@ a@H)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.1);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff (3); focus on Ways and

5/17/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.3 $ 2,488.50|Means Committee, Finance Committee, and Leadership members and staff;
political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and committee
business that potentially effects the Cobell settlement (1.8); Cobell post-
settlement team and individual legislative strategy discussions (.4).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.8); conference with Mr.

. Loving regarding legislative strategy and movement in the House (.5); research

5/17/2010 - |Pearl, Michael Alexander 25 $ 800.00 regargingga statgmgnt from 1997-823/ concerning the litigation (.9); E:o?ﬁerence
with Mr. Gingold regarding legislative strategy (.3).

5/17/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |CC w/ BD, DG re fee application.

5/17/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [CC w/ team re status.

5/17/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.1 $ 495.00 |Disc w/ DG re misc and status.

5/17/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [Prep, edit and draft response to Kim Craven op ed.

5/17/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [Review fee application and begin analysis of EC docs.
STATUS REPORT regarding The Department of the Interior's Office of Trust

. Records for April 2010 Receipt and review docket entry regarding Status Report

5/17/2010 - |Roth, Katie 01 $ “|regarding Thep Department o? the Interior's Office of Trﬁst%ecorgs for April P
2010; e-mail to litigation case team and update electronic files with same.
Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation (.6); review budget tracking

5/17/2010 |Smith, David C. 4.3 $ 2,150.00{newsletter (.2); prepare response to editorial (2.3); review memo on class
certification issues (1.2).

5/18/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.2 $ 41.00|Review media coverage per Mr. Levitas' request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status

5/18/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 06 $ 141.00 (.1)5 revie_w phone message f_rom benefic_iary regarding settlement and return call
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); update phone log
regarding calls (.1).

5/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re Hill issues; NARF.

5/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. Pearl re issues raised by Dakota TB; Hill issues.

5/18/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Dorris re Hill settlement issues.

5/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell et al re Hill issues.

5/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. TB re trust land issues; settlement formula.

5/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Loving re Hill issues.

5/18/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Levitas re same.

5/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Harper re above; all issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.2 7,585.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

5/18/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.2 64.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

5/18/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.4 210.00|Post-settlement team strategy call.
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.8);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff; focus on Ways and Means

5/18/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 8.5 3,357.50{Committee, Finance Committee, and Leadership members and staff (3.5);
political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and committee
business that potentially effects the Cobell settlement (1.9). Communication with
Cobell post-settlement team and individual legislative strategy discussions (2.3).

5/18/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 06 $ 192.00 Part|C|pa_te in conference call with Cobell team regarding legislative strategy and
updates in Congress.

5/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ team re status.

5/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.

5/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.0 $ 450.00 |Review fee application and begin analysis of EC docs.

5/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 $ 1,080.00 |Draft, edit ask Elouise.
Review articles on common fund and email to Mr. Gingold (.6); conference call

5/18/2010 |Smith, David C. 13 650.00 with _co-coun§el (.3_); dlscussmn_s with Mr. Pa_ge rega_lrdlng ber.leflc:l_ary out_put_
sessions (.2); email from Mr. Gingold regarding fee issue (.1); review legislative
update on tax extenders bill (.1).

5/19/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 0.3 61.50|Review media coverage per Mr. Levitas' request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
(.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding status and return call

5/19/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 14 329.00 (.1); receive call from_ t_)eneflmary _regard!ng not_|celwa|ver (.2); review phone .
message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and attempt to return call (.2);
receive call from beneficiary regarding notice and related issues (.4); receive call
from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.2).

5/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Loving, Harper, Pearl, Levitas, Guilder re Hill issues.

5/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Loving re same.

5/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Pearl re same.

5/19/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Discussion Rempel re fee application.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/19/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5 $

462.50

Telcom. Ms. Cobell re all issues.

5/19/2010

Gingold, Dennis

8.6 $

7,955.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/19/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

0.5 $

160.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

5/19/2010

Harper, Keith

8.8 $

4,400.00

Meet with Affiliated Tribes of Northwest Indians during mid-year meeting and
travel to Oregon for this meeting (7.9); call with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Harmala to
get recent update on developments (.3); review time records (.1); discuss
settlement with certain individual Indian trust beneficiaries at ATNI meeting (.5).

5/19/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

9.1 $

3,594.50

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.9);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff; focus on Ways and Means
Committee, Finance Committee, and Leadership members and staff (4.4);
political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and committee
business that potentially effects the Cobell settlement (1.9); Cobell post-
settlement team and individual legislative strategy discussions (1.9).

5/19/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

4.5 $

1,440.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); conference with Hill
staff regarding legislative updates (.5); conference with Mr. Loving and Mr.
Harmala regarding legislative developments (3); conference with Mr. Levitas and
Mr. Gingold regarding deadlines (.5).

5/19/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.4 $

180.00

CC w/ team re status.

5/19/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

14 $

630.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.

5/19/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

15 $

675.00

Review fee application and begin analysis of EC docs.

5/19/2010

Smith, David C.

4.1 $

2,050.00

Work on research for fee petition (3.1); conference call with co-counsel on
legislation (.5); review legislative update from Mr. Loving (.1); email update on
legislation to Mr. Gingold (.1); review information from Ms. Cobell on author of
editorial regarding Cobell settlement (.1); email from Mr. Gingold on status of
legislation (.1); email from Mr. Pearl on status of legislation (.1).

5/20/2010

Applegate, Alexis

0.6 $

123.00

Review media coverage per Mr. Levitas' request (.2); review and organize
Congressional files (.4).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver

5/20/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.7 $ 164.50((.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding status (.3); receive call from
beneficiary regarding status (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

5/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 06 $ 555.00 gglrjl;esrence call Levitas, Ms. Cobell, Guilder, Pearl, Loving, Rempel re Hill

5/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference call Rempel, Loving re same.

5/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. TB settlement status.

5/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above.

5/20/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 |Discussion Rempel re fee application issues.

. . Telcom. Dorris re all issues, including Harvest Institution law suit to bar Cong

5/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 13 $ 1,202.50 from approving Cobell settlement (review motion for TRO).
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.0 $ 7,400.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

5/20/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 18 $ 576.00 Gingold, Mr. 'Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr Harper, Mr. Harmala, gpd Mr. Smith .(.8); .
draft and revise comments to briefing paper prepared by joint tax committee (.8);
draft and revise correspondence with joint tax committee contact (.2).

5/20/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.3 $ 157.50|Strategy call with White House team.

5/20/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.4 $ 210.00|Post-settlement strategy team conference call.

5/20/2010 |Harper, Keith 08 $ 400.00 Telephon_e conference on settlement implementation including discussions on
state of bill - update from Congress.
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff (6); focus on Ways and

5/20/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 9.3 $ 3,673.50|Means Committee, Finance Committee, and Leadership members and staff;
political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and committee
business that potentially effects the Cobell settlement (1); Cobell post-settlement
team and individual legislative strategy discussions (1.3).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); participate in White
House conference call with Mr. Loving and Mr. Harmala (.5); conference with Mr.

5/20/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 3.5 $ 1,120.00|Loving, Mr. Rempel, and Mr. Gingold regarding legislative strategy (1); respond
to inquiry from an Alaskan Native woman requesting information about the
settlement (1.5).

5/20/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ team re status.

134




C

Elou

b8 TE

Hy JQVPe‘ﬁ,“é‘é%r% a:)r)y9 gf%ﬁg In!éirllgr(gi qu(.]ioé]é§e @@86%%19&@ a@H)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
5/20/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [Meet w/ DG, AP, DL re status.
5/20/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 15 $ 675.00 |Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.
5/20/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 5.7 $ 2,565.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application.
Call with co-counsel on legislation (.7); discussions regarding filing in Ohio to
5/20/2010 |Smith, David C. 6.2 3,100.00(stay legislation (.4); review emails with Mr. Loving on legislation (.4); work on fee
application (4.7).
5/21/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 09 184.50 Reylew media coverage and d.oc'kets per Mr. Levitas' request (.2); research
various transcripts per Mr. Smith's request (.7).
Review and reply to Mr. Harper regarding contact with Passamaquoddy
5/21/2010 |Austin, G. William 10 595.00 leadership concerning the tax. extenders b|||land desire for suppprt from Maine
senators regarding same (.5); conference with Mr. Pearl regarding draft letters
and other information to provide Sakom Phillips-Doyle regarding this matter (.5).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
5/21/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 09 211,50 notlcelwalv_e_r and returr_1 call (.2); rec<.a|ve pall from beneficiary (.3); receive _caII
from beneficiary regarding status (.1); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding settlement and return call (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1).
. . Conference call Ms. Cobell, Levitas, Rempel, Smith, Pearl, Harmala, Loving,
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 Guilder re Hill issues; Harvest motion for TRO.
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call all hands re Barrasso issues.
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Kirschman re Harvest TRO motion in ND Ohio.
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. LaRose re Nebraska senators re settlement legislation.
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Loving re above.
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Dorris re Hill issues.
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Telcoms ally re Oregon senators.
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 08 $ 240.00 Discussion ywth Rempel re fee application, e.g., named plaintiff expense
documentation.
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above; tribal issues in the northwest.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.8 $ 4,440.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
5/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom ally re judgment fund issues.
. . Conference calls to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
5/21/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 11 $ 852.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.
5/21/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.2 $ 105.00|Cobell team post-settlement strategy call.
5/21/2010 |Harmala, Robert 11 $ 577 50 Review House amendment to tax extenders bill containing Cobell settlement

language.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/21/2010

Harper, Keith

4.0

2,000.00

Travel back from West Coast (3.3); call with team while at Salt Lake City on
settlement implementation (.7)

5/21/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

7.9

3,120.50

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.5);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff; focus on Ways and Means
Committee, Finance Committee, and Leadership members and staff (4.5);
political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and committee
business that potentially effects the Cobell settlement (.5); Cobell post-
settlement team and individual legislative strategy discussions (1.4).

5/21/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

4.5

1,440.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); conference with Mr.
Loving regarding legislative strategy and timing (3.5).

5/21/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

04

180.00

CC w/ EC re same.

5/21/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.9

405.00

CC w/ team re status (2 calls).

5/21/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.7

765.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.

5/21/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

6.2

B |B|B|(P

2,790.00

Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

5/21/2010

Roehrenbeck, Bradley A.

51

1,504.50

Conduct research regarding application of common fund doctrine in cases
involving the government in the DC Circuit.

5/21/2010

Smith, David C.

10.3

5,150.00

Work on research for fee application (7.3); emails regarding question from
Senator's office on legislation (.1); conference call with co-counsel on legislation
(.4); emails with Mr. Austin on need to contact Tribe regarding contacts with
Maine Senators on legislation (.1); telephone call to Senator's office on
legislation (.2); emails with Senator's office regarding legislation (.1); second
conference call with co-counsel and Ms. Cobell to update on legislation and
conversation with Senator (.6); review ATNI resolution on legislation (.3); emails
with Ms. Applegate regarding locating transcripts of hearings for use in brief (.2);
review article on tax extenders bill from Politico (.2); review voicemail from
House Majority Leader's staff (.1); review Freedmen lawsuit filed in Ohio to stop
legislation and discussions regarding same (.7).

5/22/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Telcom. McAllister re status of settlement; issues on Hill re press inquiries.

5/22/2010

Gingold, Dennis

55

5,087.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/22/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

15

592.50

Legislative research on Cobell Settlement (1). Communication with
Congressional staff (.5).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/22/2010

Roehrenbeck, Bradley A.

3.2 $

944.00

Conduct research regarding application of common fund doctrine in the DC
Circuit in cases involving the US Government.

5/22/2010

Smith, David C.

5.9 $

2,950.00

Work on fee application (5.3); review articles regarding legislation on settlement
(.3); emails with Mr. Roehrenbeck regarding research on fee application (.2);
email regarding Temporary Restraining Order to halt legislation (.1).

5/23/2010

Austin, G. William

1.0 $

595.00

Review of recent articles regarding settlement legislation in preparation for follow-
up call with Tribe regarding same.

5/23/2010

Gingold, Dennis

8.0 $

7,400.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/23/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

2.0 $

790.00

Legislative research on Tax Extenders bill and Cobell settlement (1.6);
communication with Cobell post-settlement team (.4).

5/23/2010

Roehrenbeck, Bradley A.

2.3 $

678.50

Conduct research regarding application of common fund doctrine in the DC
Circuit in cases involving the US Government.

5/23/2010

Smith, David C.

0.4 $

200.00

Review reports from Mr. Loving on status of legislation (.2); discussions
regarding report on legislation and Gannett article (.2).

5/24/2010

Austin, G. William

1.0 $

595.00

Reply to tribal leader's message regarding the Tribe's willingness to support the
Cobell settlement legislation by calling/writing its US Senators (.2); arrange for
transmission of draft letters and Cobell settlement information to tribal offices
(.1); review and reply to tribal leader regarding his calls to Indian Affairs staffers
for senators and other next steps (.7).

5/24/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.8 $

423.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review email from beneficiary regarding land sale and
prepare response (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2); receive call from
beneficiary regarding land issues (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding
case status (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement
(.2); receive call from Pearl Morrison regarding notice/waiver (.2); receive call
from beneficiary regarding status (.2); update phone log regarding email/calls

(2).

5/24/2010

Dorris, William E.

1.3 $

851.50

Review proposed amendment offered by Representative Hastings (.2); emails
from Mr. Loving (.1) and Settlement Agreement's provisions regarding the effect
of material modifications (.1); preparing draft of email to Congressional Quarterly
reporter in response to her voicemail (.5); review House and Senate websites
regarding developments on implementing bills (.4).

137



C

Elou

b8 TE

Hy ngvoecﬁygé%% a:F}y9 gf%ﬁg Ingzirllgr(gi qu(.]ioé]ége @@86%%19&@ a@H)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

5/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Conference call Loving, Rempel, Pearl, Guilder, Levitas, Harper re Hill issues.

5/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.0 $ 1,850.00 |Telcoms. TB's re settlement status; scope of class.

5/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

5/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Dorris re same.

5/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference call Pearl, Loving re Barrasso issues.

5/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Pearl re TB issue.

5/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Harper re Hill issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/24/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.1 7,492.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

5/24/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.5 160.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

5/24/2010 |Harmala, Robert 06 315.00 Cobell team_ legislative strategy call regarding weeks schedule of votes and tax
extenders bill.

5/24/2010 |Harper, Keith 27 1,350.00 Tglephone confe'rence and numerous calls from and to Mr.. qumala, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Loving on settlement implementation and legislative developments.
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.1);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff; focus on Ways and Means

5/24/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 9.5 3,752.50{Committee, Finance Committee, Rules Committee, and Leadership members
and staff; (6.5) political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and
committee business that potentially effects the Cobell settlement (.6); Cobell
post-settlement team and individual legislative strategy discussions (1.3).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.6); conference with Mr.
Austin regarding tribal outreach (2.5); review legislation for Cobell Settlement

5/24/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 7.5 2,400.00((1.5); conference with Mr. Loving, Mr. Gingold, and Mr. Harmala regarding
legislative strategy (1); prepare response to statement of member of Congress
(1.9).

5/24/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 |CC w/ EC re same (2 calls)

5/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re status.

5/24/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.

5/24/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 7.4 $ 3,330.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/24/2010

Roehrenbeck, Bradley A.

2.6

767.00

Conduct research regarding application of common fund doctrine in the DC
Circuit in cases involving the US Government (1); draft correspondence to Mr.
Smith regarding same (.6); conduct research regarding ability to recover fees for
post-settlement work in common fund cases (1).

5/24/2010

Smith, David C.

2.3

1,150.00

Conference call with co-counsel on legislation (.6); review Hastings amendment
to Cobell legislation (.2); review email from Mr. Loving on status of House action
on legislation (.1); review main Justice report on status of legislation (.1); call
from Senator's office on legislation (.2); email co-counsel regarding report from
Senator (.1); review report from administration on legislation (.1); review
research from Mr. Roehrenbeck for petition (.3); review report on legislation and
response (.1); review tax extenders bill with Cobell addition (.3); emails to Mr.
Taylor regarding contact with Senator (.2).

5/25/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

0.5

117.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding case
status and return call (.3); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
contact information for settlement (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

5/25/2010

Dorris, William E.

14

917.00

Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding legislative efforts (.4);
telephone conference with Mr. Loving regarding legislative developments (.2);
team telephone conference on strategy in light of reports on House (.8).

5/25/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.6

555.00

Conference call Harmala, Dorris, Rempel, Pearl, Harper, Loving, Guilder re Hill
issues.

5/25/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.4

370.00

Telcom. Senate staff re settlement issues.

5/25/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Telcom. Loving re above.

5/25/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Ms. Cobell re above.

5/25/2010

Gingold, Dennis

2.3

2,127.50

Telcoms. Dorris re Hill issues; class counsel scope re settlement agreement; fee
petition.

5/25/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

*H| B (AR B

185.00

Telcom. Levitas re Hill issues.

5/25/2010

Gingold, Dennis

8.1

7,492.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/25/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

0.6

192.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Dorris and Mr.
Smith.

5/25/2010

Harmala, Robert

0.3

157.50

Cobell legislative strategy team call.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

5/25/2010

Harper, Keith

25

1,250.00

Numerous e-mail exchanges on developments in both the House and Senate
(.5); telephone conference with Cobell team on settlement implementation
including developments in House and Senate (1.0); call with White House (.3);
second telephone conference on tax extender's bill developments (.7)

5/25/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

10.0

3,950.00

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.8);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff; focus on Ways and Means
Committee, Blue Dog Coalition, Rules Committee, and Leadership members

and staff (6.1); political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and
committee business that potentially effects the Cobell settlement (1); Cobell post-
settlement team strategy discussions (2.1).

5/25/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

8.5

2,720.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.5); revise and finalize
response to critics (1.5); conference with Mr. Loving regarding legislation and
the response (1); attend meetings with Congressional staff on the Hill with Mr.
Loving (4); conference call with Team members regarding legislation (.5).

5/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.4

180.00

CC w/ EC office re same (2 calls)

5/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.9

405.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.

5/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

15

675.00

CC w/ team re status (2 calls).

5/25/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

5.7

A |h AP

2,565.00

Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

5/25/2010

Roehrenbeck, Bradley A.

4.8

1,416.00

Conduct research regarding ability to recover fees for post-settlement work in
common fund cases.

5/25/2010

Roth, Katie

1.8

Review press articles and index same, per Mr. Levitas' request.

5/25/2010

Smith, David C.

2.5

1,250.00

Conference call with co counsel regarding legislation (1); telephone conference
with Mr. Dorris regarding petition for preliminary approval (.1); update evening
conference call regarding status of legislation (.7); review letter from Senator
Barrasso regarding Cobell legislation and emails regarding same (.1); call from
representative on Hill regarding legislation (.2); review order from Mr. Kirschman
on Ohio case dismissing request for Temporary Restraining Order as to Cobell
legislation and notice of appeal (.2); review emails to and from Congressional
quarterly regarding legislation (.1); emails with Ms. Applegate regarding hearing

(1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement status (.1); review letter

5/26/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.9 $ 211.50|from beneficiary regarding Cobell eligibility and non-related issues (.1); draft
response letter to beneficiary (.4); update phone log regarding calls and letter
(.2); file maintenance (.1).

5/26/2010 |Dorris, William E. 08 $ 524.00 Review press on legislative developments (.4); team telephone conference on
strategy in House and Senate (.4).

5/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call all hands re Hill issues.

5/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Discussions Rempel re same.

5/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 |Telcoms. Loving re same.

5/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. Dorris re same.

5/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Review leg/settlement schedule -- drop dead date.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/26/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.8 $ 8,140.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

5/26/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 03 $ 96.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

5/26/2010 |Harmala, Robert 03 $ 157 50 Whlte Housg strategy call with Cobell team on post-settlement legislation
implementation.

5/26/2010 |Harmala, Robert 12 $ 630.00 Post-settleme.nt Cpbell team strategy call for legislative attachment to tax
extenders legislation.

5/26/2010 |Harper, Keith 17 $ 850.00 E-mail exchanges and calls regarding Cobell settlement bill developments in
House and Senate.
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.5);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff; focus on Ways and Means

5/26/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 94 $ 3.713.00 Committee, Bllue [_)qg Coalmon., Rulles Committee, and Leadgrshlp mgmb_ers
and staff (4.5); political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and
committee business that potentially affects the Cobell settlement (.9); Cobell
post-settlement team strategy discussions; communication with Administration
(3.5).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); conference with Mr.

5/26/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 95 $ 3,040.00 Loving regard_lng Ieg|slat|on_ 3); conf(_aren_ce Wlth. Mr._Remng, M_r. L0\_/|ng and
others to confirm language in the legislation (.5); review legislation with Cobell
Settlement (5.5).

5/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ EC office re same
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

5/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [CC w/ team re status.

5/26/2010 |[Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 |Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.

5/26/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 7.0 3,150.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.
Review budget tracker newsletter in legislation (.1); review whip floor update on

5/26/2010 |Smith. David C. 58 2.900.00 Ieg|s!at|0n (.2); gonfgrence call rggardlng Ieglslat|onl (.3); work on fee pgtltlo.n
(3.2); review legislative proceedings and managers' amendment on legislation
(2.2).

5/27/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.2 47.00 Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding land issues (.1);
update phone log regarding calls (.1).
Review settlement agreement and rules for timetable of activities following

5/27/2010 |Dorris, William E. 15 982.50|legislation (.7); telephone conference with team on developments in House and
Senate (.5); review press reports on legislative developments (.3).

5/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 [Telcoms. Kirschman re Hill issues/status.

5/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference call Loving, Pearl re Hill issues.

5/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Telcoms. Smith re same.

5/27/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Dorris re same.

5/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 [Telcoms. Levitas re same.

5/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Yang, SG's office, re extension for response to cert petition.

5/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Rempel re above.

5/27/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 04 $ 370.00 Conference call all hands re above; continued extension of settlement
agreement.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/27/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 8.1 7,492.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

. ) Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

5/27/2010 - |Guilder, Justin M. 0.4 128.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

5/27/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.8 420.00|Cobell team strategy call for post-settlement legislative effort.
Watch C-SPAN floor activity (.4); telephone conference with Cobell team on

5/27/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.2 1,600.00 settlement implementation (.8); discussion with Mr. Harmala and Mr. Loving on

Hill developments (.8); discussion of whether to extend deadline (.6); review
developments in various blogs (.4); call from White House (.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff (2.5); political and legislative

5/27/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 8.5 $ 3,357.50(|research on Congressional legislation and committee business that potentially
effects the Cobell settlement (3); Cobell post-settlement team strategy
discussions; communication with Administration (3).
Conference with Mr. Loving, Mr. Harmala regarding passage of House bill (1.5);

5/27/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 8.5 $ 2,720.00|participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); advocacy efforts
with Mr. Loving (6.5).

5/27/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |CC w/ EC office re same

5/27/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ team re status.

5/27/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.

5/27/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 7.0 $ 3,150.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.
Follow legislative proceedings in House and Senate relating to approval of

. . Cobell legislation (5.1); conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation (.8);

5/27/2010 |Smith, David C. 9.3 $ 4,650.00 . ; o ) "
conference with Mr. Gingold on phone on legislation (.2); work on fee petition
(3.2).

5/28/2010 |Austin, G. William 03 $ 178.50 Reylew of articles and internal e-mails regarding House passage of settlement
legislation.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding case

5/28/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 06 $ 141.00 stat.us a'nd return call (.1); receive call fr.om benef|C|a}ry regarding notice/waiver
(.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement/case
information (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1).

5/28/2010 |Dorris, William E. 11 $ 720.50 Telephone c.onferenFe W!th team regarding develloprr?ents in House of
Representatives (.4); review press reports on legislation (.7).

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call all hands re Hill issues.

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.5 $ 1,387.50 |Conferences Rempel, Loving re same.

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 45 $ 4.162.50 ﬁ:;(;ttjisc,;lons Rempel re Hill issues; Hill staff positions; priorities re return to

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Senate staff re Hill issues.

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.1 $ 1,017.50 |Telcoms. Loving re above; House issues.

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference call Harper, Pearl re floor amendments.

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Kirschman re extension of settlement agreement.

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. Harper re class notice issues; probate issues.

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcom. Ms. Cobell re extension; concerns.

5/28/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re House issues.

5/28/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Smith re common fund/fee app; class notice.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
5/28/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 3.0 960.00|Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith (.4);
draft and revise and review correspondence regarding legislation (2.6).
5/28/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.5 262.50|Post-settlement team strategy team meeting.
Conference with White House (.5); monitor Hill activities and passage of Cobell
5/28/2010 |Harper, Keith 4.1 2,050.00 |provision in House (2.5); discuss enlargement of time of deadline to enact
implementing legislation and execute same (1.1).
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff (1.5); political and legislative
5/28/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 8.5 3,357.50(|research on Congressional legislation and committee business that potentially
effects the Cobell settlement (1.2); Cobell post-settlement team strategy
discussions; communication with Administration (5.8).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); conference with Mr.
5/28/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 8.0 2,560.00(Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Loving, and Mr. Dorris regarding next
steps after passage of legislation (3.5); advocacy efforts with Mr. Loving (4).
5/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |CC w/ team re status.
5/28/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [Disc w/ DG re fee application and related.
5/28/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 14 $ 630.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.
5/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.5 $ 675.00 [Disc w/ DG re house legislation and monitor.
5/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 2.4 $ 1,080.00 |Monitor house debate on Cobell.
5/28/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.2 $ 1,440.00 |Meet w/ JL, AP, DG re status of legislation in house.
Conference call with co-counsel on legislation (.5); follow legislative proceedings
in House ultimately approving legislation (2.1); review draft statement on House
5/28/2010 |Smith. David C. 31 1,550.00 approval c_)f legislation (.1); review article on H_ouse approvgl of legislation (.1);
review article on proposed changes to legislation (.1); emails to Mr. Harper and
Mr. Dorris regarding extension of time on settlement agreement (.1); review
extension of time (.1).
Review response to cert petition (2); telephone conference with Messrs Gingold,
5/29/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 4.0 2.080.00 Sr_nlth, Lf)vmg, and _Lewtas rega_rdlng stra_ltegy regardlryg cert petition an_d reply
brief (.5); draft email to Mr. Dorris regarding same (.2); research regarding legal
issues raised by the response brief (1.3).
5/29/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 29 704.00 Review government's opposition to petition for certiorari (1); review case law

cited in government's opposition; e-mail correspondence regarding same (1.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

5/29/2010 |Dorris, William E. 09 $ 589.50 R_eview the government response tq our Supreme Court petition (.6); emails
with Mr. Charnes on strategy regarding our reply (.3).

5/20/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 09 $ 832 50 F:onfgrence caII.Char'nes, .L'evitas, Loving, Guilder re cert petition vis-a-vis Hill
issue; SCt rules; defs' position.

5/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Review SCt rules.

5/29/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Review SCt brief.

5/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Smith re same; fee app issues.

5/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Holt re cert petition.

5/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Email exchange with Holt re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/29/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4.2 $ 3,885.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/29/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.9 $ 472.50|Review government opposition to cert petition.

5/29/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 1.5 $ 592.50|Cobell legislative research.
Review response to petition for certiorari filed by Solicitor General (.4);
conference call regarding response to petition and impact on legislation (.8);
review news release from Wyoming on settlement (1); review AP story on

5/29/2010 |Smith, David C. 1.7 $ 850.00|settlement discussing views of beneficiaries (1); email from Mr. Charnes on
procedure for response to petition (.1); email from Mr. Charnes discussing
response of Solicitor General on petition (.1); discussions on timing of response
to petition (.1).

5/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Email exchanges Cobell team re various Hill issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/30/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.4 $ 6,845.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/30/2010 |Harper, Keith 3.0 $ 1,500.00 Trave_l t_o Oklahoma to meet with Cherokee Nation regarding inclusion of trust
beneficiary members.

5/30/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 1.0 $ 395.00|Cobell legislative research.
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); review Supreme

5/30/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 2.0 $ 640.00|Court rules, discuss possibilities for removing cert petition in a manner of ways
(1.5).
Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold on strategy regarding petition to
Supreme Court and recent press reports (.4); telephone conference with Mr.

5/31/2010 |Dorris, William E. 11 $ 720.50|Harper regarding Senate consideration of House Bill (.3); follow-up call with Mr.
Harper about recent press coverage (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Loving
regarding Senate's consideration of legislation (.2).
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ecretary o

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

5/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Conference call Rempel, Guilder re Hill issues.

5/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Dorris re SCt issues; Senate issues.

5/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Loving re Hill issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

5/31/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 6.2 $ 5,735.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

5/31/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 08 $ 316.00 Commumca'.uons_ Wlth Cobell post-settlement team regarding Congressional
strategy (.3); legislative research (.5).

5/31/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 1.0 $ 320.00|Review Great-West and Bowen decisions and progeny.

5/31/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.2 $ 90.00 |CC w/ team (limited) re status.

5/31/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 $ 135.00 |Disc w/ DG re S Ct. Reply.

5/31/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 [Disc w/ DG re fee application.

5/31/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 7.9 $ 3,555.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding status (.1); receive call from
beneficiary regarding status (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding status

6/1/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.4 $ 329.00|(.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from
beneficiary regarding status (.1); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding various issues and return call (.4); review phone message from
beneficiary and return call (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.2).
Telephone conference with co-counsel regarding strategy for legislation and

6/1/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 1.2 $ 624.00|fairness hearing (1); conference with Mr. Dietz regarding reply in support of cert
petition (.2).

6/1/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 1.5 $ 480.00|Review government's opposition to petition for certiorari.

6/1/2010 |Dorris, William E. 05 $ 32750 Emails with Mr. Gmgold_regardmg _Senate co_nS|derat|on of legislation (.2);
telephone conference with Mr. Loving regarding same (.3).

6/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 12 $ 1,110.00 Confer.enpe. call Harmala, Ms. Cobell, Charnes, Rempel, Levitas, Harper SCt.
Issues; Hill issues.

6/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. TB re settlement status.

6/1/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 15 $ 1,387.50 |Discussions with Rempel re fee application.

6/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 [Discussion with Ms. Cobell re same.

6/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re case management issues.

6/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Levitas re Hill issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

6/1/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.3 $ 7,677.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

6/1/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 13 $ 416.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

6/1/2010 |Harmala, Robert 05 $ 262 50 Copfergncg call with Wh|te House staff regarding strategy for passage of
legislation implementing Cobell settlement.

6/1/2010 |Harmala, Robert 12 $ 630.00 Cobell Ieg|sla'F|ve §trategy call with p(.)st-setltl.ement team, discussion of tax
extenders legislation and effort to gain additional votes for settlement passage.
Telephone conference with team (.8); meet with the Cherokee Nation to discuss

6/1/2010 ([Harper, Keith 3.6 $ 1,800.00 |issues with the distribution for the Five Tribes (1.8); call to Mr. Gingold regarding
White House (.6); call with White House on settlement implementation (.4).
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.5);

6/1/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 2.1 $ 829.50|political and legislative research on Congressional legislation and committee
business that potentially affects the Cobell settlement (.6).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1.2); conference with

6/1/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 2.5 $ 800.00|Mr. Gingold and Mr. Loving regarding legislative strategy and enactment of
legislation authorizing the settlement (1.3).

6/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.8 $ 360.00 [Disc w/ DG re fee application.

6/1/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.3 $ 585.00 [CC w/ team

6/1/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 7.5 3,375.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/1/2010 |Roth, Katie 01 _|Receipt and review docket entr!es.regar'dmg Status Report; e-mail to litigation
case team and update electronic files with same.
E-mails to Mr. Taylor and Mr. Berlin regarding contacting Senator regarding
Cobell legislation (.2); e-mail to Mr. Charnes regarding status of legislation (.1); e

6/1/2010 |Smith, David C. 0.6 $ 300.00|mail from Mr. Gingold regarding legislation (.1); review article on proposed
amendment of Senator Barrasso (.1); e-mail from Mr. Levitas regarding efforts of
Administration (.1).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review correspondence from beneficiary regarding
Indian issue (.1); conference with Ms. Deringer regarding same (.1); telephone

6/2/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 09 $ 211,50 beneficiary regard|_ng same (.2); review phone message from b_enef|C|ary anq
return call (.1); review phone message from beneficiary regarding status (.2);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding contact information (.1);
update phone log regarding calls (.1).

6/2/2010 |Charnes, Adam H. 4.0 2.080.00 Atten_d strqtegy conferen_c_e call (1); address issues regarding motion to defer
consideration of cert petition (3).

6/2/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 2.2 704.00|Outline arguments for reply brief supporting petition for certiorari.
Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding talking points for Senate

6/2/2010 |Dorris, William E. 1.3 $ 851.50|legislative effort (.5); review press and blogs (.5); telephone conference with Mr.
Harmala on report on Senate developments (.3).

6/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 08 $ 240.00 .Confer-ence call LeV|ta§, Harper, Guilder, Rempel, Harmala, Loving re Hill
issues; plans to open bill for amendment.

6/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Prepare memos to Ms. Cobell re SCt. Issues; Hill status/options.

6/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. Loving re Barrasso issues.

6/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. TB re settlement status; opp to settlement from northwest tribes.

6/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcoms. Dorris re Hill issues.

6/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Levitas re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

6/2/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.2 $ 8,510.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala (1.2); draft and revise

6/2/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 2.2 $ 704.00|correspondence to Mr. Smith regarding conference call (.1); draft and revise
language regarding potential Senate amendment and correspond with Mr.
Loving regarding same (.9).

6/2/2010 |Harmala, Robert 06 $ 315.00 Conference call w!th post-gettlement §trqtegy team to determine response to anti
settlement resolutions by tribal organizations.

6/2/2010 |Harmala, Robert 11 $ 577 50 Strategy call v_wth _post-settl_er_nent legislation team to determine votes for tax
extenders legislation containing Cobell settlement.
Telephone conference on settlement implementation and discussion with our

6/2/2010 |[Harper, Keith 15 $ 750.00 (lobbyist to strategize regarding next steps and various legal/political issues (.9);
discussion of Barrasso amendment and review (.6)
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.2);
. Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication

6/2/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 2.9 $ 1,145.50 with members of Congress and Congressional staff (.5). Cobell post-settlement
team Capitol Hill strategy discussions (1.2).

6/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.6 $ 270.00 [CC w/ team re leg update and S. Ct. Reply (mot to defer).

6/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 $ 540.00 [Disc w/ DG re fee application.

6/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.7 $ 765.00 [Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/2/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 3.2 $ 1,440.00 |Meet w/ DG, BD re fee app, status and related.
E-mail to Mr. Taylor and Mr. Berlin regarding Barrasso amendment and contact
with Senator (.1); e-mail with Mr. Guilder regarding legislative update (.2);
telephone conference regarding petition for certiorari and dismissal (.1); review

6/2/2010 |Smith, David C. 2.1 $ 1,050.00|brief in opposition to petition for certiorari (.6); review resolution of Great Plains
Tribal Chairmans Association regarding legislation and e-mails relating to
resolution (.3); 4:00 conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation and
amendment of Senator Barrasso (.8).
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding

6/3/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 08 $ 188.00 settler_’ngnt and ret_urn call (.2); r<.aturn <_:a|| to beneficiary (1) receive gall from
beneficiary regarding status (.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1).
Telephone conference with co-counsel regarding strategy for settlement (1);

6/3/2010 |[Charnes, Adam H. 4.0 $ 2,080.00(conferences with Mr. Dietz regarding cert petition strategy (1); revise and edit
motion to defer consideration of cert petition (2).

. . Draft motion to defer consideration of petition for certiorari (2); research

6/3/2010 | Dietz, Richard D. 3.8 $ 1,216.00 regarding same (1.5); discuss case strategy with Mr. Charnes (.3).
Working with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Rempel (part time) on legislative strategy in

6/3/2010 |Dorris, William E. 5.3 $ 3,471.50({Senate and strategy in court on a variety of issues if the legislation is passed
(4.4); outlining time line for decisions to be made (.9).

6/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647 50 Conference call Rempel, Ms. Cobell, Charnes, Harper, Guilder, Loving, Harmala
re Hill/SCt. Issues.

6/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 20 1,850.00 !I)|scus.S|ons with Dorris re implementation of settlement agreement; Senate
issues; tasks post-enactment.

6/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. TB re settlement status; scope of class.

6/3/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re Hill issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/3/2010

Gingold, Dennis

9.0

8,325.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

6/3/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

0.7

224.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

6/3/2010

Harmala, Robert

0.7

367.50

Strategy conference call with post-settlement team to discuss legislation and
responses to ATNI calls for changes to settlement, potential Senate amendment
to modify settlement.

6/3/2010

Harmala, Robert

1.3

682.50

Telephone calls and emails of information on settlement terms and potential for
nullification by legislative changes.

6/3/2010

Harper, Keith

0.9

450.00

Call with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Loving regarding latest Hill developments (.4);
telephone conference with the Cobell team regarding same and next steps (.5).

6/3/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

3.4

1,343.00

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1);
Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
with members of Congress and Congressional staff (1.1). Cobell post-settlement
team Capitol Hill strategy discussions (1.3).

6/3/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.3

135.00

CC w/ team re leg update and S. Ct. Reply (mot to defer).

6/3/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.8

810.00

Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/3/2010

Smith, David C.

3.4

1,700.00

E-mails regarding deferral or dismissal of petition for certiorari (.3); review ATNI
Resolution (.2); review motion to defer consideration of petition for certiorari (.2);
conference call with co-counsel discussing status of legislation and response to
petition for certiorari (.6); research cases for fee application (2.1).

6/4/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.8

423.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding land sale issue
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); review phone
message from beneficiary regarding settlement status and return call (.2); review
phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.3);
receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3); update phone log
regarding calls (.2).

6/4/2010

Charnes, Adam H.

0.5

260.00

Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Dietz regarding motion to defer
consideration of cert petition.

6/4/2010

Chick, Shawn R.

0.6

111.00

Emails with Mr. Smith regarding fee application (.2); preparation of spreadsheet
for fees and costs per instructions from Mr. Smith (.4).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Telephone conference with Mr. Charnes and Mr. Gingold regarding Supreme
6/4/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 1.2 $ 384.00|Court reply brief and motion to defer consideration (.5); revise motion to defer
consideration of petition for certiorari (.7).
6/4/2010 |Dorris, William E. 06 $ 393.00 Review ar_1d_respond|ng to emails regarding developments regarding Senate
and materiality of proposed amendments by Senator Barrasso.
6/4/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Infield re settlement status issues.
6/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference call Rempel, Harmala, Levitas, Smith, Guilder re Hill issues.
6/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Telcoms. Loving re same.
6/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. TB re settlement process.
6/4/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Levitas re SCt brief; Hill issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
6/4/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 9.3 $ 8,602.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
6/4/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.3 $ 96.00 Gingold, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.
6/4/2010 |Harmala, Robert 05 $ 262.50 Conferelnce call with Ieglslatl\_/e and legal tgam _to determine strategy to address
Senator's amendment changing Cobell legislation.
. Research and review case law on materiality (1.7); talk with Mr. Gingold
6/4/2010  |Harper, Keith 2.4 $ 1,200.00 regarding same (.3); call with Mr. Loving and Mr. Harmala on Senate action (.4).
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.5);
. Congressional advocacy efforts on Cobell settlement including communication
6/4/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 2.7 $ 1,066.50 with members of Congress and Congressional staff (.4). Cobell post-settlement
team Capitol Hill strategy discussions (1.8).
6/4/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 [CC w/ team re leg update and S. Ct. Reply (mot to defer).
6/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 $ 225.00 [Disc w/ DG re application, status.
6/4/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.2 540.00 [Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.
6/4/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 1.2 $ 354.00|Conduct legal research concerning opinions issued by Judge Hogan (1.2).
E-mails with Mr. Gingold regarding status of legislation (.2); conference call with
co-counsel regarding status of legislation (.5); e-mails regarding Cobell
proformas for fee application (.3); e-mail with Mr. Rosen, librarian, regarding
. . research needs for fee application (.2); e-mail to Mr. Charnes regarding petition
6/4/2010 | Smith, David C. 6.2 $ 3,100.00 (.1); e-mails with Ms. Chick regarding fee application (.2); review Newberg on
class actions for fee application (.8); research regarding fee application (3.7);
discussions regarding call from congressional aide regarding Barrasso
amendment (.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

6/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. TB re settlement status.

6/5/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. Guilder re Judgment Fund issues.

6/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Harper re same.

6/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Conference call Harper, Guilder re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

6/5/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.2 $ 7,585.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Research regarding definition of material or material change to draft and revise

. . letter for Senate rebutting Barrasso proposed amendments (7.7); conference

6/5/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 128 $ 4,096.00 with Mr. Harper and Mr. Gingold regarding same (1.1); draft and revise letter
regarding same (4).

6/5/2010 |Harmala, Robert 0.7 $ 367.50|Review materiality research for opposition to Senate amendment.
E-mail regarding fee application and affidavit with Mr. Levitas (.1); e-mails with

. . Mr. Harper and Mr. Gingold regarding affect of proposed Barrasso amendment

6/5/2010 | Smith, David C. 0.9 $ 450.00 (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Guilder (.1); review research by Mr. Guilder
regarding effect of proposed Barrasso amendment on settlement (.4).

6/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Review/comment on Guilder memo per discussions on 6/5.

6/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Harper re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

6/6/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.0 $ 6,475.00 |names, facts re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns.

6/6/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G, 14 $ 413.00 Conduct legal research concerning at'Forn_ey fee deC|S|_ons issued by Judge
Hogan and exchange e-mail communications concerning same (1.4).

6/6/2010 |Smith, David C. 49 $ 2.450.00 Rev_ls_e letter to_Senate regarding Barrg;so am(.endment (1.2); email _tc_) Mr. Clay
outlining potential responses to fee petition (.6); research for fee petition (3.2).
Research trial, deposition, and hearing dates per Mr. Smith and Mr. Gingold' s

6/7/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 5.2 $ 1,066.00|request (4.9); conference with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Rempel regarding same (.1);
conference with staffer regarding transcript of hearing (.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/7/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.4

329.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review letter from beneficiary regarding Cobell
information (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); review
phone message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.1);
review phone message from beneficiary regarding case status and return call
(.1); review phone message from class member and return call (.3); review
phone message from beneficiary regarding land issues and return call (.4);
update phone log regarding calls (.2).

6/7/2010

Charnes, Adam H.

1.0

520.00

Telephone conference with co-counsel regarding Supreme Court strategy (.5);
revise and edit motion (.5).

6/7/2010

Chick, Shawn R.

1.2

222.00

Preparation of fee spreadsheet and telephone call with Ms. Murray regarding
same.

6/7/2010

Dietz, Richard D.

0.8

256.00

Revise motion to defer consideration of petition for certiorari (.5); discuss same
with Mr. Charnes (.3).

6/7/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.0

925.00

Conference call Ms. Cobell, et al re Hill issues.

6/7/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.1

92.50

Telcom. Harper re same.

6/7/2010

Gingold, Dennis

04

&+ R |H

370.00

Conference call Loving, Pearl re same.

6/7/2010

Gingold, Dennis

111

10,267.50

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

6/7/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

11

352.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

6/7/2010

Harmala, Robert

11

577.50

Strategy conference call with legislative and legal team regarding tax extenders
bill and legislative options.

6/7/2010

Harper, Keith

2.4

1,200.00

Telephone conference on settlement implementation and stopping the Barrasso
amendment which will kill the settlement (.6); draft one-paper on same (1.1); e-
mail exchanges with Mr. Gingold (.3); discussion of certiorari petition (.4).

6/7/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

9.2

3,634.00

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call. (1.3)
Advocacy efforts in the Senate for Congressional approval of the Cobell
Settlement Agreement as part of the Tax Extenders bill (HR 4213) (4). Advocacy
efforts against the Barrasso amendment to the Tax Extenders bill (S. Amdit.
4313). Efforts included communication with Senate staff (3) as well as state tribal
grass roots efforts (.9).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/7/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

55

$ 1,760.00

Conference call with Cobell team members regarding legislation and related
Supreme Court briefing issues (.5); conference call with Hill staff regarding
timeline for legislative action (.5); conference with Mr. Loving and Mr. Gingold on
developments both legal and otherwise for the settlement (.4); review various
proposed amendments crafted by Senators and House members (3.5);
conference with John Dossett of NCAI regarding speaking on a panel in Rapid
City, SD on Cobell (.6).

6/7/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.5

225.00

CC w/ team re leg update and S. Ct. Reply (mot to defer).

6/7/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

14

A |A

630.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application.

6/7/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

9.3

4,185.00

Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/7/2010

Smith, David C.

5.2

$ 2,600.00

E-mail to Ms. Applegate regarding information needed for fee application (.2);
conference call with co-counsel regarding legislative efforts (.8); e-mail regarding
locating transcript of House Committee hearing on Cobell (.1); discussions
regarding timeline and status of settlement (1); review research from Mr. Schulof
regarding application for attorneys' fees (.7); e-mail from Ms. Applegate
regarding response to needs for fee application (.1); e-mails and discussions
regarding extenders legislation (.6); review government's responses to questions
from House Resources Committee on legislation (.3); e-mails from Mr. Harper
regarding contacts with administration on legislation (.1); review docket for fee
application (.9); discussions regarding call with DOJ regarding effect of Barrasso
amendment (.2); review revised motion to defer consideration of cert petition

(2).

6/8/2010

Applegate, Alexis

3.3

$ 676.50

Further research of case events per Mr. Smith's request.

6/8/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.0

$ 235.00

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from
beneficiary regarding status (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2);
update phone log regarding calls (.1).

6/8/2010

Chick, Shawn R.

0.8

148.00

Preparation of fee spreadsheet and email to Mr. Smith regarding same.

6/8/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.8

740.00

Conference call all hands re Hill issues.

6/8/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Conference call Harper, Loving, Pearl, Guilder re same.

6/8/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

185.00

Telcoms. TB re settlement status.

6/8/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

185.00

Telcom. Levitas re "materiality” re Barrasso proposed changes to settlement
agreement.

6/8/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.6

il IR Rl Rl Rl PPN

555.00

Telcom. Dorris re all issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/8/2010

Gingold, Dennis

7.4

$ 6,845.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

6/8/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

1.0

$ 320.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

6/8/2010

Harmala, Robert

3.3

$ 1,732.50

Conference call with legal team regarding settlement legislation (1); telephone
calls and e-mails to Senate offices regarding support for settlement and
opposition to amendment (2.3).

6/8/2010

Harper, Keith

2.2

$ 1,100.00

Discussion with government on letter addressing Barrasso (.5); discussions with
Cobell team (.9); telephone conference regarding Senate action and settlement
implementation (.8).

6/8/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

8.7

$ 3,436.50

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.6).
Advocacy efforts in the Senate for Congressional approval of the Cobell
Settlement Agreement as part of the Tax Extenders bill (HR 4213) (3). Advocacy
efforts against the Barrasso amendment to the Tax Extenders bill (S. Amdt.
4313). Efforts included communication and collaboration with Senate staff as
well as state tribal grass roots efforts (3); communications with post-settlement
team members on advocacy efforts (1.1).

6/8/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

6.5

$ 2,080.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); conference with Hill
staff (.3); conference with Mr. Gingold and Mr. Loving regarding legislative
strategy (.5); research on pending legislation (1.5); conference with Mr. Loving
(3.2).

6/8/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.4

180.00

CC w/ team re leg update and S. Ct. Reply (mot to defer).

6/8/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

CC w/ beneficiary re settlement.

6/8/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application.

6/8/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

9.5

A |h|B|P

4,275.00

Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/8/2010

Schulof, Daniel G.

14

$ 413.00

Conduct legal research concerning standards governing adequacy of attorney
fee petitions (1.4).

155




Cas

Elotisé %

b8 TE

Hy ngvoecﬁygé%% a:F}y9 gf%ﬁg Ingzirllgr(gi qu(.]ioé]ége @@86%@919&@ a@H)

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Conference call with co-counsel (1); review budget tracker newsletter (.1);
review time and fee summary for fee application (.4); discussions with Mr.
Rempel regarding beneficiary call (.1); discussions with lone Band of Miwok
6/8/2010 |Smith, David C. 3.0 1,500.00 Indians reg_a!rdlng se.ttler’r_]ent (._3); dlz_scussmns with Mr. _G|ngolq regar_dmg call _
from beneficiary (.3); review stipulation to extend deadline (.1); e-mails regarding
e-mail from aide with Senate Affairs (.3); discussions regarding proposed
Amendment of Senator Barrasso (.3); e-mail to Mr. Schuloff regarding research
(.1).
6/9/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 3.4 697.00|Further research of case events per Mr. Smith's request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
6/9/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.6 141.00((.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3); update phone log
regarding calls (.1).
6/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 05 $ 46250 Conference _cqll Ms. Cobell, Harper, Loving, Rempel, Pearl, Harmala, Guilder,
Levitas re Hill issues.
6/9/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Harper re DOJ letter re settlement agreement.
6/9/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Conference call Pearl, Loving re potential Barrasso amendment.
6/9/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Telcom. Dorris re Hill issues.
6/9/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Loving re same.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
6/9/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 11.7 10,822.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
6/9/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 11 352.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.
Telephone conference call with Cobell team regarding settlement (1); telephone
6/9/2010 |Harmala, Robert 3.8 1,995.00|calls and e-mails to Senate staff regarding information on settlement and
support for tax extenders (2.8).
. Review letter from Secretary Salazar and Attorney General (.5); telephone
6/9/2010  |Harper, Keith 26 1,300.00 conference with Cobell team (1.1); responding to effects of the letter (1.0).
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.8).
Advocacy efforts in the Senate for Congressional approval of the Cobell
Settlement Agreement as part of the Tax Extenders bill (HR 4213) (3.5).
6/9/2010 (Loving, John-Claude F. 9.0 3,555.00({Advocacy efforts against the Barrasso amendment to the Tax Extenders bill (S.

Amdt. 4313). Efforts included communication with Senate staff as well as state
tribal grass roots efforts (3.5); communications with post-settlement team
members on advocacy efforts (1.2).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

6/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.3 135.00 |CC w/ team re leg update and S. Ct. Reply (mot to defer).

6/9/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 0.5 225.00 |Disc w/ DG re fee application.

6/9/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 4.0 1,800.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/9/2010 |Roth, Katie 01 R_ece!pt and review docket entry regardl_ng New \_]udge assignment; e-mail to
litigation case team and update electronic files with same.
Conduct legal research concerning judicial standards governing reasonableness

6/9/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 4.8 1,416.00|of fee requests for use in drafting fee petition briefing (2.6); draft memorandum
to Mr. Smith concerning same (2.2).
Conference call with co-counsel regarding response to Barrasso amendment
(.8); review resolution of ITMA regarding legislation (.1); review articles on
legislation (.2); review resolution on legislation from Great Plains tribal council
(.2); review list of depositions from Ms. Applegate for use in petition (.3); review

6/9/2010 |Smith, David C. 2.8 1,400.00|letters from Secretary Salazar and Justice regarding effect of proposed Barrasso
amendment (.2); review research from Mr. Schuloff regarding research on fee
application (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Schuloff regarding necessary
research (.2); multiple emails regarding ongoing legislative efforts (.3); emalil
regarding contacting Senator to update on legislative effort on Cobell (.2).

6/10/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 2.3 471.50|Further research of case events per Mr. Smith's request.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review email correspondence from beneficiary regarding
case information and draft response email regarding same (.2); review phone

6/10/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.0 235.00|message from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver and return call (.4); review
phone message from beneficiary regarding land issues and return call (.3);
update phone log regarding calls and email (.1).

6/10/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 1.5 $ 480.00|Outline reply brief arguments for petition for certiorari.

6/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Conference call Kirschman/Quinn re settlement agreement.

6/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 10 $ 925.00 Te]com;. LQV|ng re Hill issues; revenue v. spending offsets; committee
jurisdiction issues.

6/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re same.

6/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Senate staff re offset issues.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

6/10/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 8.1 7,492.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-

retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
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ecretary o

Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
. . Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

6/10/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.2 $ 64.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

6/10/2010 |Harmala, Robert 29 $ 1,522.50 Conferenc_:e call with strategy group re_gardlng tax extenders legislation (.8);
contact with senators and staff regarding support for same (2.1).

6/10/2010 |Harper, Keith 13 $ 650.00 T.elepho.ne conference with Cobell team on settlement implementation (1.0); call
with White House (.3).
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1).
Advocacy efforts in the Senate for Congressional approval of the Cobell
Settlement Agreement as part of the Tax Extenders bill (HR 4213) (4). Advocacy

6/10/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 7.5 $ 2,962.50(efforts against the Barrasso amendment to the Tax Extenders bill (S. Amdt.
4313). Efforts included communication with Senate staff as well as state tribal
grass roots efforts (1); communications with post-settlement team members on
advocacy efforts (1.5).
Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (.5); conference call with

6/10/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 3.5 $ 1,120.00|Administration (.5); conference with Mr. Loving, Mr. Rempel, and Mr. Gingold
regarding legislative strategy (2.5).

6/10/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.4 $ 180.00 |CC w/ team re leg update.

6/10/2010 |Smith, David C. 1.0 $ 500.00|Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: review phone message from beneficiary regarding
request for legal assistance and return call (.1); receive call from beneficiary
regarding case status (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver

6/11/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 1.1 $ 258.50((.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.3); receive call from
beneficiary regarding case status (.1); update phone log regarding calls (.2);
review pending beneficiary caller issues and prepare memo to Mr. Smith
regarding same (.1).

6/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re all issues.

6/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Harper re SG issues.

6/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Prepare memo re cert issues.

6/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 08 $ 240.00 ]Eljjcr)]r(;fserence calls Pearl, Loving re Hill issues; depository bank for settlement

6/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Pearl re same.

6/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Telcom. Levitas re Barrasso amendment; judicial authority.
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of

6/11/2010 (Gingold, Dennis 8.5 $ 7,862.50 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

6/11/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 |Conference call Ms. Cobell, et al re Hill issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/11/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

0.7

224.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith (.2);
discuss with Mr. Harper and Mr. Pearl legislative issues regarding NCAI letter
and possible resolution (.5).

6/11/2010

Harmala, Robert

0.9

472.50

Legislative/legal team conference call to plan settlement legislation strategy.

6/11/2010

Harper, Keith

0.5

250.00

Telephone conference on addressing Barrasso letter.

6/11/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

7.1

2,804.50

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (.9).
Advocacy efforts in the Senate for Congressional approval of the Cobell
Settlement Agreement as part of the Tax Extenders bill (HR 4213) (2.1).
Advocacy efforts against the Barrasso amendment to the Tax Extenders bill (S.
Amdt. 4313). Efforts included communication with Senate staff, NCAIl as well as
state tribal grass roots efforts (2.1); communications with post-settlement team
members on advocacy efforts (2).

6/11/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

4.0

1,280.00

Participate and prepare for Cobell team conference call (1); conference with Mr.
Loving and Mr. Gingold regarding legislative strategy (1); evaluate strategy for
NCAI letter (2).

6/11/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.6

270.00

CC w/ team re leg update.

6/11/2010

Schulof, Daniel G.

2.4

708.00

Conduct legal research concerning judicial standards used in evaluating
reasonableness of attorney fee requests (2.4).E2829

6/11/2010

Smith, David C.

3.0

1,500.00

Conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation (.9); review email regarding
award of fees in 9/11 class action (.2); email to Mr. Schuloff regarding research
on fee submission (.2); email with Mr. Dorris regarding research for fee
submission (.1); discussions regarding ITMA letter on Cobell legislation (1.1);
conference with Mr. Gingold regarding legislative issues (.5).

6/12/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.8

740.00

Draft memorandum re response to NCAI settlement position.

6/12/2010

Gingold, Dennis

5.8

5,365.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

6/13/2010

Gingold, Dennis

04

370.00

Telcom. Harper re joint efforts of WH/DOI re Hill.

6/13/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Telcom. Smith re fee petition; Hill issues.

6/13/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.6

1,480.00

Conference call Pearl, Levitas, Ms. Cobell, Loving, Harper, Rempel, Smith re
NCAI/ATNI issues; USET; Barrasso amendment; tax extenders bill -- strategy re
same.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
6/13/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 3.0 2,775.00 |names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]
Travel to United South and Eastern Tribes (USET) Conference in Mobile,
6/13/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 6.0 2,370.00({Alabama to participate in conference on behalf of client (4.5); conference call
(1.5).
Conference call with Cobell team members regarding the NCAI letter, USET
6/13/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 2.1 672.00|conference (1.6); conference with Mr. Loving regarding legislative strategy at the
USET conference in Alabama (.5).
6/13/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 810.00 [CC w/ team re leg update.
6/13/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 13 383.50 Conduct legal research concerning judicial standards used in evaluating
reasonableness of attorney fee requests.
Conference call regarding tribal meetings and legislative efforts regarding Cobell
6/13/2010 |Smith, David C. 2.1 1,050.00|settlement (1.5); conference with Mr. Gingold regarding petition for preliminary
approval (.3); emails regarding potential Senate action on Cobell legislation (.3).
6/14/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 1.2 246.00|Continued work on compilation of events throughout Cobell trial.
Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding notice/waiver
(.2); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.1); receive call from
6/14/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.7 164.50|beneficiary regarding notice/waiver (.2); update phone log regarding calls (.1);
review <CobellSettlement.com> website and claims administrator recorded
message regarding current status of beneficiary information (.1).
6/14/2010 |Chick, Shawn R. 29 407.00 E{g)\/lew docket and transcripts (1.6); update hearing dates and case calendar
Review government's brief in opposition (.5); outline reply brief in support of
6/14/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 4.5 $ 1,440.00|petition for certiorari (3.5); review Supreme Court rules regarding reply brief
content (.5).
6/14/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 [Conference call all hands re Hill issues.
6/14/2010 (Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Discussions Rempel, Pearl, Harper re NCAI, USET, tax extenders bill; SCt.
6/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 2.1 $ 1,942.50 |Review/revise drafts Il & IV, Ask Elouise letter # 11.
6/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re NCAI issues; AP inquiries re settlement status.
6/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Harper re above.
6/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Loving re Hill issues.
6/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Levitas re same.
6/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Dorris re above.
6/14/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Telcom. TB re settlement status.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/14/2010

Gingold, Dennis

54

4,995.00

Review/prepare time for fee petition per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts, re privilege/confidential issues, including protective orders/anti-
retaliation concerns. [See reduction of this time at end of time entries.]

6/14/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

0.7

224.00

Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.

6/14/2010

Harmala, Robert

0.8

420.00

Conference call to plan legislative strategy for settlement inclusion in tax
extenders legislation.

6/14/2010

Harper, Keith

14

700.00

Telephone conference on Bill progression and settlement implementation (1.1);
discussions about USET and NCAI (.1); call with Mr. Gingold to discuss
certiorari petition (.2).

6/14/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.4

290.00

Review of emails and email exchanges with Mr. Pearl and Mr. Gingold regarding
contact with Senate Indian Affairs Committee and decisions regarding
communication.

6/14/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.6

435.00

Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding follow-up on matters from
conference call, timing of contact with White House leadership, decisions
concerning further communication with NCAI and other Indian organizations
regarding Cobell position.

6/14/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.9

652.50

Conference call with Mr. Harmala, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl and Mr. Guilder concerning status of Senate legislation and
coordination between House and Senate on provisions in Senate bill (.7);
timetable scheduling of legislation and contact with NCAI and other regional
Indian groups concerning Barrasso amendment (.2).

6/14/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.9

652.50

Email exchanges with Mr. Rempel, Mr. Pearl and Mr. Gingold regarding
response to Senate Majority Leader's staff on Barrasso amendment (.4);
telephone conference with Senate aide regarding Cobell litigation (.5).

6/14/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

11.0

4,345.00

Participation in United South and Eastern Tribes (USET) Conference on behalf
of client. Efforts focused on garnering support from USET tribal members for the
Cobell Settlement Agreement (8.5). Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-
settlement team conference call (1); communications with post-settlement team
members on advocacy efforts (1.5).

6/14/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

7.5

2,400.00

Travel to Mobile, Al to attend the United Southern and Eastern Tribes (USET)
conference and discuss Cobell (6); prepare for and participate in Cobell team
conference call to discuss legislative strategy and related Supreme Court
petition issues (1.5).

6/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.2

90.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application.

6/14/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.7

315.00

CC w/ team re leg update and S. Ct. Reply (mot to defer).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

6/14/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 0.7 $ 315.00 [Disc w/ DG, AP re status.

6/14/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 2.2 $ 990.00 |Draft, edit Ask Elouise.

6/14/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 9.1 4,095.00 [Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/14/2010 |Schulof, Daniel G. 3.7 $ 1,091.50 Conduct legal research concerning judicial standards used in evaluating
reasonableness of attorney fee requests.

Conference call regarding legislation (.9); emails regarding cloture vote on
legislation by Senator Reid and status of legislation (1.2); telephone conference
. . with Debra Gruszecki at the Desert Sun regarding status of legislation (.4); email

6/14/2010 | Smith, David C. 31 $ 1,550.00 to Ms. Gruszecki regarding letter to Senator from Secretary Salazar and
Attorney General Holder (.2); emails with Mr. Gingold regarding attorneys' fee
issue (.3); review Blackfeet endorsement of settlement (.1).

6/15/2010 |Applegate, Alexis 24 $ 492.00|Continue work on review of document productions per Mr. Smith's request.
Conference with Mr. Pearl regarding Senate consideration of the Barrasso
amendment to the Cobell settlement (.4); e-mail and call to Tribe requesting

6/15/2010 |Austin, G. William 15 $ 892.50|further support for the Cobell settlement legislation by contacting Senators (.7);
review of exchanges regarding Tribe's support (.2); conference with Ms. Munson
and review of further e-mails from Mr. Pearl (.2).

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement (.2);
receive call from beneficiary regarding case status (.1); receive call from,

6/15/2010 |Burns, Joseph V. 0.9 $ 211.50|beneficiary regarding status (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver (.3); receive call from beneficiary regarding status (.1); update
phone log regarding calls (.1).

. Review docket and transcripts (1); email from Ms. Applegate regarding

6/15/2010 |Chick, Shawn R. 26 $ 481.00 depositions (.1); review deposition transcripts and update deposition chart (1.5).

6/15/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 4.2 1,344.00|Outline and draft reply brief in support of petition for certiorari.

6/15/2010 |Dorris, William E. 0.7 458.50|Emails and calls to further legislative efforts to pass settlement legislation.

6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Kirschman re settlement agreement.

6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Review/revise draft VI, Ask Elouise letter # 11.

6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Conference call Rempel, Ms. Cobell re same.

6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 4. $ 3.885.00 iCsl'glrjfezrence calls all hands re all issues, e.g., Barrasso amendment, NCAI

6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Discussions Rempel re same.

6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcom. Senate Hill staff re settlement issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
6/15/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.3 $ 1,202.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above; Navajo issues; House-Senate dichotomy.
6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re same.
6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Review/ revise draft VII, Ask Elouise letter # 11.
6/15/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Harper re Hill issues.
. . Conference calls to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
6/15/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 3.9 1,248.00 Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith.
6/15/2010 |Harmala, Robert 10 525.00 Conference call 10am with Cobell strategy team regarding potential Senate
amendment.
E-mail exchange with NCAI (.5); telephone conference on settlement
. implementation (.4); call with Mr. Gingold on Bill developments (.3); call with Mr.
6/15/2010 |Harper, Keith L7 850.00 Harmala on Bill developments (.3); call with Mr. Loving on Bill developments
(.2).”
Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold concerning the status of extension of
6/15/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 0.5 362.50|settlement agreement and issues to be considered in determining length of
extension.
Conference call with Mr. Smith, Ms. Cobell, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Pearl,
6/15/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 0.8 580.00({Mr. Harmala, Mr. Loving and Mr. Guilder regarding legislation timing, cert
petition, extension of deadline, cloture and anticipate House of Representatives.
Conference call with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Dorris, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Smith,
Mr. Pearl, Mr. Guilder, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala and Mr. Loving regarding
6/15/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 0.8 580.00(lobbying against Barrasso Amendment; reports on contacts with NCAI and from
tribes, preparation of materials for dissemination to Senators and procedures for
opposition.
Conference call with Mr. Smith, Mr. Guilder, Mr. Rempel, Ms. Cobell, Mr.
6/15/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 09 652 50 Gingold, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Lovmg and Mr. Harper _rega_trdmg exten_5|_on of tlme_,
status reports on tax extenders bill and Cobell legislation and decision regarding
extension of settlement agreement.
Conference call with Mr. Dorris, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel, Ms. Cobell, Mr.
6/15/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 1.0 725.00|Loving, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Guilder and Mr. Smith regarding Barrasso amendment

and efforts to defeat vote on Wednesday.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/15/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

14.6

5,767.00

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call. (4)
Participation in United South and Eastern Tribes (USET) Conference on behalf
of client. Efforts focused on garnering support from USET tribal members for the
Cobell Settlement Agreement (3). Advocacy efforts in the Senate against the
Barrasso amendment to the Cobell Settlement (S. Amdt. 4313), including phone
calls, emails, and grass roots efforts (7.6).

6/15/2010

Munson, Catherine F.

15

Conference with Mr. Pearl regarding vote on Barrasso amendment and
contacting clients to voice their opposition to the amendment (.3); conference
with Mr. Austin regarding same (.3); review e-mail from Mr. Austin to Chief (.1);
conference with tribal leader regarding Tribe's opposition to the amendment (.2);
review Mr. Pearl's e-mail and letter to Senators opposing amendment (.1); edit e-
mail to tribal leader and e-mail to him regarding Tribe voicing opposition to the
amendment (.5).

6/15/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

11.0

3,520.00

Attend the United Southern and Eastern Tribes (USET) conference and discuss
Cobell (1.5); prepare for and participate in Cobell team conference call to
discuss legislative strategy and related Supreme Court petition issues (4.5);
conference with various staff in the Senate (5).

6/15/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.2

540.00

Draft, edit Ask Elouise.

6/15/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.0

900.00

Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/15/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

3.2

1,440.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application and status (multiple).

6/15/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

3.5

1,575.00

CC w/ team re leg update. 3 calls.

6/15/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

55

*a || B| B |

2,475.00

Reach out to contacts in Congress re upcoming amendment. Prepare response
materials

6/15/2010

Schulof, Daniel G.

1.6

472.00

Conduct legal research concerning issues related to recovery of attorney fees
(1.6).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/15/2010

Smith, David C.

7.4

3,700.00

Suggested outline for requesting opposition to the Barrasso amendment (1);
email to Indian Affairs Aide regarding Barrasso amendment (.4); email to Mr.
Calkins regarding contact with Senator (.1); telephone conference with Mr.
Calkins (.2); emails with Ms. Applegate regarding Cobell beneficiary line (.1);
telephone conference with San Carlos Apache regarding opposition to Barrasso
amendment (.2); emails to Senator's office regarding reasons for opposing
Barrasso amendment (.7); telephone conference with Mr. Taylor regarding
discussing Barrasso amendment with Senator (.1); morning conference call
regarding status of legislation and extension of settlement agreement (1.1);
evening conference call regarding legislation (1); review and revise letter
regarding tribal opposition to Barrasso amendment (.2); review Senate speech
by Senator Barrasso (.3); discussions and emails regarding tribal opposition to
Barrasso amendment (.8); afternoon conference call regarding Barrasso
amendment (.9); review budget tracker newsletter regarding legislation (.2):
review email from Senate aide regarding status of legislation (.1).

6/16/2010

Applegate, Alexis

1.2

246.00

Conference with Ms. Chick regarding hearing list and continued compilation of
document productions per Mr. Smith's request.

6/16/2010

Austin, G. William

0.5

297.50

Follow-up with Mr. Pearl regarding contact with Passamaquoddy regarding
support for the Cobell settlement legislation (.3); review of articles and other e-
mails regarding Senate consideration of the Barrasso amendment (.2).

6/16/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

1.9

446.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: review correspondence to Mr. Harper from beneficiary
regarding settlement (.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding settlement
status (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding settlement and
return call (.2); review phone messages from beneficiary regarding settlement
and return call (.2); review phone message from beneficiary regarding
notice/waiver and return call (.6); review phone message from beneficiary
regarding notice/waiver and return call (.2); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding settlement and return call (.1); review phone message from
beneficiary regarding status and return call (.1); update phone log regarding
calls (.2).

6/16/2010

Chick, Shawn R.

0.8

148.00

Conference with Ms. Applegate regarding hearing list and update chart with
same.

6/16/2010

Dietz, Richard D.

55

1,760.00

Draft reply brief in support of petition for certiorari (2); research regarding same
(3.5).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative

6/16/2010 |Dorris, William E. 18 $ 1,179.00 Calls and emails regarding efforts to defeat Senator Barrasso's proposed
amendment.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.5 $ 1,387.50 |Conference calls all hands re above.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.2 $ 1,110.00 |Prepare memorandum for Ms. Cobell re Hill issues/options.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 [Telcoms. TB's re settlement status.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 |Telcoms. Dorris re above, e.g., Barrasso amendment.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.9 $ 832.50 |Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above, e.g., Sioux issues, House.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 [Telcoms. Smith re Senate issues; Barrasso amendment.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom ally re Arkansas senators.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference call Harmala, Rempel re above.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 |Conference call Harmala, Pearl re northwest tribal issues.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Holt re settlement status.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Guilder re above.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.1 $ 92.50 |Telcom. Kirschman re settlement agreement.

6/16/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 1.5 $ 1,387.50 |Discussions with Rempel re above.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcoms. Harper re above.

6/16/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.8 $ 740.00 |Conference all Pearl, Loving, Rempel re above, including tax extenders bill.
Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith (.6);
draft and revise correspondence to Hank Adams for support from Billy Frank

6/16/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 3.0 $ 960.00|(.5); call with Hank Adams regarding same (.3); draft and revise form letter and
correspondence to obtain support from Eastern Shoshone (.6); draft and revise
correspondence to Chairman of Warm Springs to gain support (.6); call Steve
Ungar to obtain support in Oregon (.4)
Consideration of tax extenders legislation, emails, telephone calls (1.1); lobbying
Senate offices on same (4.3); strategy meetings with Cobell post-settlement

6/16/2010 |Harmala, Robert 10.8 $ 5,670.00{team (.4); monitoring tax extenders legislation on the floor of Senate and
updates on same to legal team (1.5). Opposition to Senate amendment
coordination (3.5).

6/16/2010 |Harper, Keith 11 $ 550.00 Teleph_one conferen'ce on I_3arrasso Amendment (_.4); call to Mr. Gingold
regarding same (.4); call with Mr. Harmala regarding same (.3).
Email exchanges regarding Cobell amendment and Barrasso amendment (.6);

6/16/2010 |Levitas, Elliott H. 1.3 $ 942.50|reports relating to WHIP vote count and email exchanges with Charlie Henn and
Mr. Dorris regarding Isakson information (.7).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/16/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

14.3

5,648.50

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (2).
Participation in United South and Eastern Tribes (USET) Conference on behalf
of client. Efforts focused on garnering support from USET tribal members for the
Cobell Settlement Agreement (2.5). Advocacy efforts in the Senate against the
Barrasso amendment to the Cobell Settlement (S. Amdt. 4313), including phone
calls, emails, and grass roots efforts (7.8); communications with post-settlement
team members on advocacy efforts (2).

6/16/2010

Munson, Catherine F.

0.8

Conference with tribal leader regarding upcoming vote on Barrasso amendment
and letter to Senators (.4); conference with Mr. Pearl regarding letter from Tribe
and review Mr. Pearl's e-mail regarding Barrasso amendment (.4).

6/16/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

10.0

3,200.00

Attend the United Southern and Eastern Tribes (USET) conference and discuss
Cobell (1); participate in Cobell team conference call to discuss legislative
strategy and related Supreme Court petition issues (1.5); conference with
various staff in the Senate (7); conference with Mr. Gingold regarding northwest
tribal issues (.5).

6/16/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

15

675.00

Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/16/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.6

720.00

CC w/ team re leg update. 2 calls.

6/16/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.8

810.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application and status (multiple).

6/16/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

6.5

N || B| &+

2,925.00

Reach out to contacts in Congress re upcoming amendment. Prepare response
materials

6/16/2010

Schulof, Daniel G.

5.3

1,563.50

Conduct legal research concerning legal standards governing requests for
attorney's fees in "common fund" cases.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/16/2010

Smith, David C.

8.4

4,200.00

Review proceedings in Senate on Cobell legislation (3.2); emails and telephone
conferences with Senator's office regarding Cobell legislation and status of tax
extenders bill and Barrasso amendment (.4); email with Mr. Taylor regarding
status of legislation and assistance from Senator (.2); telephone conference with
Mr. Dorris regarding status of legislation (.2); travel to Senate offices for meeting
with Senator and staff regarding Cobell settlement and opposition to Barrasso
amendment (2.1); conference call with co-counsel regarding legislation (1.2);
email to aide in Senator's office regarding letter from Secretary Salazar and
Attorney General Holder opposing Barrasso amendment (.2); review
communication to Senate by American Association for Justice opposing
Barrasso amendment (.1); email to Mr. Loving regarding contact information for
Eastern Band of Cherokee at Senator's office (.1); email to Cobell team
regarding position of Senator on Barrasso amendment (.1); follow up call with co-
counsel regarding status of legislation (.6).

6/17/2010

Austin, G. William

1.0

595.00

Exchange e-mails with Ms. Munson regarding follow-up contact with Sakom
Phillips-Doyle of Tribe (.3); review of Mr. Pearl's e-mails regarding the Barrasso
amendment to the Cobell settlement (.3); review of articles and team members'
e-mails regarding same (.4).

6/17/2010

Burns, Joseph V.

0.5

117.50

Cobell Beneficiary Line: receive call from beneficiary regarding address change
(.1); receive call from beneficiary regarding legal referral (.2); update phone log
regarding calls (.1); file maintenance (.1).

6/17/2010

Chick, Shawn R.

0.6

111.00

Update hearing chart with additional dates and email to Ms. Applegate regarding
same.

6/17/2010

Dietz, Richard D.

3.2

1,024.00

Research regarding voluntary dismissal of a petition for writ of certiorari (1);
discuss same with Mr. Smith and Mr. Guilder (.2); draft motion to dismiss the
petition for writ of certiorari (2).

6/17/2010

Dorris, William E.

0.8

“

524.00

Emails regarding withdrawal of cert petition (.2); numerous calls with team
members regarding developments in Senate (.6).

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.9

832.50

Conference call all hands re all issues, including SCt. complications.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.7

647.50

2nd Conference call all hands re Hill issues.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.6

555.00

Discussions with Rempel re same.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.3

1,202.50

Telcoms. Ms. Cobell re above, including Barrasso amendment.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.2

185.00

Telcom. Smith re cert petition issues/complications.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.4

370.00

Telcom. Pearl re above.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.3

1,202.50

Telcoms. Loving re above.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Telcom. Dorris re Hill issues.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

462.50

Telcom. Levitas re same.

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.5

LR AR R A Rl R A R A R R o2

462.50

Telcoms. Harper re Hill issues.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/17/2010

Gingold, Dennis

5.4 $

4,995.00

Review/prepare post 12/7 time per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

6/17/2010

Guilder, Justin M.

2.2 $

704.00

Draft and revise correspondence to Mr. Dietz and discuss with Mr. Harper issues
related to Supreme Court.

6/17/2010

Harper, Keith

14 $

700.00

Call with Senate aide; telephone conference on developments in Senate and
death of Barrasso Amendments; telephone conference with White House; send
update e-mail regarding same.

6/17/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.5 $

362.50

Telephone conference with Mr. Gingold concerning cloture vote, Barrasso
amendment and vote count.

6/17/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.6 $

435.00

Follow up telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding potential vote on
Barrasso Amendment or non-action on Barrasso Amendment in terms of benefit
to plaintiffs position.

6/17/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.7 $

507.50

Conference call with Mr. Loving, Mr. Harmala, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Guilder and Mr.
Rempel relating to vote count, Barrasso amendment, cloture and follow up.

6/17/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.7 $

507.50

Conference call with Mr. Smith, Mr. Dorris, Ms. Cobell, Mr. Gingold, Mr. Rempel,
Mr. Harmala, Mr. Loving and Mr. Pearl regarding decisions concerning Senate
consideration of Barrasso and proposed final action of extenders legislation;
follow-up contacts with Washington and Oregon Senators strategy.

6/17/2010

Levitas, Elliott H.

0.7 $

507.50

Conference call with Ms. Cobell, Mr. Rempel, Mr. Smith, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Gingold,
Mr. Guilder, Mr. Loving and Mr. Harmala regarding status of Barrasso
amendment and preparation for participation at NCAIl meeting to defeat
Barrasso amendment.

6/17/2010

Loving, John-Claude F.

9.5 $

3,752.50

Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.5).
Advocacy efforts in the Senate against the Barrasso amendment to the Cobell
Settlement (S. Amdt. 4313), including phone calls, emails, and grass roots
efforts (4.4). Call with Administration to discuss Cobell settlement Congressional
strategy (1.1); communications with post-settlement team members on advocacy
efforts (2.5).

6/17/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

10.0 $

3,200.00

Attend the United Southern and Eastern Tribes (USET) conference and discuss
Cobell (1); prepare for and participate in Cobell team conference call to discuss
legislative strategy and related Supreme Court petition issues (1); conference
with various staff in the Senate (7.5); discuss legislative strategy with Mr.
Gingold (.5).

6/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

1.3 $

585.00

CC w/ team re leg update. Multiple.

6/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

2.5 $

1,125.00

Disc w/ DG re fee application and status (multiple).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

3.0

1,350.00

Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.

6/17/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

4.7

2,115.00

Reach out to contacts in Congress re upcoming amendment. Prepare response
materials

6/17/2010

Schulof, Daniel G.

4.8

1,416.00

Conduct legal research concerning legal principles governing fee petitions in
common fund context (3.3); prepare memorandum to Mr. Smith concerning
same (1.5).

6/17/2010

Smith, David C.

10.7

5,350.00

Review and revise long form notice sent by Ms. Kinsella (2.2); conference with
Mr. Rempel regarding same (.1); email to Mr. Rempel regarding long form notice
(.3); review revised position statement by NCAI on Barrasso amendment (.1);
view cloture vote in Senate on Cobell legislation and emails regarding same
(1.6); emails regarding pulling of Barrasso amendment (.2); conference call with
Mr. Gingold, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harmala and Mr. Dorris regarding status of
legislation (.7); conference with Mr. Gingold regarding status of petition for
certiorari (.2); conference with Mr. Dietz regarding Supreme Court rules for
withdrawing petition for certiorari (.2); emails and conference regarding
dismissing petition (.2); telephone conference with Justice regarding consent to
withdrawing petition (.1); telephone conference with SG's office regarding
consent to motion to withdraw and email regarding same (.2); telephone
conference conveying message from DOJ regarding petition for certiorari and
email regarding same (.2); emails regarding timing of denial of certiorari petition
(.1); review and revise motion to dismiss Petition for Certiorari (.3); emalil
regarding changes and review changes by Mr. Gingold (.1); emails/discussions
regarding status of Barrasso amendment and legislation (2.7); email to Senator's
office regarding legislation (.2); email to Senator's office regarding legislation
(.2); review letter of support from Seminole tribe (.1); conference call with co-
counsel regarding status of legislation (.7).

6/18/2010

Austin, G. William

0.2

119.00

Review of additional e-mails and articles regarding Barrasso amendment to
Cobell settlement legislation.

6/18/2010

Austin, G. William

0.2

119.00

Review of articles and e-mails regarding status of Cobell settlement legislation
(.1); review of trust report filed by government (.1).

6/18/2010

Dietz, Richard D.

0.5

160.00

E-mail correspondence regarding motion to dismiss petition for writ of certiorari.

6/18/2010

Dorris, William E.

0.9

589.50

Emails regarding and review of motion to dismiss petition for cert to the U.S.
Supreme Court (.6); telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding NCAI
meeting (.3).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
6/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 07 $ 647 50 tClrickn)r(;fserence call all hands re Hill issues, e.g., Barrasso amendment, NCAI,
6/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 |Conference calls Rempel, Ms. Cobell re same.
6/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Conference call Ms. Cobell, Rempel, Harper re same; cert petition.
6/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.6 $ 555.00 Telcoms. Harper re cert petition, Hauk, SG's position; NCAI; Barrasso
amendment.
6/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Smith re cert petition issues/complications.
6/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.3 $ 277.50 [Telcom. Dorris re above.
6/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 1.0 $ 925.00 [Discussions with Rempel re above.
Review/prepare post 12/7 time per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
6/18/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 7.9 $ 7,307.50 |names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]
Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.
. . Gingold, Mr. Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala, and Mr. Smith (.4);
6/18/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 0.9 $ 288.00 coordinate with Mr. Rempel the collection of signed opposition letters to be
posted to website (.2); assist in response to possible NCAI resolution (.3).
Draft letter from a Tribe in support of settlement (2.0); telephone conference on
. Barrasso Amendment developments regarding the Bill on the Hill (.5); draft e-
6/18/2010 |Harper, Keith 41 $ 2,050.00 mail to Elouise and conduct research on NCAI protocols and rules (1.4); arrange
payment of NCAI dues (.2).
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1.6).
Follow up on advocacy efforts in the Senate against the Barrasso amendment to
6/18/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 7.3 $ 2,883.50(the Cobell Settlement (S. Amdt. 4313), including phone calls, emails, and grass
roots efforts (4.2); communications with post-settlement team members on
advocacy efforts (1.5).
Prepare for and participate in the Cobell team conference call to discuss
. outcome of the USET conference, status of pending legislation, strategy for
6/18/2010 |Pearl, Michael Alexander 55 $ 1,760.00 . S ) . o
passing legislation (1); prepare materials for the NCAI conference (1.5); review
NCAI by-laws and code for the process of passing resolutions (3).
6/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.0 $ 450.00 |CC w/ team re leg update.
6/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 1.8 $ 810.00 |Disc w/ DG re fee application and status (multiple).
6/18/2010 [Rempel, Geoffrey 25 1,125.00 |Review of EC cost docs for application. Sort, organize, review for sufficiency.
6/18/2010 |Rempel, Geoffrey 58 $ 2.610.00 rF:]Z?g:aT:t to contacts in Congress re upcoming amendment. Prepare response
6/18/2010 |Roth, Katie 0.5 $ -|Review press articles and file management per Mr. Levitas' request.
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Post Settlement Fees

Date

Name

Hours

Amount

Narrative

6/18/2010

Schulof, Daniel G.

1.7

501.50

Finalize memorandum concerning fee recovery issues and deliver to Mr. Smith
for use in preparing fee petition.

6/18/2010

Smith, David C.

3.1

1,550.00

Emails regarding legislation with Mr. Loving and Mr. Harmala (.1); telephone
conference with Mr. Gingold regarding dismissal of certiorari petition (.2); revise
dismissal (.2); emails regarding dismissal (.3); telephone conference with Mr.
Hauck regarding petition for certiorari (.1); email with Mr. Harper regarding
conversation with Mr. Hauck (.1); review memo from Mr. Schulof on attorneys'
fees issue (.4); email to Mr. Burns regarding request from beneficiary (.2); review
beneficiary phone log and email to Ms. Keough at Garden City providing
updated beneficiary names and contact information (.4); conference call with co-
counsel regarding legislation and potential discussions regarding Cobell
legislation at NCAI (1); telephone conference with Mr. Dorris regarding status
(.2); discussions and emails regarding tribal opposition to Barrasso amendment
(.3); emails regarding NCAI meeting (.3).

6/19/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Telcom. Harper re NCAl issues.

6/19/2010

Gingold, Dennis

9.0

8,325.00

Review/prepare post 12/7 time per settlement agreement, e.g., redaction of
names, facts re privilege/confidentiality issues. [Note: see reduction at end of
time entries of this time/charges.]

6/19/2010

Harper, Keith

2.1

1,050.00

Complete draft of e-mail memorandum to Elouise on NCAI resolution
procedures and expected politics.

6/19/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

8.5

2,720.00

Prepare for and travel to Rapid City, S.D. for the NCAI conference (6); review
materials in preparation for the conference (2.5).

6/19/2010

Rempel, Geoffrey

0.3

135.00

CC w/ DG re status.

6/20/2010

Gingold, Dennis

5.8

5,365.00

Prepare memo for Pearl/Harmala re response to Barrasso amendment for NCAI
meeting in Rapid City.

6/20/2010

Gingold, Dennis

1.3

1,202.50

Email exchanges with Pearl, Harmala, Harper, Loving re issue analysis for NCAI
meeting; tax extenders bill.

6/20/2010

Gingold, Dennis

11

1,017.50

Telcoms. Pearl re same, post panel discussions; meeting with Echohawk, et al.

6/20/2010

Gingold, Dennis

0.3

277.50

Telcom. Harper re same.

6/20/2010

Harper, Keith

1.6

800.00

Prepare material for NCAI meeting (.4); review memorandum on what to expect
for Mr. Pearl (.2); calls with Mr. Gingold, Mr. Pearl and Ms. Cobell (.4); calls to
various tribal leaders to persuade them to support Cobell (.4); e-mail and calls to
Jackie Johnson (.2).

6/20/2010

Pearl, Michael Alexander

9.5

3,040.00

Attend NCAI conference in Rapid City, S.D., participate in a panel on trust
reform (2.5); conference with 1IM account holders, and others at conference (7).
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Post Settlement Fees

Date Name Hours Amount Narrative
. . Discussions with Mr. Pearl, Mr. Harper, Ms. Cobell and Mr. Levitas regarding

6/20/2010 | Smith, David C. 0.2 100.00 consideration of Cobell legislation at NCAI meeting (.2).

6/21/2010 |Austin, G. William 0.2 119.00 SRl:aF\)/Fl)ivr\f[ of articles and e-mails regarding Cobell settlement legislation and Tribe's
Email from Mr. Smith regarding filing of Motion to Dismiss Cert. Petition (.1);

. review local rules and preparation for filing of same (.9); travel to/from U.S.

6/21/2010 - |Chick, Shawn R. 2.2 407.00 Supreme Court and filing of motion (1); telephone call with Mr. Dietz and serve
same (.2).

6/21/2010 |Dietz, Richard D. 08 256.00 rF:]t(a)\t/ilsﬁ motion to dismiss petition for certiorari; coordinate filing and service of
Team telephone conference regarding developments and strategy at National

. - Congress of American Indians Convention and legislative update on tax

6/21/2010 |Dorris, William E. L7 1,113.50 extenders bill in Senate (1.2); telephone conference with Mr. Gingold regarding
NCAI developments (.3); emails from Mr. Pearl and Ms. Cobell on NCAI (.2).

6/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 12 $ 1,110.00 Conf_erence call Guilder, Harmala, M;. Cobell, Harper, Pearl, Smith, Loving,
Dorris, Rempel re above, e.g., NCAl issues.

6/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 [Review/revise motion re cert petition.

6/21/2010 |[Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcoms. Dorris re Barrasso amendment; Echohawk re Rapid City.

6/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.7 $ 647.50 [Telcoms. Pearl re NCAI issues.

6/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.4 $ 370.00 [Telcoms. TB re settlement status; gift deed implications; scope of class.

6/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.5 $ 462.50 |Telcom. Ms. Cobell re NCAI issues.

6/21/2010 |Gingold, Dennis 0.2 $ 185.00 |Telcom. Levitas re Hill issues.
Conference call to discuss legislative issues with Mr. Levitas, Mr. Rempel, Mr.

6/21/2010 |Guilder, Justin M. 16 512.00 Gingold, Mr. _Pearl, Mr. Loving, Mr. Harper, Mr. Harmala,. and Mr. _Smlth (1:2); .
draft and revise correspondence to people who are helping coordinate legislative
responsive to potential Barrasso amendment (.4).

6/21/2010 |Harmala, Robert 12 630.00 Legislative/legal team strate_gy conference on settlement legislation and impact
of unfavorable NCAI resolution.

6/21/2010 |Harmala, Robert 40 2.100.00 Travel to Rapid Clt)_/, Sguth Dakota to attend NCAI mid year meeting and prevent
unfavorable resolution in support of amendments to modify settlement.
E-mail exchanges, discussions, monitoring and telephone conferences with

6/21/2010 |Harper, Keith 2.6 1,300.00 |Elouise Cobell and Mr. Pearl at NCAI (1.6); telephone conference on Senate
action or lack thereof (.7); Agua Caliente support letter (.3).
Prepare for and participate in Cobell post-settlement team conference call (1).

6/21/2010 |Loving, John-Claude F. 7.2 2,844.00(Travel from Mobile, AL and USET conference (5.5). Advocacy efforts on the